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Court File No. CV-20-00639897-00CL 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

B E T W E E N : 

CANADIAN EQUIPMENT FINANCE & LEASING INC. 

Applicant 
- and - 

EVELEY INTERNATIONAL CORPORATION 

Respondent 

NOTICE OF MOTION 
(returnable November 13, 2020) 

msi Spergel inc. (“Spergel”), in its capacity as the Court-appointed receiver (in such 

capacity, the “Receiver”), without security, of all the assets, undertakings and properties 

(collectively, the “Property”) of Eveley International Corporation (the “Debtor”), will make a 

motion to a Judge of the Commercial List on Friday, November 13, 2020 at 10:30 a.m., or as 

soon after that time as the motion can be heard, by judicial videoconference due to the COVID-

19 emergency via the following Zoom coordinates: 

https://zoom.us/j/92006349872?pwd=bFBBc3lvOXhOWGtXYU44YllPWDk0QT09.  

PROPOSED METHOD OF HEARING:  The motion is to be heard orally.  

THE MOTION IS FOR Orders, including, amongst other things: 

(a) if necessary, abridging the time for service and filing of this notice of motion and 

the motion record or, in the alternative, dispensing with same; 
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(b) approving the First Report of the Interim Receiver (as defined below) dated May 

21, 2020 (the “IR Report”) and approving the actions of the Interim Receiver 

described therein; 

(c) approving the First Report of the Receiver dated November 3, 2020 (the “First 

Report”) and approving the actions of the Receiver described therein, including, 

without limitation, approving the Receiver’s Interim Statement of Receipts and 

Disbursements appended to the First Report; 

(d) approving the agreement of purchase and sale between the Receiver, as vendor, 

and 2771276 Ontario Inc. (the “Purchaser”), as purchaser, dated October 20, 

2020 (the “Sale Agreement”), and authorizing the Receiver to complete the 

transaction contemplated thereby (the “Transaction”); 

(e) vesting in the Purchaser all the Debtor’s right, title and interest in and to the 

Purchased Assets (as defined in the Sale Agreement), free and clear of any claims 

and encumbrances; 

(f) sealing the Confidential Appendices (as defined in the First Report) until closing 

of the Transaction or further Order of this Court; 

(g) authorizing and directing the Receiver to distribute certain funds to The Receiver 

General without further Order of this Court; 

(h) authorizing, but not obligating, the Receiver to bankrupt the Debtor; 

(i) approving the fees and disbursements of the Interim Receiver, the Receiver and 

their counsel, including an accrual for fees and disbursements to be incurred by 

the Receiver and its counsel to the completion of these proceedings;  

(j) effective upon the filing of a certificate by the Receiver certifying that all 

outstanding matters to be attended to in connection with the receivership of the 

Debtor have been completed to the satisfaction of the Receiver, discharging 

Spergel as the Receiver and releasing Spergel from any and all liability that 

6



3

Spergel has or may hereafter have by reason of, or in any way arising out of, the 

acts or omissions of Spergel while acting in its capacities as the Interim Receiver 

and the Receiver; and 

(k) such further and other relief as counsel may advise and this Court may permit. 

THE GROUNDS FOR THE MOTION ARE: 

(a) pursuant to an Order made April 23, 2020 (the “IR Order”), Spergel was 

appointed as the interim receiver (in such capacity, the “Interim Receiver”) of 

the Property; 

(b) pursuant to the IR Order, the Interim Receiver’s mandate was to expire on the 

earliest of: 

(i) the taking of possession of the Property by a receiver or a trustee in 

bankruptcy; 

(ii) May 25, 2020; and 

(iii) further Order of the Court; 

(c) pursuant to Endorsements made May 26, 2020, May 28, 2020 and June 4, 2020 

and an Order made June 25, 2020 (collectively, the “Receivership Order”), 

Spergel was appointed as the Receiver, and the discharge of the Interim Receiver 

was confirmed; 

(d) pursuant to the Receivership Order, the Receiver was authorized to market any or 

all the Property, including advertising and soliciting offers in respect of the 

Property and negotiating such terms and conditions of sale as the Receiver, in its 

discretion, deems appropriate; 

(e) the marketing and sale process culminated in the Sale Agreement for the 

Purchased Assets, which the Receiver has accepted subject to approval by this 

Court; 

7



4

(f) the Sale Agreement contemplates that the Receiver will complete the Transaction 

and that the Purchased Assets will be vested in the Purchaser; 

(g) a condition of the Sale Agreement is that this Court provide a sale approval and 

vesting order in favour of the Purchaser; 

(h) a further condition of the Sale Agreement is that the Court authorize the Receiver 

to assign the Debtor into bankruptcy; 

(i) the purchase price contemplated by the Sale Agreement represents the best offer 

for the Purchased Assets; 

(j) a sealing order is required because the Confidential Appendices contain certain 

commercially-sensitive information, the release of which could prejudice the 

Debtor’s stakeholders if the Transaction does not close; 

(k) the Debtor is indebted to The Receiver General for certain priority amounts, as 

more fully described in the First Report; 

(l) the Receivership Order also granted an Occupation Charge (as defined therein) to 

2565698 Ontario Inc., which ranks in priority to the Identified Security (as 

defined below), and the Receiver has made certain payments against the 

Occupation Charge in the ordinary course and intends to continue to do so, in full, 

following the closing of the Transaction and until the Receiver’s occupation 

ceases in accordance with the terms and conditions of the Occupation Agreement 

(as defined in the Receivership Order);  

(m) other than cash amounts to satisfy obligations in priority to the Identified 

Security, the balance of the Transaction’s purchase price is satisfied by the 

annulment of portions of the secured debt under the Identified Security, such that 

no cash amounts will otherwise be available for distribution to the Debtor’s 

subordinate creditors;   
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(n) the Debtor is indebted to and has provided security in favour parties that are to 

assign their secured debt to the Purchaser on Closing, and the Receiver has 

obtained independent legal opinions from Aird & Berlis LLP confirming the 

validity and enforceability of such security (the “Identified Security”); 

(o) the Interim Receiver and the Receiver have filed with the Court the IR Report and 

the First Report, respectively, which outline, amongst other things, the actions of 

the Interim Receiver and the Receiver since the commencement of these 

proceedings;  

(p) the Interim Receiver, the Receiver and their counsel, Aird & Berlis LLP, have 

accrued fees and expenses in their capacity as Interim Receiver, Receiver and 

counsel thereto, respectively, which fees and expenses require the approval of this 

Court pursuant to the IR Order and the Receivership Order; 

(q) the IR Order and the Receivership Order authorizes the Interim Receiver and the 

Receiver to pass their accounts from time to time, and to include any necessary 

solicitor fees and disbursements in the passing of the accounts; 

(r) the Receivership Order further provides that, notwithstanding the Interim 

Receiver’s discharge, the Receiver is authorized to bring one or more motions on 

the Interim Receiver’s behalf for the purposes of seeking the approval of: 

(i) the IR Report and the Interim Receiver’s activities therein; 

(ii) the fees and disbursements of the Interim Receiver and its counsel;  

(iii) the discharge of liability with respect to the Interim Receiver, save and 

except for any gross negligence of wilful misconduct by the Interim 

Receiver; and 

(iv) any ancillary relief in regards to (i), (ii) or (iii); 

(s) the other grounds set out in the IR Report and the First Report; 
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(t) sections 47 and 243 of the Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act, R.S.C. 1985, c. B-3, as 

amended; 

(u) section 101 of the Courts of Justice Act, R.S.O. 1990, c. C.43, as amended; 

(v) rules 1.04, 2.03, 3.02, 30, 37 and 41.06 of the Rules of Civil Procedure, R.R.O. 

1990, Reg. 194, as amended; and 

(w) such further and other grounds as counsel may advise and this Court may permit. 

2. THE FOLLOWING DOCUMENTARY EVIDENCE will be used at the hearing of the 

motion: 

(a) the IR Report, the First Report and their respective appendices, including, without 

limitation, the affidavits sworn in support of the fees and disbursements of the 

Interim Receiver, the Receiver and their counsel; and 

(b) such further and other material as counsel may submit and this Court may permit. 

Date: November 3, 2020 AIRD & BERLIS LLP 
Barristers and Solicitors 
Brookfield Place 
181 Bay Street, Suite 1800 
Toronto, ON  M5J 2T9 

Ian Aversa (LSO # 55449N) 
Tel: (416) 865-3082 
Fax: (416) 863-1515 
Email: iaversa@airdberlis.com

Jeremy Nemers (LSO # 66410Q) 
Tel: (416) 865-7724 
Fax: (416) 863-1515 
Email: jnemers@airdberlis.com

Lawyers for the Receiver

TO:  ATTACHED SERVICE LIST
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Court File No. CV-20-00639897-00CL 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

THE HONOURABLE MR. ) FRIDAY, THE 13TH DAY 
) 

JUSTICE CAVANAGH ) OF NOVEMBER, 2020 

B E T W E E N : 

CANADIAN EQUIPMENT FINANCE & LEASING INC. 

Applicant 
- and - 

EVELEY INTERNATIONAL CORPORATION 

Respondent 

APPROVAL AND VESTING ORDER 

THIS MOTION, made by msi Spergel inc., in its capacity as the Court-appointed receiver 

(in such capacity, the “Receiver”), without security, of all the assets, undertakings and properties 

of Eveley International Corporation (the “Debtor”), acquired for, or used in relation to a business 

carried on by the Debtor, for an order, inter alia, approving the sale transaction (the 

“Transaction”) contemplated by an agreement of purchase and sale between the Receiver, as 

vendor, and 2771276 Ontario Inc. (the “Purchaser”), as purchaser, dated October 20, 2020 (the 

“Sale Agreement”), a redacted copy of which is attached as Appendix “5” to the First Report of 

the Receiver dated November 3, 2020 (the “First Report”) and an unredacted copy of which is 

13



2 

attached as Confidential Appendix “4” to the First Report, and vesting in the Purchaser the 

Debtor’s right, title and interest in and to the property described as the “Purchased Assets” in the 

Sale Agreement (the “Purchased Assets”), was heard this day at 330 University Avenue, Toronto, 

Ontario. 

ON READING the Report and appendices thereto, and on hearing the submissions of 

counsel for the Receiver and such other counsel as were present, no one appearing for any other 

person on the service list, although properly served as appears from the affidavits of service, filed, 

1. THIS COURT ORDERS AND DECLARES that the Transaction is hereby approved, 

and the execution of the Sale Agreement by the Receiver is hereby authorized and approved, with 

such minor amendments as the Receiver may deem necessary.  The Receiver is hereby authorized 

and directed to take such additional steps and execute such additional documents as may be 

necessary or desirable for the completion of the Transaction and for the conveyance of the 

Purchased Assets to the Purchaser, or as it may direct. 

2. THIS COURT ORDERS AND DECLARES that upon the delivery of a Receiver’s 

certificate to the Purchaser substantially in the form attached as Schedule A hereto (the “Receiver's 

Certificate”), all of the Debtor’s right, title and interest in and to the Purchased Assets described 

in the Sale Agreement shall vest absolutely in the Purchaser, free and clear of and from any and 

all security interests (whether contractual, statutory, or otherwise), hypothecs, mortgages, trusts or 

deemed trusts (whether contractual, statutory, or otherwise), liens, executions, levies, charges, or 

other financial or monetary claims, whether or not they have attached or been perfected, registered 

or filed and whether secured, unsecured or otherwise (collectively, the “Claims”) including, 

without limiting the generality of the foregoing:  (i) any encumbrances or charges created by the 
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Order (appointing Interim Receiver) of The Honourable Mr. Justice McEwen made April 23, 2020; 

(ii) any encumbrances or charges created by the Order (appointing Receiver) of The Honourable 

Mr. Justice McEwen made June 25, 2020 and (iii) all charges, security interests or claims 

evidenced by registrations pursuant to the Personal Property Security Act (Ontario) or any other 

personal property registry system, and, for greater certainty, this Court orders that all of the Claims 

affecting or relating to the Purchased Assets are hereby expunged and discharged as against the 

Purchased Assets. 

3. THIS COURT ORDERS that for the purposes of determining the nature and priority of 

Claims, the net proceeds from the sale of the Purchased Assets shall stand in the place and stead 

of the Purchased Assets, and that from and after the delivery of the Receiver’s Certificate all 

Claims shall attach to the net proceeds from the sale of the Purchased Assets with the same priority 

as they had with respect to the Purchased Assets immediately prior to the sale, as if the Purchased 

Assets had not been sold and remained in the possession or control of the person having that 

possession or control immediately prior to the sale.   

4. THIS COURT ORDERS AND DIRECTS the Receiver to file with the Court a copy of 

the Receiver’s Certificate, forthwith after delivery thereof. 

5. THIS COURT ORDERS that, notwithstanding: 

(a) the pendency of these proceedings; 

(b) any applications for a bankruptcy order now or hereafter issued pursuant to the 

Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act (Canada) in respect of the Debtor and any 

bankruptcy order issued pursuant to any such applications; and 
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(c) any assignment in bankruptcy made in respect of the Debtor, 

the vesting of the Purchased Assets in the Purchaser, or as it may direct, pursuant to this Order 

shall be binding on any trustee in bankruptcy that may be appointed in respect of the Debtor and 

shall not be void or voidable by creditors of the Debtor, nor shall it constitute nor be deemed to be 

a fraudulent preference, assignment, fraudulent conveyance, transfer at undervalue or other 

reviewable transaction under the Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act (Canada) or any other applicable 

federal or provincial legislation, nor shall it constitute oppressive or unfairly prejudicial conduct 

pursuant to any applicable federal or provincial legislation.  

6. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver be and is hereby authorized to assign the 

Debtor into bankruptcy, and to appoint msi Spergel inc. as the Debtor’s bankruptcy trustee, which 

the Receiver shall do if the Purchaser so elects in accordance with section 10.2(a) of the Sale 

Agreement, subject to the Purchaser providing a further $10,000.00 to the Receiver to fund the 

bankruptcy proceedings of the Debtor. 

7. THIS COURT HEREBY REQUESTS the aid and recognition of any court, tribunal, 

regulatory or administrative body having jurisdiction in Canada or in the United States to give 

effect to this Order and to assist the Receiver and its agents in carrying out the terms of this Order.  

All courts, tribunals, regulatory and administrative bodies are hereby respectfully requested to 

make such orders and to provide such assistance to the Receiver, as an officer of this Court, as 

may be necessary or desirable to give effect to this Order or to assist the Receiver and its agents in 

carrying out the terms of this Order. 

____________________________________ 
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Schedule “A” – Form of Receiver’s Certificate 

Court File No. CV-20-00639897-00CL 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

B E T W E E N : 

CANADIAN EQUIPMENT FINANCE & LEASING INC. 

Applicant 
- and - 

EVELEY INTERNATIONAL CORPORATION 

Respondent 

RECEIVER’S CERTIFICATE 

RECITALS 

I.Pursuant to an Order of The Honourable Mr. Justice McEwen of the Ontario Superior Court of 

Justice (Commercial List) (the “Court”) dated June 25, 2020, msi Spergel inc. (“Spergel”) was 

appointed as receiver (in such capacity, the “Receiver”), without security, of all the assets, 

undertakings and properties of Eveley International Corporation (the “Debtor”), acquired for, or 

used in relation to a business carried on by the Debtor, including the proceeds thereof (the 

“Property”).   

II.Pursuant to an Order of the Court dated November 13, 2020, the Court approved the agreement of 

purchase and sale between the Receiver, as vendor, and 2771276 Ontario Inc. (the “Purchaser”), 

as purchaser, dated October 20, 2020 (the “Sale Agreement”), and provided for the vesting in the 

Purchaser of all the Debtor’s right, title and interest in and to the Purchased Assets (as defined in 
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the Sale Agreement), which vesting is to be effective with respect to the Purchased Assets upon 

the delivery by the Receiver to the Purchaser of a certificate confirming: (i) the payment by the 

Purchaser of the purchase price for the Purchased Assets; (ii) that the conditions to closing as set 

out in the Sale Agreement have been satisfied or waived by the Receiver and the Purchaser; and 

(iii) the Transaction has been completed to the satisfaction of the Receiver. 

III.Unless otherwise indicated herein, terms with initial capitals have the meanings set out in the Sale 

Agreement. 

THE RECEIVER CERTIFIES the following: 

1. The Purchaser has paid and the Receiver has received the purchase price for the Purchased 

Assets payable on the closing date pursuant to the Sale Agreement; 

2. The conditions to closing as set out in the Sale Agreement have been satisfied or waived 

by the Receiver and the Purchaser; 

3. The Transaction has been completed to the satisfaction of the Receiver; and 

4. This Certificate was delivered by the Receiver at _____________ [TIME] on 

_______________ [DATE]. 

MSI SPERGEL INC., solely in its capacity as the 
Court-appointed receiver of the Debtor, and not in 
its personal capacity or in any other capacity

Per: 

Name: 

Title:  
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Revised: January 21, 2014

Court File No. __________CV-20-00639897-00CL

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE

(COMMERCIAL LIST)

THE HONOURABLE MR. ) FRIDAY, THE 13TH DAY
)

JUSTICE CAVANAGH ) OF NOVEMBER, 2020

THE HONOURABLE ______

JUSTICE ________________

)
)
)

______DAY, THE____DAY 

OF _____________, 20__ 

DOCSTOR: 1201927\14DOCSTOR: 1201927\14

B E T W E E N :
PLAINTIFF

Plaintiff

CANADIAN EQUIPMENT FINANCE & LEASING INC.

Applicant
- and –-

DEFENDANT

Defendant

EVELEY INTERNATIONAL CORPORATION

Respondent
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DOCSTOR: 1201927\14DOCSTOR: 1201927\14

1 This model order assumes that the time for service does not need to be abridged.  The motion seeking a vesting 
order should be served on all persons having an economic interest in the Purchased Assets, unless circumstances 
warrant a different approach.  Counsel should consider attaching the affidavit of service to this Order.

APPROVAL AND VESTING ORDER

THIS MOTION, made by [RECEIVER'S NAME]msi Spergel inc., in its capacity as the

Court-appointed receiver (in such capacity, the "“Receiver"”), without security, of all the

undertaking, property and assets of [DEBTOR], undertakings and properties of Eveley

International Corporation (the "“Debtor"”), acquired for, or used in relation to a business carried

on by the Debtor, for an order, inter alia, approving the sale transaction (the "“Transaction"”)

contemplated by an agreement of purchase and sale (the "Sale Agreement") between the

Receiver, as vendor, and [NAME OF PURCHASER] 2771276 Ontario Inc. (the "“Purchaser"”),

as purchaser, dated [DATE] and appendedOctober 20, 2020 (the “Sale Agreement”), a redacted

copy of which is attached as Appendix “5” to the First Report of the Receiver dated

[DATE]November 3, 2020 (the "“First Report"”) and an unredacted copy of which is attached as

Confidential Appendix “4” to the First Report, and vesting in the Purchaser the Debtor’s right,

title and interest in and to the assetsproperty described as the “Purchased Assets” in the Sale

Agreement (the "“Purchased Assets"”), was heard this day at 330 University Avenue, Toronto,

Ontario.

ON READING the Report and appendices thereto, and on hearing the submissions of

counsel for the Receiver, [NAMES OF OTHER PARTIES APPEARING] and such other counsel 

as were present, no one appearing for any other person on the service list, although properly

served as appears from the affidavitaffidavits of [NAME] sworn [DATE]service, filed1: ,
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DOCSTOR: 1201927\14DOCSTOR: 1201927\14

2 In some cases, notably where this Order may be relied upon for proceedings in the United States, a finding that the 
Transaction is commercially reasonable and in the best interests of the Debtor and its stakeholders may be 
necessary.  Evidence should be filed to support such a finding, which finding may then be included in the Court's 
endorsement.

3 In some cases, the Debtor will be the vendor under the Sale Agreement, or otherwise actively involved in the 
Transaction.  In those cases, care should be taken to ensure that this Order authorizes either or both of the Debtor 
and the Receiver to execute and deliver documents, and take other steps.

4 To allow this Order to be free-standing (and not require reference to the Court record and/or the Sale Agreement), 
it may be preferable that the Purchased Assets be specifically described in a Schedule.

5 The "Claims" being vested out may, in some cases, include ownership claims, where ownership is disputed and the 
dispute is brought to the attention of the Court.  Such ownership claims would, in that case, still continue as against 
the net proceeds from the sale of the claimed asset.  Similarly, other rights, titles or interests could also be vested 
out, if the Court is advised what rights are being affected, and the appropriate persons are served.  It is the 
Subcommittee's view that a non-specific vesting out of "rights, titles and interests" is vague and therefore 
undesirable.

THIS COURT ORDERS AND DECLARES that the Transaction is hereby approved,21.

and the execution of the Sale Agreement by the Receiver3 is hereby authorized and approved,

with such minor amendments as the Receiver may deem necessary.  The Receiver is hereby

authorized and directed to take such additional steps and execute such additional documents as

may be necessary or desirable for the completion of the Transaction and for the conveyance of

the Purchased Assets to the Purchaser, or as it may direct.

THIS COURT ORDERS AND DECLARES that upon the delivery of a Receiver’s2.

certificate to the Purchaser substantially in the form attached as Schedule A hereto (the

"“Receiver's Certificate"”), all of the Debtor'’s right, title and interest in and to the Purchased

Assets described in the Sale Agreement [and listed on Schedule B hereto]4 shall vest absolutely

in the Purchaser, free and clear of and from any and all security interests (whether contractual,

statutory, or otherwise), hypothecs, mortgages, trusts or deemed trusts (whether contractual,

statutory, or otherwise), liens, executions, levies, charges, or other financial or monetary claims,

whether or not they have attached or been perfected, registered or filed and whether secured,

unsecured or otherwise (collectively, the "“Claims"5”) including, without limiting the generality

of the foregoing:  (i) any encumbrances or charges created by the Order (appointing Interim
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DOCSTOR: 1201927\14DOCSTOR: 1201927\14

6 Elect the language appropriate to the land registry system (Registry vs. Land Titles).
7 The Report should identify the disposition costs and any other costs which should be paid from the gross sale 

proceeds, to arrive at "net proceeds".  

Receiver) of theThe Honourable Mr. Justice [NAME] dated [DATE]McEwen made April 23,

2020; (ii) any encumbrances or charges created by the Order (appointing Receiver) of The

Honourable Mr. Justice McEwen made June 25, 2020 and (iii) all charges, security interests or

claims evidenced by registrations pursuant to the Personal Property Security Act (Ontario) or any

other personal property registry system; and (iii) those Claims listed on Schedule C hereto (all of

which are collectively referred to as the "Encumbrances", which term shall not include the

permitted encumbrances, easements and restrictive covenants listed on Schedule D), and, for

greater certainty, this Court orders that all of the EncumbrancesClaims affecting or relating to the

Purchased Assets are hereby expunged and discharged as against the Purchased Assets.

3. THIS COURT ORDERS that upon the registration in the Land Registry Office for the

[Registry Division of {LOCATION} of a Transfer/Deed of Land in the form prescribed by the

Land Registration Reform Act duly executed by the Receiver][Land Titles Division of

{LOCATION} of an Application for Vesting Order in the form prescribed by the Land Titles Act

and/or the Land Registration Reform Act]6, the Land Registrar is hereby directed to enter the

Purchaser as the owner of the subject real property identified in Schedule B hereto (the “Real

Property”) in fee simple, and is hereby directed to delete and expunge from title to the Real

Property all of the Claims listed in Schedule C hereto.

4. THIS COURT ORDERS that for the purposes of determining the nature and priority3.

of Claims, the net proceeds7 from the sale of the Purchased Assets shall stand in the place and

stead of the Purchased Assets, and that from and after the delivery of the Receiver'’s Certificate

all Claims and Encumbrances shall attach to the net proceeds from the sale of the Purchased

Assets with the same priority as they had with respect to the Purchased Assets immediately prior

24



 5 5

DOCSTOR: 1201927\14DOCSTOR: 1201927\14

8 This provision crystallizes the date as of which the Claims will be determined.  If a sale occurs early in the 
insolvency process, or potentially secured claimants may not have had the time or the ability to register or perfect 
proper claims prior to the sale, this provision may not be appropriate, and should be amended to remove this 
crystallization concept.

to the sale8, as if the Purchased Assets had not been sold and remained in the possession or

control of the person having that possession or control immediately prior to the sale.

5. THIS COURT ORDERS AND DIRECTS the Receiver to file with the Court a copy4.

of the Receiver'’s Certificate, forthwith after delivery thereof.

6. THIS COURT ORDERS that, pursuant to clause 7(3)(c) of the Canada Personal

Information Protection and Electronic Documents Act, the Receiver is authorized and permitted

to disclose and transfer to the Purchaser all human resources and payroll information in the

Company's records pertaining to the Debtor's past and current employees, including personal

information of those employees listed on Schedule "●" to the Sale Agreement.  The Purchaser

shall maintain and protect the privacy of such information and shall be entitled to use the

personal information provided to it in a manner which is in all material respects identical to the

prior use of such information by the Debtor.

7. THIS COURT ORDERS that, notwithstanding:5.

(a) (a) the pendency of these proceedings;

(b) (b) any applications for a bankruptcy order now or hereafter issued pursuant to the

Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act (Canada) in respect of the Debtor and any

bankruptcy order issued pursuant to any such applications; and

(c) (c) any assignment in bankruptcy made in respect of the Debtor;,

the vesting of the Purchased Assets in the Purchaser, or as it may direct, pursuant to this Order

shall be binding on any trustee in bankruptcy that may be appointed in respect of the Debtor and
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shall not be void or voidable by creditors of the Debtor, nor shall it constitute nor be deemed to

be a fraudulent preference, assignment, fraudulent conveyance, transfer at undervalue, or other

reviewable transaction under the Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act (Canada) or any other applicable

federal or provincial legislation, nor shall it constitute oppressive or unfairly prejudicial conduct

pursuant to any applicable federal or provincial legislation.

8. THIS COURT ORDERS AND DECLARES that the Transaction is exempt from the

application of the Bulk Sales Act (Ontario).

THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver be and is hereby authorized to assign the6.

Debtor into bankruptcy, and to appoint msi Spergel inc. as the Debtor’s bankruptcy trustee, which

the Receiver shall do if the Purchaser so elects in accordance with section 10.2(a) of the Sale

Agreement, subject to the Purchaser providing a further $10,000.00 to the Receiver to fund the

bankruptcy proceedings of the Debtor.

9. THIS COURT HEREBY REQUESTS the aid and recognition of any court, tribunal,7.

regulatory or administrative body having jurisdiction in Canada or in the United States to give

effect to this Order and to assist the Receiver and its agents in carrying out the terms of this

Order.  All courts, tribunals, regulatory and administrative bodies are hereby respectfully

requested to make such orders and to provide such assistance to the Receiver, as an officer of this

Court, as may be necessary or desirable to give effect to this Order or to assist the Receiver and

its agents in carrying out the terms of this Order.

____________________________________
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Schedule “A –”– Form of Receiver’s Certificate

Court File No. __________CV-20-00639897-00CL

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE

(COMMERCIAL LIST)

B E T W E E N :
PLAINTIFF

Plaintiff

CANADIAN EQUIPMENT FINANCE & LEASING INC.

Applicant
- and –-

DEFENDANT

Defendant

EVELEY INTERNATIONAL CORPORATION

Respondent

RECEIVER’S CERTIFICATE

RECITALS

A. Pursuant to an Order of theThe Honourable [NAME OFI.

JUDGE]Mr. Justice McEwen of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice (Commercial List) (the

"“Court"”) dated [DATE OF ORDER], [NAME OF RECEIVER]June 25, 2020, msi Spergel inc.

(“Spergel”) was appointed as the receiver (in such capacity, the "“Receiver"”), without security,

of all the undertaking, property and assets of [DEBTOR], undertakings and properties of Eveley
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International Corporation (the “Debtor”), acquired for, or used in relation to a business carried on

by the Debtor, including the proceeds thereof (the “Property”).

B. Pursuant to an Order of the Court dated [DATE]NovemberII.

13, 2020, the Court approved the agreement of purchase and sale made as of [DATE OF

AGREEMENT] (the "Sale Agreement") between the Receiver [Debtor], as vendor, and [NAME

OF PURCHASER]2771276 Ontario Inc. (the "“Purchaser"”), as purchaser, dated October 20,

2020 (the “Sale Agreement”), and provided for the vesting in the Purchaser of all the Debtor’s

right, title and interest in and to the Purchased Assets (as defined in the Sale Agreement), which

vesting is to be effective with respect to the Purchased Assets upon the delivery by the Receiver

to the Purchaser of a certificate confirming: (i) the payment by the Purchaser of the Purchase

Pricepurchase price for the Purchased Assets; (ii) that the conditions to Closingclosing as set out

in section ● of the Sale Agreement have been satisfied or waived by the Receiver and the

Purchaser; and (iii) the Transaction has been completed to the satisfaction of the Receiver.

C. Unless otherwise indicated herein, terms with initialIII.

capitals have the meanings set out in the Sale Agreement.

THE RECEIVER CERTIFIES the following:

1. The Purchaser has paid and the Receiver has received the Purchase Pricepurchase1.

price for the Purchased Assets payable on the Closing Dateclosing date pursuant to the Sale

Agreement;

2. The conditions to Closingclosing as set out in section ● of the Sale Agreement2.

have been satisfied or waived by the Receiver and the Purchaser; and 
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3. The Transaction has been completed to the satisfaction of the Receiver.; and3.

4. This Certificate was delivered by the Receiver at _____________ [TIME] on4.

_______________ [DATE].

[NAME OF RECEIVER],MSI SPERGEL
INC., solely in its capacity as Receiver of the
undertaking, property and
assetsCourt-appointed receiver of [DEBTOR]the
Debtor, and not in its personal capacity or in any
other capacity

Per:

Name: 

Title: 

29



1010

DOCSTOR: 1201927\14DOCSTOR: 1201927\14

30



Revised: January 21, 2014

DOCSTOR: 1201927\14

Schedule B – Purchased Assets

Schedule C – Claims to be deleted and expunged from title to Real Property
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Schedule D – Permitted Encumbrances, Easements and Restrictive Covenants
related to the Real Property 

(unaffected by the Vesting Order)
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Court File No. CV-20-00639897-00CL 

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

THE HONOURABLE MR. 

JUSTICE CAVANAGH 

)

)

) 

FRIDAY, THE 13TH DAY

OF NOVEMBER, 2020

B E T W E E N: 

CANADIAN EQUIPMENT FINANCE & LEASING INC. 

Applicant 

- and - 

EVELEY INTERNATIONAL CORPORATION 

Respondent 

DISCHARGE ORDER 

THIS MOTION, made by msi Spergel inc. (“Spergel”), in its capacity as the Court-

appointed receiver (in such capacity, the “Receiver”), without security, of all of the assets, 

undertakings and properties of Eveley International Corporation (the “Debtor”) acquired for, or 

used in relation to a business carried on by the Debtor, for an Order, inter alia: (i) approving the 

First Report of msi Spergel inc., in its capacity of the Court-appointed interim receiver of the 

Debtor (in such capacity, the “Interim Receiver”), dated May 21, 2020 (the “IR Report”) and 

the actions and activities of the Interim Receiver described therein; (ii) approving the First 

Report of the Receiver dated November 3, 2020 (the “First Report”) and the actions and 

activities of the Receiver described therein, including, without limitation, approving the 
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Receiver’s Interim Statement of Receipts and Disbursements appended to the First Report; (iii) 

sealing the confidential appendices to the First Report (the “Confidential Appendices”) until the 

closing of the transaction contemplated by the agreement of purchase and sale between the 

Receiver and 2771276 Ontario Inc. dated October 20, 2020 (the “Transaction”) or further Order 

of the Court; (iv) authorizing and directing the Receiver to distribute certain funds without 

further Order of this Court; (v) approving the fees and disbursements of the Interim Receiver and 

the Receiver and those of their counsel, Aird & Berlis LLP, including an accrual for fees and 

disbursements to be incurred to the completion of these proceedings; (vi) discharging Spergel as 

the Receiver, effective upon the filing of a certificate by the Receiver certifying that all matters 

to be attended to in connection with the receivership of the Debtor have been completed to the 

satisfaction of the Receiver, in substantially the form attached hereto as Schedule “A” (the 

“Discharge Certificate”); and (vii) releasing Spergel from any and all liability, as set out in 

paragraph 8 of this Order, was heard this via videoconference because of the Covid-19 

pandemic. 

ON READING the IR Report and appendices thereto, the First Report and the 

appendices thereto, including, without limitation, the affidavit of Mukul Manchanda sworn 

November 3, 2020 (“Spergel’s Fee Affidavit”) and the affidavit of Damian Lu sworn November 

2, 2020 (“A&B’s Fee Affidavit” and, together with Spergel’s Fee Affidavit, the “Fee 

Affidavits”), and on hearing the submissions of counsel for the Receiver, Canadian Equipment 

Finance & Leasing Inc., the Debtor, 2565698 Ontario Inc. and such other counsel as were 

present, no one appearing for any other person on the service list, although properly served, 
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1. THIS COURT ORDERS that the time for service and filing of a notice of motion and 

motion record is hereby abridged and validated so that this motion is properly returnable today 

and is hereby dispenses with further service thereof. 

2. THIS COURT ORDERS that the IR Report and the actions and activities of the Interim 

Receiver described therein be and are hereby approved. 

3. THIS COURT ORDERS that the First Report and the actions and activities of the 

Receiver described therein be and are hereby approved, including, without limitation, the 

Receiver’s Interim Statement of Receipts and Disbursements appended to the First Report. 

4. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Confidential Appendices be and are hereby sealed 

until closing of the Transaction or further Order of the Court. 

5. THIS COURT ORDERS that the fees and disbursements of the Interim Receiver and 

the Receiver and those of their counsel, Aird & Berlis LLP, as out in the Fee Affidavits, be and 

are hereby approved, including the Fee Accrual (as defined in the First Report). 

6. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver be and is hereby authorized and directed to 

make the distributions that are stated at paragraph 58 of the First Report, without further Order of 

this Court, in full and final satisfaction of all the obligations ranking in priority to the secured 

indebtedness owing by the Debtor to Canadian Equipment Finance & Leasing Inc. 

7. THIS COURT ORDERS that, upon the Receiver filing the Discharge Certificate, the 

Receiver shall be discharged as the Receiver of the Debtor, provided however that 

notwithstanding its discharge herein, Spergel: (a) shall remain the Receiver for the performance 

of such incidental duties as may be required to complete the administration of the receivership 
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herein (including, without limitation, to assign the Debtor into bankruptcy); and (b) shall 

continue to have the benefit of the provisions of all Orders made in these proceedings, including 

all approvals, protections and stays of proceedings in favour of the Receiver. 

8. THIS COURT ORDERS AND DECLARES that, upon the Receiver filing the 

Discharge Certificate, Spergel is hereby released and discharged from any and all liability that 

Spergel now has or may hereafter have by reason of, or in any way arising out of, the acts or 

omissions of Spergel while acting in its capacity as any of the Interim Receiver or the Receiver 

herein, save and except for any gross negligence or wilful misconduct on the part of the Interim 

Receiver or the Receiver, as applicable.  Without limiting the generality of the foregoing, 

Spergel is hereby forever released and discharged from any and all liability relating to matters 

that were raised, or which could have been raised, in the within interim receivership or 

receivership proceedings, save and except for any gross negligence or wilful misconduct on the 

part of the Interim Receiver or the Receiver, as applicable. 

9. THIS COURT HEREBY REQUESTS the aid and recognition of any court, tribunal, 

regulatory or administrative body having jurisdiction in Canada or in the United States to give 

effect to this Order and to assist the Interim Receiver, the Receiver and their agents in carrying 

out the terms of this Order. All courts, tribunals, regulatory and administrative bodies are hereby 

respectfully requested to make such orders and to provide such assistance to the Interim Receiver 

and the Receiver, as officers of this Court, as may be necessary or desirable to give effect to this 

Order or to assist the Interim Receiver, the Receiver and their agents in carrying out the terms of 

this Order. 
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10. THIS COURT ORDERS that, notwithstanding Rule 59.05 of the Rules of Civil 

Procedure (Ontario), this Order is effective from the date on which it is made, and is enforceable 

without any need for entry and filing; provided, however, that any party may nonetheless submit 

a formal order for original, signing, entry and filing, as the case may be. 

____________________________________ 
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SCHEDULE “A” 

Court File No. CV-20-00639897-00CL 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

COMMERCIAL LIST

CANADIAN EQUIPMENT FINANCE & LEASING INC. 

Applicant 

- and - 

EVELEY INTERNATIONAL CORPORATION 

Respondent 

DISCHARGE CERTIFICATE 

RECITALS 

(A) Pursuant to an Order of the Honourable Mr. Justice McEwen of the Ontario Superior 

Court of Justice (Commercial List) (the “Court”) made on April 23, 2020, as amended by His 

Honour’s endorsements made on May 26, 2020, May 28, 2020 and June 4, 2020, msi Spergel 

inc. (“Spergel”) was appointed on: (i) April 23, 2020 as interim receiver (in such capacity, the 

“Interim Receiver”), without security, of all of the assets, undertakings and properties of Eveley 

International Corporation (the “Debtor”) acquired for, or used in relation to a business carried on 

by the Debtor; and (ii) May 26, 2020 as receiver (in such capacity, the “Receiver”), without 

security, of all of the assets, undertakings and properties of the Debtor acquired for, or used in 

relation to a business carried on by the Debtor. 

(B) Pursuant to an Order of the Court made on June 25, 2020 (the “IR Discharge Order”), 

Spergel was discharged as the Interim Receiver, and, notwithstanding the Interim Receiver’s 

discharge, the Receiver was granted authority to bring one or more motions on the Interim 
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Receiver’s behalf for the purposes of seeking the approval of, amongst other things, the 

discharge of liability with respect to the Interim Receiver, save and except for any gross 

negligence of wilful misconduct by the Interim Receiver, and any corresponding ancillary relief.  

(C) Pursuant to an Order of the Court made on November 13, 2020 (the “Discharge Order”), 

Spergel was discharged as the Receiver to be effective upon the filing by the Receiver with the 

Court of a certificate confirming that all matters to be attended to in connection with the 

receivership of the Debtor have been completed to the satisfaction of the Receiver, provided, 

however, that notwithstanding its discharge, Spergel: (a) will remain the Receiver for the 

performance of such incidental duties as may be required to complete the administration of these 

receivership proceedings (including, without limitation, to assign the Debtor into bankruptcy); 

and (b) will continue to have the benefit of the provisions of all Orders made in these 

proceedings, including all approvals, protections and stays of proceedings in favour of the 

Receiver. 

(D) Unless otherwise indicated herein, terms with initial capitals have the meanings set out in 

the Discharge Order. 

THE RECEIVER CERTIFIES the following: 

1. all matters to be attended to in connection with the receivership of the Debtor have been 

completed to the satisfaction of Receiver, other than the performance of such incidental duties as 

may be required to complete the administration of these receivership proceedings (including, 

without limitation, to assign the Debtor into bankruptcy); and 

2. this Certificate was filed by the Receiver with the Court on the _____ day of 

_______________, 2020. 
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MSI SPERGEL INC., solely in its capacity as 
the Court-appointed receiver of the Debtor, and 
not in its personal capacity

Per:  

Name: 

Title:  
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ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE          

COMMERCIAL LIST 

Proceedings commenced at Toronto 

DISCHARGE ORDER 
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Barristers and Solicitors 
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Ian Aversa (LSO # 55449N) 
Tel: (416) 865-3082 
Fax: (416) 863-1515 
Email:  iaversa@airdberlis.com

Jeremy Nemers (LSO # 66410Q) 
Tel: (416) 865-7724 
Fax: (416) 863-1515 
Email:  jnemers@airdberlis.com

Lawyers for the Receiver

40229693.4 

45

mailto:iaversa@airdberlis.com
mailto:jnemers@airdberlis.com


TAB E 

46



Revised: May 11, 2010

Court File No.      CV-20-00639897-00CL

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE

(COMMERCIAL LIST   )

THE HONOURABLE      MR.

JUSTICE      CAVANAGH

)

)

)

WEEKDAYFRIDAY, THE #13TH

DAY

OF MONTH, 20YR NOVEMBER, 2020

B E T W E E N:

PLAINTIFF

Plaintiff

CANADIAN EQUIPMENT FINANCE & LEASING INC.

Applicant

- and –-

DEFENDANT

Defendant

EVELEY INTERNATIONAL CORPORATION

Respondent

DISCHARGE ORDER

THIS MOTION, made by [RECEIVER'S NAME]msi Spergel inc. (“Spergel”), in its

capacity as the Court-appointed receiver (in such capacity, the "“Receiver"”), without security, of

all of the undertaking, property and assets of [DEBTOR], undertakings and properties of Eveley

DOCSTOR: 1201925\8
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International Corporation (the "“Debtor"”),  acquired for, or used in relation to a business carried

on by the Debtor, for an orderOrder, inter alia:

1. (i) approving the activities of the Receiver as set out in the report of the Receiver dated

[DATE] (the "Report"); 

2. approving the fees and disbursements of the Receiver and its counsel; 

3. approving the distribution of the remaining proceeds available in the estate of the Debtor;

[and]

4. discharging [RECEIVER'S NAME] as Receiver of the undertaking, property and assets of

the Debtor[; and

5. First Report of msi Spergel inc., in its capacity of the Court-appointed interim receiver of

the Debtor (in such capacity, the “Interim Receiver”), dated May 21, 2020 (the “IR Report”) and

the actions and activities of the Interim Receiver described therein; (ii) approving the First

Report of the Receiver dated November 3, 2020 (the “First Report”) and the actions and

activities of the Receiver described therein, including, without limitation, approving the

Receiver’s Interim Statement of Receipts and Disbursements appended to the First Report; (iii)

sealing the confidential appendices to the First Report (the “Confidential Appendices”) until the

closing of the transaction contemplated by the agreement of purchase and sale between the

Receiver and 2771276 Ontario Inc. dated October 20, 2020 (the “Transaction”) or further Order

of the Court; (iv) authorizing and directing the Receiver to distribute certain funds without

further Order of this Court; (v) approving the fees and disbursements of the Interim Receiver and

the Receiver and those of their counsel, Aird & Berlis LLP, including an accrual for fees and

disbursements to be incurred to the completion of these proceedings; (vi) discharging Spergel as

the Receiver, effective upon the filing of a certificate by the Receiver certifying that all matters to

be attended to in connection with the receivership of the Debtor have been completed to the

satisfaction of the Receiver, in substantially the form attached hereto as Schedule “A” (the

“Discharge Certificate”); and (vii) releasing [RECEIVER'S NAME]Spergel from any and all
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1 If this relief is being sought, stakeholders should be specifically advised, and given ample notice.  See also Note 4, 
below. 

2 This model order assumes that the time for service does not need to be abridged.  

liability, as set out in paragraph 57 of this Order]1, was heard this day at 330 University Avenue,

Toronto, Ontario. via videoconference because of the Covid-19 pandemic.

ON READING the IR Report and appendices thereto, the affidavits of the Receiver and

its counsel as to fees (the "First Report and the appendices thereto, including, without limitation,

the affidavit of Mukul Manchanda sworn November 3, 2020 (“Spergel’s Fee Affidavit”) and the

affidavit of Damian Lu sworn November 2, 2020 (“A&B’s Fee Affidavit” and, together with

Spergel’s Fee Affidavit, the “Fee Affidavits"”), and on hearing the submissions of counsel for the

Receiver, Canadian Equipment Finance & Leasing Inc., the Debtor, 2565698 Ontario Inc. and

such other counsel as were present, no one else appearing for any other person on the service list,

although properly served as evidenced by the Affidavit of [NAME] sworn [DATE], filed2;  

THIS COURT ORDERS that the time for service and filing of a notice of motion and1.

motion record is hereby abridged and validated so that this motion is properly returnable today

and is hereby dispenses with further service thereof.

THIS COURT ORDERS that the IR Report and the actions and activities of the Interim2.

Receiver, as set out in the Report, described therein be and are hereby approved.

THIS COURT ORDERS that the First Report and the actions and activities of the3.

Receiver described therein be and are hereby approved, including, without limitation, the

Receiver’s Interim Statement of Receipts and Disbursements appended to the First Report.

THIS COURT ORDERS that the Confidential Appendices be and are hereby sealed4.

until closing of the Transaction or further Order of the Court.
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3 This model order assumes that the material filed supports a distribution to a specific secured creditor or other 
party. 

2. THIS COURT ORDERS that the fees and disbursements of the Interim Receiver and5.

itsthe Receiver and those of their counsel, Aird & Berlis LLP, as set out in the Report and the Fee

Affidavits, be and are hereby approved, including the Fee Accrual (as defined in the First

Report).

3. THIS COURT ORDERS that, after payment of the fees and disbursements herein

approved, the Receiver shall pay the monies remaining in its hands to [NAME OF PARTY]3. 

THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver be and is hereby authorized and directed to6.

make the distributions that are stated at paragraph 58 of the First Report, without further Order of

this Court, in full and final satisfaction of all the obligations ranking in priority to the secured

indebtedness owing by the Debtor to Canadian Equipment Finance & Leasing Inc.

4. THIS COURT ORDERS that upon payment of the amounts set out in paragraph 37.

hereof [and, upon the Receiver filing a certificate certifying that it has completed the other

activities described in the Report]the Discharge Certificate, the Receiver shall be discharged as

the Receiver of the undertaking, property and assets of the Debtor, provided however that

notwithstanding its discharge herein , Spergel: (a) the Receiver shall remain the Receiver for the

performance of such incidental duties as may be required to complete the administration of the

receivership herein, (including, without limitation, to assign the Debtor into bankruptcy); and (b)

the Receiver shall continue to have the benefit of the provisions of all Orders made in this

proceedingthese proceedings, including all approvals, protections and stays of proceedings in

favour of [RECEIVER'S NAME] in its capacity asfavour of the Receiver.
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4 The model order subcommittee was divided as to whether a general release might be appropriate.  On the one 
hand, the Receiver has presumably reported its activities to the Court, and presumably the reported activities have 
been approved in prior Orders.  Moreover, the Order that appointed the Receiver likely has protections in favour 
of the Receiver.  These factors tend to indicate that a general release of the Receiver is not necessary.  On the other 
hand, the Receiver has acted only in a representative capacity, as the Court's officer, so the Court may find that it is 
appropriate to insulate the Receiver from all liability, by way of a general release.  Some members of the 
subcommittee felt that, absent a general release, Receivers might hold back funds and/or wish to conduct a claims 
bar process, which would unnecessarily add time and cost to the receivership.  The general release language has 
been added to this form of model order as an option only, to be considered by the presiding Judge in each specific 
case.  See also Note 1, above.

5. [THIS COURT ORDERS AND DECLARES that [RECEIVER'S NAME], upon8.

the Receiver filing the Discharge Certificate, Spergel is hereby released and discharged from any

and all liability that [RECEIVER'S NAME]Spergel now has or may hereafter have by reason

of, or in any way arising out of, the acts or omissions of [RECEIVER'S NAME]Spergel while

acting in its capacity as any of the Interim Receiver or the Receiver herein, save and except for

any gross negligence or wilful misconduct on the Receiver's part of the Interim Receiver or the

Receiver, as applicable.  Without limiting the generality of the foregoing, [RECEIVER'S

NAME]Spergel is hereby forever released and discharged from any and all liability relating to

matters that were raised, or which could have been raised, in the within interim receivership or

receivership proceedings, save and except for any gross negligence or wilful misconduct on the

Receiver's part of the Interim Receiver or the Receiver, as applicable.]4

_______________________________________

25655650.1

THIS COURT HEREBY REQUESTS the aid and recognition of any court, tribunal,9.

regulatory or administrative body having jurisdiction in Canada or in the United States to give

effect to this Order and to assist the Interim Receiver, the Receiver and their agents in carrying

out the terms of this Order. All courts, tribunals, regulatory and administrative bodies are hereby
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respectfully requested to make such orders and to provide such assistance to the Interim Receiver

and the Receiver, as officers of this Court, as may be necessary or desirable to give effect to this

Order or to assist the Interim Receiver, the Receiver and their agents in carrying out the terms of

this Order.

THIS COURT ORDERS that, notwithstanding Rule 59.05 of the Rules of Civil10.

Procedure (Ontario), this Order is effective from the date on which it is made, and is enforceable

without any need for entry and filing; provided, however, that any party may nonetheless submit

a formal order for original, signing, entry and filing, as the case may be.

____________________________________
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SCHEDULE “A”

Court File No. CV-20-00639897-00CL

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE

COMMERCIAL LIST

CANADIAN EQUIPMENT FINANCE & LEASING INC.

Applicant

- and -

EVELEY INTERNATIONAL CORPORATION

Respondent

DISCHARGE CERTIFICATE

RECITALS

(A) Pursuant to an Order of the Honourable Mr. Justice McEwen of the Ontario Superior

Court of Justice (Commercial List) (the “Court”) made on April 23, 2020, as amended by His

Honour’s endorsements made on May 26, 2020, May 28, 2020 and June 4, 2020, msi Spergel inc.

(“Spergel”) was appointed on: (i) April 23, 2020 as interim receiver (in such capacity, the

“Interim Receiver”), without security, of all of the assets, undertakings and properties of Eveley

International Corporation (the “Debtor”) acquired for, or used in relation to a business carried on

by the Debtor; and (ii) May 26, 2020 as receiver (in such capacity, the “Receiver”), without

security, of all of the assets, undertakings and properties of the Debtor acquired for, or used in

relation to a business carried on by the Debtor.

(B) Pursuant to an Order of the Court made on June 25, 2020 (the “IR Discharge Order”),

Spergel was discharged as the Interim Receiver, and, notwithstanding the Interim Receiver’s
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discharge, the Receiver was granted authority to bring one or more motions on the Interim

Receiver’s behalf for the purposes of seeking the approval of, amongst other things, the discharge

of liability with respect to the Interim Receiver, save and except for any gross negligence of

wilful misconduct by the Interim Receiver, and any corresponding ancillary relief. 

(C) Pursuant to an Order of the Court made on November 13, 2020 (the “Discharge Order”),

Spergel was discharged as the Receiver to be effective upon the filing by the Receiver with the

Court of a certificate confirming that all matters to be attended to in connection with the

receivership of the Debtor have been completed to the satisfaction of the Receiver, provided,

however, that notwithstanding its discharge, Spergel: (a) will remain the Receiver for the

performance of such incidental duties as may be required to complete the administration of these

receivership proceedings (including, without limitation, to assign the Debtor into bankruptcy);

and (b) will continue to have the benefit of the provisions of all Orders made in these

proceedings, including all approvals, protections and stays of proceedings in favour of the

Receiver.

(D) Unless otherwise indicated herein, terms with initial capitals have the meanings set out in

the Discharge Order.

THE RECEIVER CERTIFIES the following:

all matters to be attended to in connection with the receivership of the Debtor have been1.

completed to the satisfaction of Receiver, other than the performance of such incidental duties as

may be required to complete the administration of these receivership proceedings (including,

without limitation, to assign the Debtor into bankruptcy); and
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this Certificate was filed by the Receiver with the Court on the _____ day of2.

_______________, 2020.
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MSI SPERGEL INC., solely in its capacity as
the Court-appointed receiver of the Debtor, and
not in its personal capacity

Per:

Name:

Title:
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Court File No. CV-20-00639897-00CL 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

THE HONOURABLE MR. 

JUSTICE MCEWEN 

)

)

) 

THURSDAY, THE 25TH 

DAY OF JUNE, 2020

 
B E T W E E N: 

 

CANADIAN EQUIPMENT FINANCE & LEASING INC. 

Applicant 

- and - 
 

EVELEY INTERNATIONAL CORPORATION 

   Respondent 

APPLICATION UNDER subsection 47(1) of the Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act  

ORDER 
(appointing Receiver) 

THIS MOTION made by the Applicant for an Order pursuant to subsection 243(1) of the 

Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act, R.S.C. 1985, c. B-3, as amended (the "BIA") and section 101 of 

the Courts of Justice Act, R.S.O. 1990, c. C.43, as amended (the "CJA") appointing msi Spergel 

inc. as receiver (in such capacity, the "Receiver"), without security, of all of the assets, 

undertakings and properties of Eveley International Corporation (the "Debtor") acquired for, or 

used in relation to a business carried on by the Debtor, was heard this day in writing. 

ON READING the first report of msi Spergel inc. in its capacity as the court-appointed 

interim receiver of the Debtor (in such capacity, the “Interim Receiver”) dated May 21, 2020 

(the “First Report”) and on being advised of the consent of the Applicant (“CEFL”) and 

Canadian Western Bank (“CWB”), the Debtor, 2565698 Ontario Inc. (“256”) and the Interim 
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Receiver and that the Debtor does not oppose this motion, no one appearing for any other party 

on the service list although duly served as appears from the affidavit of service of Brendan 

Bissell sworn May 25, 2020 and on reading the consent of  msi Spergel inc. to act as the 

Receiver, 

SERVICE 

1. THIS COURT ORDERS that the time for service of the Notice of Motion and the Motion 

Record is hereby abridged and validated so that this motion is properly returnable today and 

hereby dispenses with further service thereof. 

APPOINTMENT 

2. THIS COURT ORDERS that pursuant to subsection 243(1) of the BIA and section 101 

of the CJA, msi Spergel inc. is hereby appointed Receiver as of June 24, 2020 nunc pro tunc, 

without security, of all of the assets, undertakings and properties of the Debtor acquired for, or 

used in relation to a business carried on by the Debtor, including all proceeds thereof (the 

"Property”). 

RECEIVER’S POWERS 

3. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver is hereby empowered and authorized, but not 

obligated, to act at once in respect of the Property and, without in any way limiting the generality 

of the foregoing, the Receiver is hereby expressly empowered and authorized to do any of the 

following where the Receiver considers it necessary or desirable:   

(a) to take possession of and exercise control over the Property and any and 

all proceeds, receipts and disbursements arising out of or from the 

Property and to occupy the premises municipally known as 665 Arvin 

Avenue in Stoney Creek, Ontario (the “Arvin Premises”) subject to the 

terms of an occupation agreement between the Receiver and 256 as filed 

with the Court (the “Occupation Agreement”); 

(b) to receive, preserve, and protect the Property, or any part or parts thereof, 

including, but not limited to, the changing of locks and security codes, 
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the relocating of Property to safeguard it, the engaging of independent 

security personnel, the taking of physical inventories and the placement 

of such insurance coverage as may be necessary or desirable; 

(c) to use best efforts to, on the Debtor’s behalf, package and ship any of the 

Debtor’s completed customer orders, for which the Receiver shall incur 

no liability or obligation save and except for any gross negligence or 

willful misconduct on its part; 

(d) to engage consultants, appraisers, agents, experts, auditors, accountants, 

managers, counsel and such other persons from time to time and on 

whatever basis, including on a temporary basis, to assist with the exercise 

of the Receiver's powers and duties, including, without limitation, those 

conferred by this Order; 

(e) to receive and collect all monies and accounts now owed or hereafter 

owing to the Debtor and to exercise all remedies of the Debtor in 

collecting such monies, including, without limitation, to enforce any 

security held by the Debtor; 

(f) to settle, extend or compromise any indebtedness owing to the Debtor; 

(g) to execute, assign, issue and endorse documents of whatever nature in 

respect of any of the Property, whether in the Receiver's name or in the 

name and on behalf of the Debtor, for any purpose pursuant to this Order; 

(h) to initiate, prosecute and continue the prosecution of any and all 

proceedings and to defend all proceedings now pending or hereafter 

instituted with respect to the Debtor, the Property or the Receiver, and to 

settle or compromise any such proceedings. The authority hereby 

conveyed shall extend to such appeals or applications for judicial review 

in respect of any order or judgment pronounced in any such proceeding; 
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(i) to market any or all of the Property, including advertising and soliciting 

offers including en bloc offers and liquidation proposals in respect of the 

Property or any part or parts thereof and negotiating such terms and 

conditions of sale or liquidation as the Receiver in its discretion may deem 

appropriate, provided that such marketing shall include a deadline for third 

party purchasers to submit offers on or before July 31, 2020, or such other 

date as may be agreed by each of the Receiver, the Applicant and 2565698 

Ontario Inc. or as may be determined by further Court Order; 

(j) to sell, convey, transfer, lease or assign the Property or any part or parts 

thereof out of the ordinary course of business, 

(i) without the approval of this Court in respect of any transaction not 

exceeding $50,000, provided that the aggregate consideration for 

all such transactions does not exceed $200,000; and 

(ii) with the approval of this Court in respect of any transaction in 

which the purchase price or the aggregate purchase price exceeds 

the applicable amount set out in the preceding clause, 

and in each such case notice under subsection 63(4) of the Ontario 

Personal Property Security Act, shall not be required; 

(k) to apply for any vesting order or other orders necessary to convey the 

Property or any part or parts thereof to a purchaser or purchasers thereof, 

free and clear of any liens or encumbrances affecting such Property;    

(l) to report to, meet with and discuss with such affected Persons (as defined 

below) as the Receiver deems appropriate, including CEFL, CWB and 

256 on all matters relating to the Property and the receivership, and to 

share information, subject to such terms as to confidentiality as the 

Receiver deems advisable; and 
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(m) to register a copy of this Order and any other Orders in respect of the 

Property against title to any of the Property; 

(n) to apply for any permits, licences, approvals or permissions as may be 

required by any governmental authority and any renewals thereof for and 

on behalf of and, if thought desirable by the Receiver, in the name of the 

Debtor; 

(o) to enter into agreements with any trustee in bankruptcy appointed in 

respect of the Debtor, including, without limiting the generality of the 

foregoing, the ability to enter into occupation agreements for any property 

owned or leased by the Debtor;  

(p) to exercise any shareholder, partnership, joint venture or other rights 

which the Debtor may have; and 

(q) to take any steps reasonably incidental to the exercise of these powers or 

the performance of any statutory obligations, 

and in each case where the Receiver takes any such actions or steps, it shall be exclusively 

authorized and empowered to do so, to the exclusion of all other Persons (as defined below), 

including the Debtor, and without interference from any other Person. 

DUTY TO PROVIDE ACCESS AND CO-OPERATION TO THE RECEIVER 

4. THIS COURT ORDERS that (i) the Debtor, (ii) all of its current and former directors, 

officers, employees, agents, accountants, legal counsel and shareholders, and all other persons 

acting on its instructions or behalf, and (iii) all other individuals, firms, corporations, 

governmental bodies or agencies, or other entities having notice of this Order (all of the 

foregoing, collectively, being "Persons" and each being a "Person") shall forthwith advise the 

Receiver of the existence of any Property in such Person's possession or control, shall grant 

immediate and continued access to the Property to the Receiver, and shall deliver all such 

Property to the Receiver upon the Receiver's request. 
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5. THIS COURT ORDERS that all Persons shall forthwith advise the Receiver of the 

existence of any books, documents, securities, contracts, orders, corporate and accounting 

records, and any other papers, records and information of any kind related to the business or 

affairs of the Debtor, and any computer programs, computer tapes, computer disks, or other data 

storage media containing any such information (the foregoing, collectively, the "Records") in 

that Person's possession or control, and shall provide to the Receiver or permit the Receiver to 

make, retain and take away copies thereof and grant to the Receiver unfettered access to and use 

of accounting, computer, software and physical facilities relating thereto, provided however that 

nothing in this paragraph 5 or in paragraph 6 of this Order shall require the delivery of Records, 

or the granting of access to Records, which may not be disclosed or provided to the Receiver due 

to the privilege attaching to solicitor-client communication or due to statutory provisions 

prohibiting such disclosure. 

6. THIS COURT ORDERS that if any Records are stored or otherwise contained on a 

computer or other electronic system of information storage, whether by independent service 

provider or otherwise, all Persons in possession or control of such Records shall forthwith give 

unfettered access to the Receiver for the purpose of allowing the Receiver to recover and fully 

copy all of the information contained therein whether by way of printing the information onto 

paper or making copies of computer disks or such other manner of retrieving and copying the 

information as the Receiver in its discretion deems expedient, and shall not alter, erase or destroy 

any Records without the prior written consent of the Receiver.  Further, for the purposes of this 

paragraph, all Persons shall provide the Receiver with all such assistance in gaining immediate 

access to the information in the Records as the Receiver may in its discretion require including 

providing the Receiver with instructions on the use of any computer or other system and 

providing the Receiver with any and all access codes, account names and account numbers that 

may be required to gain access to the information. 

NO PROCEEDINGS AGAINST THE RECEIVER 

7. THIS COURT ORDERS that no proceeding or enforcement process in any court or 

tribunal (each, a "Proceeding"), shall be commenced or continued against the Receiver except 

with the written consent of the Receiver or with leave of this Court.    
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NO PROCEEDINGS AGAINST THE DEBTOR OR THE PROPERTY 

8. THIS COURT ORDERS that no Proceeding against or in respect of the Debtor or the 

Property shall be commenced or continued except with the written consent of the Receiver or 

with leave of this Court and any and all Proceedings currently under way against or in respect of 

the Debtor or the Property are hereby stayed and suspended pending further Order of this Court. 

NO EXERCISE OF RIGHTS OR REMEDIES 

9. THIS COURT ORDERS that all rights and remedies against the Debtor, the Receiver, or 

affecting the Property, are hereby stayed and suspended except with the written consent of the 

Receiver or leave of this Court, provided however that this stay and suspension does not apply in 

respect of any "eligible financial contract" as defined in the BIA, and further provided that 

nothing in this paragraph shall (i) empower the Receiver or the Debtor to carry on any business 

which the Debtor is not lawfully entitled to carry on, (ii) exempt the Receiver or the Debtor from 

compliance with statutory or regulatory provisions relating to health, safety or the environment, 

(iii) prevent the filing of any registration to preserve or perfect a security interest, or (iv) prevent 

the registration of a claim for lien. 

NO INTERFERENCE WITH THE RECEIVER 

10. THIS COURT ORDERS that no Person shall discontinue, fail to honour, alter, interfere 

with, repudiate, terminate or cease to perform any right, renewal right, contract, agreement, 

licence or permit in favour of or held by the Debtor, without written consent of the Receiver or 

leave of this Court. 

CONTINUATION OF SERVICES 

11. THIS COURT ORDERS that all Persons having oral or written agreements with the 

Debtor or statutory or regulatory mandates for the supply of goods and/or services, including, 

without limitation, all computer software, communication and other data services, centralized 

banking services, payroll services, insurance, transportation services, utility or other services to 

the Debtor are hereby restrained until further Order of this Court from discontinuing, altering, 

interfering with or terminating the supply of such goods or services as may be required by the 

Receiver, and that the Receiver shall be entitled to the continued use of the Debtor's current 
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telephone numbers, facsimile numbers, internet addresses and domain names, provided in each 

case that the normal prices or charges for all such goods or services received after the date of this 

Order are paid by the Receiver in accordance with normal payment practices of the Debtor or 

such other practices as may be agreed upon by the supplier or service provider and the Receiver, 

or as may be ordered by this Court.   

RECEIVER TO HOLD FUNDS 

12. THIS COURT ORDERS that all funds, monies, cheques, instruments, and other forms of 

payments received or collected by the Receiver from and after the making of this Order from any 

source whatsoever, including without limitation the sale of all or any of the Property and the 

collection of any accounts receivable in whole or in part, whether in existence on the date of this 

Order or hereafter coming into existence, shall be deposited into one or more new accounts to be 

opened by the Receiver (the "Post Receivership Accounts") and the monies standing to the 

credit of such Post Receivership Accounts from time to time, net of any disbursements provided 

for herein, shall be held by the Receiver to be paid in accordance with the terms of this Order or 

any further Order of this Court.  

EMPLOYEES 

13. THIS COURT ORDERS that all employees of the Debtor shall remain the employees of 

the Debtor until such time as the Receiver, on the Debtor's behalf, may terminate the 

employment of such employees.  The Receiver shall not be liable for any employee-related 

liabilities, including any successor employer liabilities as provided for in section 14.06(1.2) of 

the BIA, other than such amounts as the Receiver may specifically agree in writing to pay, or in 

respect of its obligations under sections 81.4(5) or 81.6(3) of the BIA or under the Wage Earner 

Protection Program Act. 

PIPEDA 

14. THIS COURT ORDERS that, pursuant to clause 7(3)(c) of the Canada Personal 

Information Protection and Electronic Documents Act, the Receiver shall disclose personal 

information of identifiable individuals to prospective purchasers or bidders for the Property and 

to their advisors, but only to the extent desirable or required to negotiate and attempt to complete 

one or more sales of the Property (each, a "Sale").  Each prospective purchaser or bidder to 
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whom such personal information is disclosed shall maintain and protect the privacy of such 

information and limit the use of such information to its evaluation of the Sale, and if it does not 

complete a Sale, shall return all such information to the Receiver, or in the alternative destroy all 

such information.  The purchaser of any Property shall be entitled to continue to use the personal 

information provided to it, and related to the Property purchased, in a manner which is in all 

material respects identical to the prior use of such information by the Debtor, and shall return all 

other personal information to the Receiver, or ensure that all other personal information is 

destroyed.  

LIMITATION ON ENVIRONMENTAL LIABILITIES 

15. THIS COURT ORDERS that nothing herein contained shall require the Receiver to 

occupy or to take control, care, charge, possession or management (separately and/or 

collectively, "Possession") of any of the Property that might be environmentally contaminated, 

might be a pollutant or a contaminant, or might cause or contribute to a spill, discharge, release 

or deposit of a substance contrary to any federal, provincial or other law respecting the 

protection, conservation, enhancement, remediation or rehabilitation of the environment or 

relating to the disposal of waste or other contamination including, without limitation, the 

Canadian Environmental Protection Act, the Ontario Environmental Protection Act, the Ontario 

Water Resources Act, or the Ontario Occupational Health and Safety Act and regulations 

thereunder (the "Environmental Legislation"), provided however that nothing herein shall 

exempt the Receiver from any duty to report or make disclosure imposed by applicable 

Environmental Legislation.  The Receiver shall not, as a result of this Order or anything done in 

pursuance of the Receiver's duties and powers under this Order, be deemed to be in Possession of 

any of the Property within the meaning of any Environmental Legislation, unless it is actually in 

possession.   

LIMITATION ON THE RECEIVER’S LIABILITY 

16. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver shall incur no liability or obligation as a result 

of its appointment or the carrying out the provisions of this Order, including, but not limited to, 

any illness or bodily harm resulting from a party or parties contracting COVID-19, save and 

except for any gross negligence or wilful misconduct on its part, or in respect of its obligations 
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under sections 81.4(5) or 81.6(3) of the BIA or under the Wage Earner Protection Program Act.  

Nothing in this Order shall derogate from the protections afforded the Receiver by section 14.06 

of the BIA or by any other applicable legislation.  

RECEIVER'S ACCOUNTS 

17. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver and counsel to the Receiver shall be paid their 

reasonable fees and disbursements, in each case at their standard rates and charges unless 

otherwise ordered by the Court on the passing of accounts, and that the Receiver and counsel to 

the Receiver shall be entitled to and are hereby granted a charge (the "Receiver's Charge") on 

the Property, as security for such fees and disbursements, both before and after the making of 

this Order in respect of these proceedings, and that the Receiver's Charge shall form a first 

charge on the Property pari passu with the Interim Receiver’s Charge (as defined in the Order of 

The Honourable Mr. Justice McEwen made April 23, 2020 (the “IR Appointment Order”)) and 

in priority to all security interests, trusts, liens, charges and encumbrances, statutory or 

otherwise, in favour of any Person, but subject to sections 14.06(7), 81.4(4), and 81.6(2) of the 

BIA.   

18. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver and its legal counsel shall pass their accounts 

from time to time, and for this purpose the accounts of the Receiver and its legal counsel are 

hereby referred to a judge of the Commercial List of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice. 

19. THIS COURT ORDERS that prior to the passing of its accounts, the Receiver shall be at 

liberty from time to time to apply reasonable amounts, out of the monies in its hands, against its 

fees and disbursements, including legal fees and disbursements, incurred at the standard rates 

and charges of the Receiver or its counsel, and such amounts shall constitute advances against its 

remuneration and disbursements when and as approved by this Court. 

FUNDING OF THE RECEIVERSHIP 

20. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver be at liberty and it is hereby empowered to 

borrow by way of a revolving credit or otherwise, such monies from time to time as it may 

consider necessary or desirable, provided that the outstanding principal amount does not exceed 

$350,000.00 (or such greater amount as this Court may by further Order authorize) at any time, 
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at such rate or rates of interest as it deems advisable for such period or periods of time as it may 

arrange, for the purpose of funding the exercise of the powers and duties conferred upon the 

Receiver by this Order, including interim expenditures.  The whole of the Property shall be and 

is hereby charged by way of a fixed and specific charge (the "Receiver's Borrowings Charge") 

as security for the payment of the monies borrowed, together with interest and charges thereon, 

pari passu with the Interim Receiver’s Borrowings Charge (as defined in the IR Appointment 

Order) and in priority to all security interests, trusts, liens, charges and encumbrances, statutory 

or otherwise, in favour of any Person, but subordinate in priority to the Receiver’s Charge and 

the charges as set out in sections 14.06(7), 81.4(4), and 81.6(2) of the BIA.  

21. THIS COURT ORDERS that 256 be and hereby is granted a charge on the Property in an 

amount equal to a monthly occupancy rent amount of $25,000.00 plus HST calculated on a per 

diem basis from June 4, 2020 to the time when the Receiver ceases occupation of the Arvin 

Premises within the meaning of the Occupation Agreement (the “Occupation Charge”).  The 

Occupation Charge shall rank subordinate to the Interim Receiver’s Charge, the Receiver’s 

Charge, the Interim Receiver’s Borrowings Charge and the Receiver’s Borrowing Charge, but in 

priority to all secured creditors including CEFL and CWB. 

22. THIS COURT ORDERS that neither the Receiver's Borrowings Charge nor any other 

security granted by the Receiver in connection with its borrowings under this Order shall be 

enforced without leave of this Court. 

23. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver is at liberty and authorized to issue certificates 

substantially in the form annexed as Schedule "A" hereto (the "Receiver’s Certificates") for any 

amount borrowed by it pursuant to this Order. 

24. THIS COURT ORDERS that the monies from time to time borrowed by the Receiver 

pursuant to this Order or any further order of this Court and any and all Receiver’s Certificates 

evidencing the same or any part thereof shall rank on a pari passu basis, unless otherwise agreed 

to by the holders of any prior issued Receiver's Certificates.  
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SERVICE AND NOTICE 

25. THIS COURT ORDERS that the E-Service Protocol of the Commercial List (the 

“Protocol”) is approved and adopted by reference herein and, in this proceeding, the service of 

documents made in accordance with the Protocol (which can be found on the Commercial List 

website at https://www.ontariocourts.ca/scj/practice/practice-directions/toronto/eservice-

commercial/ shall be valid and effective service.  Subject to Rule 17.05 this Order shall 

constitute an order for substituted service pursuant to Rule 16.04 of the Rules of Civil Procedure. 

Subject to Rule 3.01(d) of the Rules of Civil Procedure and paragraph 21 of the Protocol, service 

of documents in accordance with the Protocol will be effective on transmission.  This Court 

further orders that a Case Website shall be established in accordance with the Protocol with the 

following URL www.spergelcorporate.ca. 

26. THIS COURT ORDERS that if the service or distribution of documents in accordance 

with the Protocol is not practicable, the Receiver is at liberty to serve or distribute this Order, any 

other materials and orders in these proceedings, any notices or other correspondence, by 

forwarding true copies thereof by prepaid ordinary mail, courier, personal delivery or facsimile 

transmission to the Debtor's creditors or other interested parties at their respective addresses as 

last shown on the records of the Debtor and that any such service or distribution by courier, 

personal delivery or facsimile transmission shall be deemed to be received on the next business 

day following the date of forwarding thereof, or if sent by ordinary mail, on the third business 

day after mailing. 

GENERAL 

27. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver may from time to time apply to this Court for 

advice and directions in the discharge of its powers and duties hereunder. 

28. THIS COURT ORDERS that nothing in this Order shall prevent the Receiver from acting 

as a trustee in bankruptcy of the Debtor. 

29. THIS COURT CONFIRMS the discharge of the Interim Receiver over those 

undertakings, properties and assets of the Debtor over which it was appointed in the IR 

Appointment Order, provided however that notwithstanding its discharge herein the Interim 
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Receiver shall continue to have the benefit of the provisions of all Orders made in this 

proceeding, including all approvals, protections, priority charges and stays of proceedings in 

favour of the Interim Receiver.   

30. THIS COURT ORDERS that, for greater certainty, and notwithstanding the Interim 

Receiver’s discharge, the Receiver be and is hereby authorized to bring one or more motions on 

the Interim Receiver’s behalf for the purposes of seeking approval of: (i) the First Report and the 

Interim Receiver’s activities therein; (ii) the fees and disbursements of the Interim Receiver and 

its counsel in accordance with paragraph 17 of the IR Appointment Order; (iii) the discharge of 

liability with respect to the Interim Receiver, save and except for any gross negligence or wilful 

misconduct by the Interim Receiver; and (iv) any ancillary relief in regards to (i), (ii) or (iii) 

31. THIS COURT HEREBY REQUESTS the aid and recognition of any court, tribunal, 

regulatory or administrative body having jurisdiction in Canada or in the United States to give 

effect to this Order and to assist the Receiver and its agents in carrying out the terms of this 

Order.  All courts, tribunals, regulatory and administrative bodies are hereby respectfully 

requested to make such orders and to provide such assistance to the Receiver, as an officer of this 

Court, as may be necessary or desirable to give effect to this Order or to assist the Receiver and 

its agents in carrying out the terms of this Order.  

32. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver be at liberty and is hereby authorized and 

empowered to apply to any court, tribunal, regulatory or administrative body, wherever located, 

for the recognition of this Order and for assistance in carrying out the terms of this Order, and 

that the Receiver is authorized and empowered to act as a representative in respect of the within 

proceedings for the purpose of having these proceedings recognized in a jurisdiction outside 

Canada. 

33. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Applicant shall have its costs of this motion, up to and 

including entry and service of this Order, provided for by the terms of the Applicant’s security 

or, if not so provided by the Applicant’s security, then on a substantial indemnity basis to be paid 

by the Receiver from the Debtor's estate with such priority and at such time as this Court may 

determine. 
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34. THIS COURT ORDERS that any interested party may apply to this Court to vary or 

amend this Order on not less than seven (7) days' notice to the Receiver and to any other party 

likely to be affected by the order sought or upon such other notice, if any, as this Court may 

order. 

35. THIS COURT ORDERS that, notwithstanding Rule 59.05 of the Rules of Civil 

Procedure, this Order is effective from the date on which it is made, and is enforceable without 

any need for entry and filing; provided, however, that any party may nonetheless submit a formal 

order for original, signing, entry and filing, as the case may be. 

 

 

________________________________________
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SCHEDULE "A" 

RECEIVER CERTIFICATE 

CERTIFICATE NO. ______________ 

AMOUNT $_____________________ 

1. THIS IS TO CERTIFY that msi Spergel inc., in its capacity as the receiver (in 

such capacity, the "Receiver") of the assets, undertakings and properties of Eveley 

International Corporation (the “Debtor”) acquired for, or used in relation to a business 

carried on by the Debtor, including all proceeds thereof (collectively, the “Property”) 

appointed by Order of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice (Commercial List) (the 

"Court") dated the 4th day of June, 2020 (the "Order") made in a motion having Court 

file number CV-20-00639897-00CL has received as such Receiver from the holder of this 

certificate (the "Lender") the principal sum of $___________, being part of the total 

principal sum of $___________ which the Receiver is authorized to borrow under and 

pursuant to the Order. 

2. The principal sum evidenced by this certificate is payable on demand by the 

Lender with interest thereon calculated and compounded [daily][monthly not in advance 

on the _______ day of each month] after the date hereof at a notional rate per annum 

equal to the rate of ______ per cent above the prime commercial lending rate of Bank of 

_________ from time to time. 

3. Such principal sum with interest thereon is, by the terms of the Order, together 

with the principal sums and interest thereon of all other certificates issued by the 

Receiver pursuant to the Order or to any further order of the Court, a charge upon the 

whole of the Property, in priority to the security interests of any other person, but subject 

to the priority of the charges set out in the Order and in the Bankruptcy and Insolvency 

Act, and the right of the Receiver to indemnify itself out of such Property in respect of its 

remuneration and expenses. 

4. All sums payable in respect of principal and interest under this certificate are 

payable at the main office of the Lender at Toronto, Ontario. 

129



 

 
 

5. Until all liability in respect of this certificate has been terminated, no certificates 

creating charges ranking or purporting to rank in priority to this certificate shall be issued 

by the Receiver to any person other than the holder of this certificate without the prior 

written consent of the holder of this certificate. 

6. The charge securing this certificate shall operate so as to permit the Receiver to 

deal with the Property as authorized by the Order and as authorized by any further or 

other order of the Court. 

7. The Receiver does not undertake, and it is not under any personal liability, to pay 

any sum in respect of which it may issue certificates under the terms of the Order. 

DATED the _____ day of ______________, 20__. 

 

 msi Spergel inc., solely in its capacity 
 as Receiver of the Property, and not in 
its personal capacity  

  Per:  

   Name: 

   Title:  
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  Court File No. CV-20-00639897-00CL  
 

CANADIAN EQUIPMENT FINANCE & LEASING INC. 
Applicant 

 
- and - 

EVELEY INTERNATIONAL CORPORATION 
Respondent 

  
ONTARIO 

SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 
(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

 

  
ORDER 

(appointing Receiver) 

 

GOLDMAN SLOAN NASH & HABER LLP 
Barristers & Solicitors 
480 University Avenue, Suite 1600 
Toronto, Ontario 
M5G 1V2 
 
R. Brendan Bissell [LSO No. 40354V] 
Email: bissell@gsnh.com  
Tel:   (416) 597-6489 
Fax:   (416) 597-3370 
 
Lawyers for the Applicant, 
Canadian Equipment Finance & Leasing Inc. 

 
40217396.2 

26 June 20

Order to go as per draft filed and signed. Creditors and Receiver consent. 
Debtor does not oppose. 
The terms of the Order are fair and reasonable.
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Ian Aversa 
Direct: 416.865.3082 

Email: iaversa@airdberlis.com

October 7, 2020 

VIA EMAIL (gcamelino@cglegal.ca)  

Camelino Galessiere LLP 
6 Adelaide Street East, Suite 220 
Toronto, ON  M5C 1H6 

Attention:  Gustavo F. Camelino 

Dear Mr. Camelino: 

Re: Canadian Equipment Finance & Leasing Inc. v. Eveley International Corporation / 
Court File No. CV-19-00639897-00CL 

We understand that you are counsel for Eveley International Corporation (the “Debtor”), and that 
the Debtor was formed as a result of an amalgamation amongst Eveley Alignment & Spring 
Service Limited, 2442968 Ontario Inc. and 534755 Ontario Limited. 

As you know, we are the lawyers for msi Spergel inc. (“Spergel”), in its original capacity as the 
court-appointed interim receiver of the Debtor (in such capacity, the “Interim Receiver”), and in 
its current capacity as the court-appointed receiver of the Debtor (in such capacity, the 
“Receiver”).  Spergel was appointed as the Interim Receiver pursuant to the Order of The 
Honourable Mr. Justice McEwen of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice (Commercial List) (the 
“Court”) made on April 23, 2020 (the “Interim Receivership Order”).  Spergel was appointed 
as the Receiver pursuant to the Order of The Honourable Mr. Justice McEwen of the Court made 
on June 25, 2020 (the “Receivership Order”).  Unless otherwise stated, all capitalized terms 
herein are defined as they appear in the Interim Receivership Order or the Receivership Order, as 
applicable. 

As you also know, paragraph 3 of both the Interim Receivership Order and the Receivership Order 
empowers and authorizes the Interim Receiver or the Receiver, as the case may be, to, amongst 
other things, “take possession and exercise control over the Property and any and all proceeds, 
receipts and disbursements arising out of or from the Property,” “receive, preserve, and protect 
the Property, or any part or parts thereof” and “receive and collect all monies and accounts now 
or hereafter owing to the Debtor.”  In turn, paragraph 4 of both the Interim Receivership Order 
and the Receivership Order requires all Persons to deliver any Property in their possession to the 
Interim Receiver or the Receiver, as the case may be, upon request from the Interim Receiver or 
the Receiver, as the case may be. 

The Receiver has become aware of withdrawals totalling $135,649.24 from the Debtor’s bank 
accounts since the date of the Interim Receivership Order.  For convenience, a table summarizing 
the details of these withdrawals appears on the second page of this letter. 
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Page 2 

As reflected in the above table, copies of the applicable bank drafts or cancelled cheque have been 
enclosed with this letter. 

In accordance with the aforementioned duties of all Persons under both the Interim Receivership 
Order and the Receivership Order, please ensure that your client, its principal and employees and 
other related parties return and/or repay all monies that they have received from the Debtor since 
April 23, 2020 (including, without limitation, as reflected in the above table). 

Please ensure that this occurs forthwith. 

Yours very truly, 

AIRD & BERLIS LLP

Ian Aversa 

Ian Aversa 
IA/jn 

Encl. 

cc: Client (via email) 
B. Bissell, counsel for Canadian Equipment Finance & Leasing Inc. (via email) 

41874250.1 

Date Paid to Cheque # Amount Comments

02-Jun-20 D. Eveley Bank draft 95,000.00

Bank draft copy enclosed - Deposited to 

Account 3122-726 (Dawn's account)

02-Jun-20 Camelino Galessiere LLP Bank draft 19,449.35 Bank draft copy enclosed

02-Jun-20 Dawn Eveley 202938 5,282.42 Copy of cancelled cheque enclosed

02-Jun-20 Sandra McDonald 202889 1,263.20 Copy of cancelled cheque enclosed

02-Jun-20 Sandra McDonald 202941 1,308.40 Copy of cancelled cheque enclosed

03-Jun-20 Dawn Eveley 202967 1,200.00 Copy of cancelled cheque enclosed

15-Jun-20 Brandon Eveley 202980 1,000.00 Copy of cancelled cheque enclosed

18-Jun-20 Capital One Online payment 600.00

22-Jun-20 Eveley 202971 1,300.00 Copy of cancelled cheque enclosed

21-May-20 Dawn Eveley 202969 1,200.00 Copy of cancelled cheque enclosed

21-May-20 Sandra McDonald 202970 1,000.00 Copy of cancelled cheque enclosed

22-May-20 Sandra McDonald 202806 1,263.20 Copy of cancelled cheque enclosed

22-May-20 Dawn Eveley 202801 5,782.67 Copy of cancelled cheque enclosed

135,649.24
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Eveley International Corp. 

Invoice 

June 11, 2020 Invoice #: <3748> 

RE: Eveley International Corp. 

 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with our appointment as Interim Receiver for the period 

ending May 25, 2020. 

Hours Hourly Rate Total   

$18,931.25 $522.24 Philip H. Gennis, LL.B., CIRP, LIT  36.25 

 52.50  525.00 Deborah Hornbostel, CPA, CA, CFE, CIRP,LIT  0.10 

 26,504.50  395.00 Mukul Manchanda, CPA, CIRP, LIT  67.10 

 125.00  250.00 Eileen Sturge  0.50 

 325.00  250.00 Frieda Kanaris  1.30 

 48.00  120.00 Hinna Shaikh  0.40 

 165.00  150.00 Haran Sivanathan  1.10 

 1,400.00  200.00 Rashid Peeroo  7.00 

Others  1.80  225.00  125.00 

 115.55 $413.47 Total Professional fees $47,776.25 

 6,210.91 HST 

Total $53,987.16 

HST Registration #R825172935 

(AAEVEL-R) 
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Page 1 of 10 

MSGG - Detailed Time Dockets Filters Used: 

        -  Time Entry Date:   1/01/70  to  5/25/20 

        -  File ID:    AAEVEL-R:  to  AAEVEL-R: 

        -  Time Entry Bill Status:  Un-Billed  to  Un-Billed 

        -  Time Entry Bill Status:  Un-Billed  to  Un-Billed 

File Name (ID): Eveley International Corp. (AAEVEL-R:) 

Date Day B-Hrs Amount Memo B-Rate 

Deborah Hornbostel (DHO) 

05/13/2020 Wed  0.10 $52.50 $525.00  Review and approve disbursements 

 0.10 $52.50 Deborah Hornbostel (DHO) 

Eileen Sturge (EST) 

04/30/2020 Thur  0.30 $75.00 $250.00  Set up file in Ascend; order licence 

05/01/2020 Fri  0.20 $50.00 $250.00  General 

 0.50 $125.00 Eileen Sturge (EST) 

Frieda Kanaris (FKA) 

04/27/2020 Mon  1.30 $325.00 $250.00  Exchange of emails with PG; complete FCA insurance survey form and 

forward to FCA, subsequent email to FCA. 

 1.30 $325.00 Frieda Kanaris (FKA) 

Hinna Shaikh (HSH) 

04/24/2020 Fri  0.30 $36.00 $120.00  Updated site 

05/22/2020 Fri  0.10 $12.00 $120.00  Updated site 

 0.40 $48.00 Hinna Shaikh (HSH) 

Haran Sivanathan (HSI) 

04/23/2020 Thur  0.50 $75.00 $150.00  General 

05/07/2020 Thur  0.60 $90.00 $150.00  General 

 1.10 $165.00 Haran Sivanathan (HSI) 

Inga Friptuleac (IFR) 

04/28/2020 Tues  0.20 $25.00 $125.00  B/A setup  

05/06/2020 Wed  1.00 $125.00 $125.00  Post Deposit. Correspondence with Trustee re:wire transfer 

05/11/2020 Mon  0.20 $25.00 $125.00  Issue cheque 

05/25/2020 Mon  0.40 $50.00 $125.00  Post wire trf; Issue cheque  

 1.80 $225.00 Inga Friptuleac (IFR) 

Mukul Manchanda (MMA) 

04/18/2020 Sat  1.00 $395.00 $395.00  Conference call with B. Bissel and P. Gennis with respect to the 

engagement. Receipt and review of the draft engagement letter. Sent 

an email providing comments on the draft engagement letter. 

04/19/2020 Sun  0.30 $118.50 $395.00  Receipt and review of email exchanges with B. Bissell with respect to 

the engagement and the developments with the landlord. Email 

exchanges with respect to obtaining indemnity. 

04/20/2020 Mon  0.40 $158.00 $395.00  Participated in a conference call with B. Bissell and P. Gennis regarding 

the go forward strategy. Receipt and review of email exchanges 

regarding the indemnity. 

04/21/2020 Tues  0.20 $79.00 $395.00  Sent an email to B. Bissell providing the COVID-19 limitation clause to be 

included in the draft order. 

04/22/2020 Wed  1.00 $395.00 $395.00  Participated in a conference call with B. Bissell, I. Aversa and P. Gennis 

with respect to the appoint. Review of draft IR order and provided 

comments. Review of application record and materials filed by the 

debtor. 
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Page 2 of 10 

MSGG - Detailed Time Dockets Filters Used: 

        -  Time Entry Date:   1/01/70  to  5/25/20 

        -  File ID:    AAEVEL-R:  to  AAEVEL-R: 

        -  Time Entry Bill Status:  Un-Billed  to  Un-Billed 

        -  Time Entry Bill Status:  Un-Billed  to  Un-Billed 

File Name (ID): Eveley International Corp. (AAEVEL-R:) 

Date Day B-Hrs Amount Memo B-Rate 

Mukul Manchanda (MMA) 

04/23/2020 Thur  6.00 $2,370.00 $395.00  Review of multiple emails with respect to the Interim Receivership 

Order.  Participated in multiple conference calls with I. Aversa, P. 

Gennis, B. Bissel, H. Chaiton and G. Camelino. Discussion with I. Aversa 

and P. Gennis regarding the protocol for access to the premises given 

the lease is terminated. Agreed that we will need an occupancy 

agreement prior to occupying the premises. DFurther discussions with 

respect to insurance issue and the issue of shipping certain completed 

orders. Receipt and review of the terminated lease agreement. 

Conference call with D. Eveley and P. Gennis with respect to gaining 

access to the premises to turn on the server and the equipment and 

gain access to the financial information to prepare a viability report. 

Receipt and review of the draft occupancy agreement from J. Nemers. 

Review of multiple emails from G. Camelino providing information with 

respect to the company and introductions to relevant parties. 

04/24/2020 Fri  1.00 $395.00 $395.00  Telephone discussions and email exchanges regarding the insurance of 

the business. Receipt and review of an email from J. Nemers to H. 

Chaiton providing a draft occupation agreement for his review and 

comments. Receipt and review of an email from B. Bissell asking for an 

update on the file. Receipt and review of an email from P. Gennis 

providing the update. Receipt and review of email exchanges 

between H. Chaiton and P. Gennis regarding arranging access to the 

premises for the purpose of restarting the servers prior to having an 

occupation agreement in place. Receipt and review of email 

exchanges between counsels regarding outstanding issues. 

04/26/2020 Sun  4.00 $1,580.00 $395.00  Travel to and attended at the premises to meet with Benny, Dawn and 

Sandra. Gained access to the premises to reboot the servers. Noted an 

issue with the Internet connection. Took a tour of the premises with 

Dawn. Discussions with Benny regarding the go forward plan. Travel 

back.  Telephone call to P. Gennis provided him with an update. Sent 

an email to B. Bissell providing him with the update. 

04/27/2020 Mon  0.70 $276.50 $395.00  Receipt and review of an email from Sandra containing the insurance 

policy. Review of email exchanges with respect to obtaining insurance. 

Receipt and review of an email from I. Aversa providing the 

occupation agreement containing comments from H. Chaiton. Sent an 

email to I. Aversa providing comments. Receipt and review of a email 

from G. Camelino to H. Chaiton regarding the condition of the premises 

and other observations made by his clients during the attendance at 

the premises. 

04/28/2020 Tues  0.50 $197.50 $395.00  Review of multiple email exchanges with respect to insurance 

coverage for occupation of the premises and other matters. Receipt 

and review of an email to H. Chaiton containing the signed 

Occupancy Agreement along with proof of insurance. Receipt and 

review of an email from B. Di Franco forwarding an email from a vendor 

requesting payment. Receipt and review of emails regarding the ability 

of a customer to cancel orders in light of the appointment of the 

Interim Receiver. Receipt and review of an email from G. Camelino 

with respect to the shipment of the orders. Email exchanges between P. 

Gennis and G. Camelino regarding same. 
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        -  File ID:    AAEVEL-R:  to  AAEVEL-R: 

        -  Time Entry Bill Status:  Un-Billed  to  Un-Billed 

        -  Time Entry Bill Status:  Un-Billed  to  Un-Billed 

File Name (ID): Eveley International Corp. (AAEVEL-R:) 

Date Day B-Hrs Amount Memo B-Rate 

Mukul Manchanda (MMA) 

04/29/2020 Wed  0.80 $316.00 $395.00  Receipt and review of an email from H. Chaiton regarding Occupation 

Agreement. Review of multiple email exchanges regarding same. 

Receipt and review of email exchanges with the insurance broker. 

Receipt and review of draft acknowledgement and release with 

respect COVID-19. Sent an email to J. Nemers providing comments. 

04/30/2020 Thur  4.00 $1,580.00 $395.00  Travel to the premises to meet with the landlord and take possession of 

the premises. Took a tour of the premises with the landlord. Arranged for 

a locksmith to change locks and padlocks at the premises. Telephone 

call from GFL Environmental regarding the three green bins parked at 

the premises. Travel back. 

05/01/2020 Fri  7.50 $2,962.50 $395.00  Travel to the premises. Met with Dawn and Sandra. Troubleshoot the 

server. Created access to locally to the accounting software. 

Discussions with Dawn and Sandra regarding preparing a projection 

and format of same. Supervise Sandra in copying data required to 

prepare projections. Travel back. Receipt and review of email 

exchanges between P. Gennis and B. BIssell with respect to the 

Receiver's Borrowings. 

05/04/2020 Mon  0.40 $158.00 $395.00  Conference call with B. Keenan regarding status of the file. Receipt and 

review of an email from B. Di Franco forwarding an email from a 

potential purchaser. 

05/06/2020 Wed  0.40 $158.00 $395.00  Review of email exchanges regarding deadline for production of 

financial forecast. Telephone call from Sandra regarding the timing of 

the forecast. Review of email exchanges with B. Keenan. 

05/08/2020 Fri  0.30 $118.50 $395.00  Conference call regarding insurance. 

05/11/2020 Mon  0.50 $197.50 $395.00  Telephone call from GFL regarding removal of the bins. Arranged for 

staff to be onsite to supervise the removal. Receipt and review of an 

email from S. McDonald advising it is taking longer than expected to 

complete the financial forecast and she hopes to have the financial 

forecast ready for tomorrow. 

05/12/2020 Tues  1.80 $711.00 $395.00  Receipt and review of an email from S. McDonald providing financial 

statements and other relevant information. Forwarded same to P. 

Gennis. Receipt and review of an email from P. Gennis to the group 

advising that we have not received any information with respect to a 

forecast. Receipt, review and approve payables. Receipt and review 

of an email from I. Aversa regarding progress with our mandate and 

the cooperation received from the company. Receipt and review of 

an email from D. Eveley advising that she is meeting with S. McDonald 

tomorrow to finalize the report. Receipt and review of an email from P. 

Gennis to G. Camelino advising that the recurring delays are 

unacceptable as the IR is under a tight deadline with respect to filing a 

report with court pursuant to the Order. Receipt and review of an email 

from G. Camelino advising he will follow up. 

05/13/2020 Wed  0.10 $39.50 $395.00  Receipt and review of an email from S. McDonald advising that she will 

be providing the forecast tomorrow. 

05/14/2020 Thur  1.50 $592.50 $395.00  Sent an email to S. McDonald asking for an update regarding the 

forecast. Receipt and review of an email from P. Gennis to the Debtor's 

counsel advising that we did not receive any relevant information to 

date. Receipt and review of an email from B. Bissell regarding historical 

information and analysis of same. Email exchanges with I. Aversa, J. 

Nemers and P. Gennis regarding the issue. Participated in a conference 

call with I. Aversa, J. Nemers and P. Gennis. Receipt and review of the 

draft letter from J. Nemers to the Debtor's counsel. Provided comments 

regarding same and emailed to J. Nemers. 
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Date Day B-Hrs Amount Memo B-Rate 

Mukul Manchanda (MMA) 

05/15/2020 Fri  1.20 $474.00 $395.00  Receipt and review of an email from G. Camelino acjnowledging 

receipt of the letter from Aird & Berlis and advising that he will forward 

same to his client. Receipt and review of an email from I. Aversa asking 

if we received any information from the company. Sent an email 

advising that we did not receive any information. Receipt and review 

of an email from I. Aversa advising that if we do not receive the 

information by 7 pm than J. Nemers will send a short formal email. 

Receipt and review of an email from G. Camelino advising that the 

company will send all the information today as they were not aware of 

all the information the Interim Receiver requires until today. Email 

exchanges with counsel regarding G. Camelino's email. Conference 

call with counsel regarding same. Receipt and review of draft response 

from J. Nemers. Sent an email to J. Nemers providing comments and 

copies of email exchanges with Dawn and Sandra acknowledging 

what is required to produce the financial forecast. 

05/16/2020 Sat  3.50 $1,382.50 $395.00  Receipt and review of emails containing pdf version of the forecast 

and certain supporting documents. Drafted a detailed email to S. 

McDonald regarding the forecast and emailed same to J. Nemers for 

comments. Receipt and review of comments from J. Nemers. 

Discussions with P. Gennis regarding the forecast. Sent the email to S. 

McDonald containing comments regarding the forecast and asking for 

information to support the forecast. Email exchanges with B. Bissel 

regarding the financial forecast. 

05/17/2020 Sun  2.20 $869.00 $395.00  Receipt and review of multiple emails containing information with 

respect to the forecast. Review of the excel spreadsheet containing 

the financial forecast and certain supporting documents. 

05/18/2020 Mon  2.50 $987.50 $395.00  Continue review of the information provided by S. McDonald. Sent an 

email to S. McDonald asking for the outstanding information and 

advising that I am available to meet tomorrow at the premises to finish 

the review. 

05/19/2020 Tues  6.00 $2,370.00 $395.00  Conference call with I. Aversa, J. Nemers and P. Gennis with respect to 

the information received to date. Travel to the premises and met with 

Sandra and Dawn. Review of the accounts receivable aging. Noted a 

significant difference in the accounts receivable as at March 31, 2020 

and May 1, 2020. Review supporting documents. Discussion with 

respect to the practice of recording accounts receivable prior to 

commencing manufacturing and shipping the product. Agreed that 

those should not be accounted as receivables. Review of the sales 

forecast along with limited supporting documents available. Review of 

the scenario analysis. Discussion regarding the re-financing efforts of the 

company. Travel back. Drafted an email summarizing the meeting and 

sent it to the group. 
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Mukul Manchanda (MMA) 

05/20/2020 Wed  8.00 $3,160.00 $395.00  Receipt and review of an email from I. Aversa regarding our findings so 

far. Attended at Eveley to continue working on the financial forecast. 

Receipt and review of the sales projections and the supporting 

documents. Review of other assumptions in the forecast and the 

supporting documents. Compared historical financial performance 

with the assumptions underlying the forecast.  Discussions with D. Eeley 

with respect to shipping the completed orders. Multiple email 

exchanges and telephone calls with counsel with respect to same. 

Review of a draft email to G. Camilino. Provided comments regarding 

same. Review of email exchanges regarding the product liability 

insurance. Discussions regarding shipping the product out on an as is 

where is basis. Review of emal exchanges with H. Chaiton with respect 

to the company occupying the premises. 

05/21/2020 Thur  5.00 $1,975.00 $395.00  Review and edit and report to court. Telephone call to I. Aversa 

regarding the content of the report. Sent a draft version of the report to 

I.Aversa and J. Nemers for review and comments. Multiple email 

exchanges with counsel and the company with respect to shipment of 

certain goods. Review of an execute release and other emails from 

Max-Atlas. Telephone discussion with D. Eveley regarding attendance 

at the premises tomorrow for shipment of goods. Instructed R. Peeroo to 

attend at the premises tomorrow for the purpose of shipping the items. 

Receipt and review of an email from Sandra advising that she will send 

the opening balance sheet later today. Receipt and review of email 

exchanges with counsel with respect to the occupation agreement 

and timing of same. Conference call with B. Bissell, I. Aversa, J. Nemers 

and P. Gennis regarding go forward plan. Receipt and review of an 

email from J. Nemers containing comments to the report. Finalized the 

report and emailed an executed copy to J. Nemers. Prepared 

Appendix 3 of the report and emailed same to J. Nemers. 

05/22/2020 Fri  2.80 $1,106.00 $395.00  Receipt and review of the six months projections from S. McDonald. 

Receipt and review of multiple emails from D. Eveley containing 

purchase orders and other information related to the sales forecast. 

Receipt and review of an email from B. Bissell regarding go forward 

strategy after expiry of the IR. 

05/23/2020 Sat  1.50 $592.50 $395.00  Preliminary review of the financial forecast and other supporting 

documents provided by S. McDonald. 

05/24/2020 Sun  0.20 $79.00 $395.00  Email exchanges with J. Nemers, I. Aversa and P. Gennis regarding a 

response to S. McDonald. Drafted a response and emailed same to S. 

McDonald and D. Eveley. 

05/25/2020 Mon  1.80 $711.00 $395.00  Receipt and review of an email from B. Bissell to H. Chaiton with respect 

to instructions from his client. Receipt and review of an email from H. 

Chaiton regarding the occupancy agreement. Receipt and review of 

an email from G. Camelino to H. Chaiton regarding amounts 

outstanding to his client by the company. Review of email exchanges 

between coounsels regarding the draft receivership order. Email 

exchanges and telephone discussions with I. Aversa regarding our role 

ending as IR and commencing as Receiver and the implications of 

same with respect to insurance, occupancy agreement and other 

matters.  Receipt, reveiw and provided comments on the draft 

receivership order. Receipt and review of the draft occupancy 

agreement. 

 67.10 $26,504.50 Mukul Manchanda (MMA) 

Philip H. Gennis (PGE) 
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Date Day B-Hrs Amount Memo B-Rate 

04/17/2020 Fri  0.50 $262.50 $525.00  Initial consulltation and discussion with Brendan Bissell regarding as 

private monitor;  

04/18/2020 Sat  1.00 $525.00 $525.00  Receipt and review of draft engagement letter; telephone discussions 

with Brendan Bissell regarding proposed engagement and issues 

surrounding private appointment in light of circumstances with Landlord 

and related parties; 

04/19/2020 Sun  0.50 $262.50 $525.00  Email exchange with Brendan Bissell finalizing engagement; 

preparation and transmittal of Indemnity to be signed by CEFL;  

04/20/2020 Mon  0.50 $262.50 $525.00  Call with Brendan Bissell. 

04/22/2020 Wed  1.25 $656.25 $525.00  Conference call with Brendan Bissell, MM and Ian Aversa (IR Counsel); 

review of draft IR Order; receitp and review of numerous emails with 

multiple revised drafts of IR Order; response with comments; receipt, 

execution and transmittal of Consent to Act; receipt and review of 

CEFL Application record; email to Brendan Bissell providing 

commentary to proposed Draft Order;  

04/23/2020 Thur  7.00 $3,675.00 $525.00  Call with Ian Aversa regarding proposed amendments to draft order 

including issues related to taking possession, payment of occupation 

rent, access to premises, insurance, etc.,videoconference attendance 

before HHJ McEwen on application for the appointment of an IR; 

numerous emails and multiple telephone discussions with Ian Aversa 

(Counsel for Spergel), Brendan Bissell (Counsel for CEFL), Harvey 

Chaiton (Counsel for Landlord) and Gus Camelllino (Counsel for 

Eveley)in an effort to finalize IR Order; receipt and review of multiple 

drafts of IR Order; receipt and review of draft Occupation Agreement; 

telephone discussion with Dawn Eveley regarding gaining access to 

premises and books and records so as to enable viability review to 

commence; email exchange with Insurance Broker to begin process of 

obtaining insurance for premises; 

04/24/2020 Fri  1.25 $656.25 $525.00  Lengthy telephone discussion with Brekon Husband insurance broker for 

Eveley and its current policy of insurance; email request to insurance 

broker as to pur requirement for insurance and requesting current 

insurable values so as to enable us to canvass the market for other 

coverage; receipt and response to email from Brent Keenan with 

respect to post-appointment progress; 

04/25/2020 Sat  1.25 $656.25 $525.00  Email exchange with Brendan Bissell regarding his client's concerns 

relative to progress; telephone discussion with Brendan Bissell in this 

regard; email to Receiver's Counsel looking for a work-around to get us 

into the premises absent the Occupation Agreement and insurance for 

purposes of re-booting servers; email to Harvey Chaiton requesting a 

copy of insurance policy which his client may have in its capacity as 

Landlord and with respect to gaining access for the limited purpose of 

re-booting servers; follow-up email to Eveley insurance broker to see if 

we can piggy back on the existing insurance and to obtain a copy of 

current insurance values thus enabling Receiver to obtain alternative 

insurance coverage; telephone discusions with Landlord to facilitate 

site visit for April 26;coordinating site visit for April 26 with Landlord, 

Dawn Eveley and controller for Eveley International. 

04/26/2020 Sun  0.50 $262.50 $525.00  Telephone discussion with MM regarding site visit; texts to Dawn Eveley 

regarding insurance policy; review of financial information provided by 

Landlord; review of January 2019 equipment appraisal; receipt of copy 

of email to Brendan Bissell reporting on site visit; numerous text requests 

to Dawn Eveley regarding copy of insurance policy. 
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Philip H. Gennis (PGE) 

04/27/2020 Mon  2.00 $1,050.00 $525.00  Receipt, review and execution of Occupancy Agreement; multiple 

email exchanges regarding insurance for premises; receipt and review 

of FCA Insurance Survey; email to Counsel regarding insurance; email 

and text exchanges with Landlord regarding building construction; 

04/28/2020 Tues  1.00 $425.00 $425.00  Execute and transmit Occupation Agreement to Landlord and its Counsel;On-going 

email exchanges with insurance brokers aimed at getting alternate 

insurance coverage less costly than FCA; request and obtain Insurance 

Certificate from FCA for transmittal to Landlord pursuant to Occupation 

Agreement. 

 
 

04/29/2020 Wed  1.50 $787.50 $525.00  Email exchange with Counsel for Landlord regarding occupation 

agreement and changing of locks but granting access by Landlord on 

48 hours notice; email exchange with IR's Counsel in this regard; email 

exchange with Counsel for CEFL regarding borrowing pursuant to IR 

Borrowing Certificate; email exchange with Breckon Husband former 

insurance broker for Eveley regarding transferring existing insurance to 

IR to allow for product liability coverage  thus permitting release of 

finished product; email exchange with second insurance broker with 

respect to possibly getting alternative insurance coverage at a 

significantly lower cost than FCA Insurance; receipt aznd review of 

Covid-19 Acknowledgment from Counsel to IR for signature by all who 

come into contact with premises thus avoiding exposure to liability; 

on-going email exchanges with Brendan Bissell (Counsel to CEFL) and 

Gusd Camelino (Counsel to Eveley) regarding issues facing the 

IR;dealing with FCA INsurance to get temporary coverage in advance 

of confirming coverage with alternative insurers. 

04/30/2020 Thur  0.50 $262.50 $525.00  Telephone discussions with Breckon Husband regarding insurance 

coverage; telephone discussion with Dawn Eveley regarding revenue 

value for completed orders and subsequent email exchange in this 

regard 

05/01/2020 Fri  1.00 $525.00 $525.00  Receipt and review of invoice from Landlord and forwarding same to 

Counsel for CEFL; email exchange regarding inaccuracies on rent 

invoice; calculate proper per diem rental and forwarding same to 

Landlord and its Counsel; email exchange with current insurance broker 

regarding coverage obtained to date. 

05/03/2020 Sun  0.50 $262.50 $525.00  Receipt and review of email from Brent Keenan; response to email 

setting up conference call for Monday. 

05/04/2020 Mon  1.00 $525.00 $525.00  Telephone discussion with MM in advance of conference call with Brent 

Keenan of CEFL; conference call with MM and Brent Kenan of CEFL.; 

receipt and review of December 2019 FS for Eveley; follow-up with 

insurance brokers regarding replacement insurance 
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Philip H. Gennis (PGE) 

05/05/2020 Tues  1.00 $525.00 $525.00  Receipt and review of email from creditor of Eveley regarding overdue 

account; arranging for wire transfer of rent to May 7th upon receipt of 

borrowing from Brebt Keenan; receipt and review of email from 

Breckon Husband confirming that Chubb insurance is prepared to add 

the Receiver as an additional named insured on the existing policy 

which includes product liability;responding email to Breckon Husband 

requesting detailed summary of coverages and premium payable for 

each; email exchange with Lawrie Insurance Group requesting update 

on their efforts to obtain alternate insurance coverage for the interim 

receivership and ultimately the receivership; email exchange wqith 

FCA with respect to inventory and product l;iability coverage and 

being advised that inventory coverage would be available but 

product liability would not be made available. 

05/06/2020 Wed  1.25 $656.25 $525.00  Receipt and review of insurance proposal from current broker; email 

exchange with FCA regarding expanded coverage for inventory and 

product liability; telephone discussion with MM and DE regarding 

delivery of financial information; telephone discussion with CTEA (Don 

Moore) regarding member insurance programme with Travellers 

Insuranmce; telephone discussion with Brent Keenan regarding 

insurance costs, need for additional borrowing limit and lack of 

financial information; prepare and execute Receiver's Borrowing 

Certificate and transmittal to Brent Keenan  at CEFL; email to Gus 

Camellino regarding lack of cooperation from Dawn Eveley;telephone 

call with Canadian Transport Equipment Association(CTEA) regarding 

group insurance for member firms of which Eveley is one; email to 

Marsh Canada regarding CTEA Insurance Programme; email response 

to John regarding Huntsville Heated Mini Storage; responding email to 

Brendan Bissell regarding ability of customers to cancel orders 

notwithstanding IR Order; email exchange and telephone discussion 

with Brent Keenan; email to Brendan Bissell and Brent Keenan regarding 

Motion to increase borrowing limit;  

05/07/2020 Thur  0.75 $393.75 $525.00  Email exchange with Brent Keenan regarding status of investigation; 

email exchange with Dawn Eveley regarding timing of the provision of 

financial information; email exchange with Chad Brownles regarding 

potential alternate insurance coverage; email exchange with Altaz 

Bandali from March Canada regarding CTEA insurance products; email 

from Brendan Bissell regarding request for additional borrowing power 

and responding email;  

05/08/2020 Fri  1.00 $525.00 $525.00  Conference call with Marsh Canada and Brent Keenan regarding CTEA 

Group Insurance coverage only to find out that such was not available; 

telephone discussion with Brendan Bissell in response to my email to him 

yesterday; telephone discussion with Brent Keenan; Telephone 

discussion with Chad Brownless of Lawrie Insurance Group regarding 

alternative insurance; email to Breckon Husband requesting 

confirmation as to whether his insurer would consider issuing a six month 

policy with premiums being paid in two instalments as well as the cost 

to us for early cancellation in the event the insurance is no longer 

required; 

05/11/2020 Mon  0.50 $262.50 $525.00  Email exchange with insurance brokers with respect to replacement 

insurance for the Eveley IR; telephone discussion with Brekon Husband 

regarding Chubb policy; email exchange with Counsel with respect to 

additional borrowing power for IR;  
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Philip H. Gennis (PGE) 

05/12/2020 Tues  0.75 $393.75 $525.00  Email from Dawn Eveley extending delivery of financial information yet 

again; review of dated financial statements provided; telephone 

discussion with MM regarding delay; telephone discussion with Brendan 

Bissell; email from Receiver's Counsel requesting update on financial 

disclosure; email to Counsel for Company advising of further delay and 

expressing concern given the timelines for reporting under the IR Order;  

05/14/2020 Thur  0.50 $262.50 $525.00  Email from Landlord requesting copies of utility bills; email exchange 

with Counsel for Company; email exchange with Counsel for 

stakeholders regarding the challenges in obtaining appropriate 

financial information with supporting documentation; conference call 

with MM and Counsel for IR (Aversa and Nemers); receipt and review of 

draft letter from Counsel for IR to Counsel for Company regarding 

repetitive delays in providing necessary financial information with which 

to opine on the financial viability of the Company; review of comments 

suggested by MM to draft letter from IR Counsel to Company Counsel. 

05/15/2020 Fri  0.50 $262.50 $525.00  Email response from Counsel for the Company to IR Counsel's letter; 

email from Company's controller alleging miscommunication with 

respect to requested documentation;  review of draft response to Gus 

Camelino to his previous email regarding delays and purported 

miscommunication as to what IR required to opine on financial viability;  

05/16/2020 Sat  0.75 $393.75 $525.00  receipt and cursory review of A/R and AS/P Reports as at March 31 and 

internal Q1 Financial Statements; receipt and review of draft email to 

Sandra McDonald, controller for Company; receipt and review of 

Counsel comments to draft email; email exchange with Sandra 

McDonald with respect to financial information and responses to 

enquiries made by IR to the Company; receipt and cursory review of 6 

month forecast provided by controller at 10:30pm Saturday evening; 

05/17/2020 Sun  3.00 $1,575.00 $525.00  Draft V1 of IR Report without financial analysis. 

05/19/2020 Tues  1.00 $525.00 $525.00  Receipt and review of email exchange with Sandra McDonald, 

controller of Eveley; Telephone discussion with MM regarding email 

exchange with Sandra McDonald; conference call with Counsel 

regarding delays in company providing financial information and 

clarification of the information already provided; telephone discussion 

with FCA Insurance regarding on-going coverage.telephone discussion 

with Brekon Husband Company's current insurance broker regarding 

retention of existing insurance on a go-forward basis; email to Harvey 

Chaiton, Counsel for Landlord enquiring whether, if the Company paid 

up all arrears would the Landlord re-instate the lease and allow the 

Company to operate out of the current premises; receipt of emails from 

Perfection Liquidations and Infinity Assets; email from AON Insurance 

regarding payment of outstanding premiums. 

05/20/2020 Wed  1.00 $525.00 $525.00  Receipt and review of email exchange with Receiver's Counsel 

regarding willingness of Landlord to permit Company to re-lease 

premises as part of its effort at restructuring its financial circumstances; 

review of draft email from IR Counsel to Counsel for Debtor regarding 

compromise solution to permit finished goods to be shipped upon 

execution of release of any and all liability as against IR, given the 

absence of product liability insurance; email exchange with IR Counsel 

and Counsel for Landlord aimed at negotiating continued occupation 

in the event that the IR becomes a full Receiver; 
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Philip H. Gennis (PGE) 

05/21/2020 Thur  1.50 $787.50 $525.00  Conference call with Brendan Bissell, Ian Aversa, Jeremy Nemers and 

Mukul Manchanda regarding impendiong course of action transitioning 

IR to a full receivership; In excess of 24 emails exchanged between 

Counsel for IR, the IR, and Counsel for Eveley  regarding finished goods 

being shipped; receipt and review of waiver to be signed by all 

customers in advance of shipping finished goods which waiver absolves 

IR of any liability ensuring that the sale is being made on an "as-is, 

Where-is" basis; receipt and review of revised draft of Rsport of IR to 

Court dated May 17, 2020; receipt, verification and processing of 

payment of occupation costs to May 21st; cursory review of forecast 

provided by company controller; 

05/22/2020 Fri  0.50 $262.50 $525.00   Receipt and review of email from Counsel for CEFL to Counsel for 

Landlord and Company regarding transition from IR to fulll receivership 

and proposing terms of such transition; review of forecast delivered by 

Company to IR;  

05/25/2020 Mon  1.00 $525.00 $525.00  Internal discussion with MM regarding transition from IR to full 

receivership; call with IR Counsel regarding transition issues review of 

draft Occupation Agreement; review and comment upon final draft 

Receivership Order and potential for transitional Order continuing IR 

Order until final draft Receivership Order has been approved by 

stakerholders; conference call with Ian Aversa regarding scheduled 

hearing to appoint Receiver. 

 36.25 $18,931.25 Philip H. Gennis (PGE) 

Rashid Peeroo (RPR) 

05/11/2020 Mon  3.00 $600.00 $200.00  Travel to site for supervision of GFL bin removal. Walk through of 

property and locking up. Travel to office. 

05/22/2020 Fri  4.00 $800.00 $200.00  Travel to site for supervision of product shipping. Walked perimeter and 

locked up. Travel back to office. 

 7.00 $1,400.00 Rashid Peeroo (RPR) 

 115.55 $47,776.25 Total for File ID AAEVEL-R: 

Grand Total:  115.55 $47,776.25 
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Eveley International Corp. 

Invoice 

October 06, 2020 Invoice #: 11937 

RE: Eveley International Corp. 

 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED for the period September 1 to September 30, 2020 in connection with our 

appointment as Court-Appointed Receiver. 

Hours Hourly Rate Total   

$6,037.50 $525.00 Philip H. Gennis, LL.B., CIRP, LIT  11.50 

 157.50  525.00 Deborah Hornbostel, CPA, CA, CFE, CIRP,LIT  0.30 

 37.50  375.00 Gillian Goldblatt, CPA, CA, CIRP, LIT  0.10 

 2,251.50  395.00 Mukul Manchanda, CPA, CIRP, LIT  5.70 

 125.00  250.00 Eileen Sturge  0.50 

 640.00  200.00 Rashid Peeroo  3.20 

Others  27.50  6,025.00  219.09 

 48.80 $312.99 Total Professional fees $15,274.00 

 1,985.62 HST 

Reimbursable Expenses 

$31.27 PPSA Search 

$31.27 Total Reimbursable expenses 

HST on expenses $1.99 

Total $17,292.88 

HST Registration #R103478103 

(AAEVEL-R) 
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Deborah Hornbostel (DHO)

09/14/2020Mon  0.10 $52.50$525.00 Review and approve disbursements

09/22/2020Tues  0.10 $52.50$525.00 Review and approve disbursements

09/28/2020Mon  0.10 $52.50$525.00 Review and approve disbursements

 0.30 $157.50Deborah Hornbostel (DHO)

Eileen Sturge (EST)

09/02/2020Wed  0.50 $125.00$250.00 Admin on file

 0.50 $125.00Eileen Sturge (EST)

Frieda Kanaris (FKA)

09/02/2020Wed  2.50 $625.00$250.00 Exchange of emails re CRA audit; t/c with Dawn Eveley; prepare 

schedule of accounts receivable analysis with payments.

09/03/2020Thur  2.40 $600.00$250.00 Update schedule with payments received and email responses, 

scan and email statement and copies of invoices to account 

debtors; review emails re attending on site; t/c with Alectra Utilities 

re past due water bill.

09/04/2020Fri  5.00 $1,250.00$250.00 Travel to Eveley, meet and allow acces to Sandra (CFO) to 

prepare T4's.

09/08/2020Tues  0.50 $125.00$250.00 Emails to Jason re pick-up of vending machine; exchange of 

emails with PG; email to RBC requesting bank statements; t/c with 

Dawn re attending on site; email to Sandra re WEPPA.

09/10/2020Thur  2.50 $625.00$250.00 Travel to Eveley to oversee removal of vending machine and 

employee personal belongings.

09/11/2020Fri  1.50 $375.00$250.00 T/c from Andrew Clinkard (CRA auditor); review and respond to 

email from PG re payroll and HST audits; emails and t/c's with PG; 

send fax to RBC re statements; send email to BNS re closing bank 

accounts and request for statements; review A/R, t/c and fax to 

Innovated, t/c and email to Ridewell.

09/15/2020Tues  0.30 $75.00$250.00 Review and respond to email re WEPPA, forward schedule.

09/16/2020Wed  0.40 $100.00$250.00 Review and requisition payment for payables; review and deposit 

A/R cheque.

09/21/2020Mon  1.20 $300.00$250.00 T/c's to BMO branch, review bank statements for bank draft 

information, prepare letter and fax to BMO.

09/22/2020Tues  0.70 $175.00$250.00 Forward T4's and summary, HST returns, bank statements to CRA, t/c 

from Andrew Clinkard (auditor), subsequent email to PG re missing 

information.

09/23/2020Wed  0.50 $125.00$250.00 Forward missing documents to CRA; t/c from Andrew (CRA 

auditor), email to PG re PD7A missing reports.

09/28/2020Mon  0.50 $125.00$250.00 Review email and forward documents to CRA for payroll audit; 

review and requisition payment for payables.

09/30/2020Wed  2.50 $625.00$250.00 Travel to premises to allow access to Sandra, needed to reboot 

online access.

 20.50 $5,125.00Frieda Kanaris (FKA)

Gillian Goldblatt (GGO)

09/08/2020Tues  0.10 $37.50$375.00 review and approve disbursements.

 0.10 $37.50Gillian Goldblatt (GGO)

Haran Sivanathan (HSI)

09/01/2020Tues  1.40 $210.00$150.00 General

09/03/2020Thur  0.50 $75.00$150.00 General

 1.90 $285.00Haran Sivanathan (HSI)

Inga Friptuleac (IFR)
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Inga Friptuleac (IFR)

08/31/2020Mon  0.20 $25.00$125.00 Issue cheque

09/21/2020Mon  0.20 $25.00$125.00 Issue cheque

09/28/2020Mon  0.20 $25.00$125.00 Issue cheques 

 0.60 $75.00Inga Friptuleac (IFR)

Mukul Manchanda (MMA)

09/01/2020Tues  0.80 $316.00$395.00 Participated in a conference call with B. Bissell, I. Aversa, J. Nemers 

and P. Gennis.

09/02/2020Wed  1.00 $395.00$395.00 Review of email exchanges regarding preparation of T4s and 

conducting WEPPA. Receipt and review of an email from B. 

Keenan regarding the accounts receivable. Reviewed and noted 

that variances. Multiple email exchanges regarding the accounts 

receivables.

09/03/2020Thur  0.20 $79.00$395.00 Receipt and review of an email from F. Kanaris with respect to the 

accounts receivable. Receipt, review and approve cheque 

requisition.

09/04/2020Fri  0.30 $118.50$395.00 Review of email exchanges between J. Munt and F. Kanaris 

regarding removal of the vending machine. Email exchanges with 

B. Boocock regarding accounts receivable.

09/08/2020Tues  1.40 $553.00$395.00 Receipt, review and approve payables. Receipt and review of 

multiple emails from B. Boocock containing banking records and 

other financial information. Participated in a conference call with 

I. Aversa, B. Bissell, J. Nemers and P. Gennis regarding the APS.

09/11/2020Fri  0.50 $197.50$395.00 Conference call with P. Gennis, Brent Keenan and Brendan Bissell.

09/14/2020Mon  0.10 $39.50$395.00 Receipt, review and approve payable.

09/18/2020Fri  0.50 $197.50$395.00 Receipt and review of an email from B. Bissell containing 

comments to the draft APS.

09/22/2020Tues  0.10 $39.50$395.00 Receipt, review and approve payable.

09/23/2020Wed  0.50 $197.50$395.00 Participated in a conference call with I. Aversa, J. Nemers and P. 

Gennis regarding the APS.

09/24/2020Thur  0.20 $79.00$395.00 Prepared information requested by Gus and emailed same to I. 

Aversa.

09/28/2020Mon  0.10 $39.50$395.00 Receipt, review and approve payables.

 5.70 $2,251.50Mukul Manchanda (MMA)

Philip H. Gennis (PGE)

09/01/2020Tues  1.00 $525.00$525.00 Review of revised Projections and SRD and attend conference call 

with Receiver's Counsel, Mukul Manchanda and Brendan Bissell, 

Counsel for CEFL targeting completion of the APS between CEFL 

and the Receiver; processing payables for realty taxes; email 

exchange with former customer of Eveley;

09/02/2020Wed  0.50 $262.50$525.00 Email exchange regarding CRA Field Audits for HST and ETD; email 

exchange with Brent Keenan regarding AR Listing; several 

follow-up emails in this regard;

09/03/2020Thur  0.50 $262.50$525.00 Email exchange with Brent Keenan and arranging for Access to 

the site for September 4th; receipt and review of AR Schedule and 

payments received by Eveley directly;

09/04/2020Fri  0.50 $262.50$525.00 Email exchange with KPMG regarding wage arrears, WEPP and AR 

issues.
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Philip H. Gennis (PGE)

09/08/2020Tues  1.00 $525.00$525.00 Receipt and review of emails from KPMG with bank statements 

attached; tlephone discussion with Receiver's Counsel and 

Counsel for CEFL; email requesting access to CFO so as to enable 

preparation of WEPP schedule; email to Brooke Babcock regarding 

need for payroll access so as to enable WEPP schedule to be 

prepared;

09/09/2020Wed  0.50 $262.50$525.00 Receipt and review of email from Brooke Boocock from KPMG 

regarding submission of T4s and T4 Summary for Eveley; process 

cheque payable to Brent Keenan as reimbursemen for  payment 

for payroll software

09/10/2020Thur  1.00 $525.00$525.00 Receipt and review of email from Brooke Boocock enclosing BMO 

bank statements and preliminary review of same; email exchange 

with bidder on assets; receipt and review of email from Brooke 

Boocock regarding a number of issues related to CRA audits; email 

from FK confirming her discussions with CRA regarding audit 

requirements; drafting response to email to Brooke Boocock in this 

regard;

09/11/2020Fri  0.50 $262.50$525.00 Conference call with MM, Brent Keenan and Brendan Bissell.

09/14/2020Mon  1.00 $525.00$525.00 Receipt and review of multiple emails from Brooke Boocock 

enclosing unadjusted payroll payroll and T4 data; adjusted T4 and 

payroll information;email exchange with Benny DiFranco regarding 

outstaning AR with innovative trailer; receipt and review of 

updated AR Report;

09/15/2020Tues  1.00 $525.00$525.00 Call with Brendan Bissell;  email exchange with Harvey Chaiton 

regarding outstanding AR owing by Benny DiFranco (Harvey 

agreeing to discuss with his client and get back to me);email 

exchange with Receiver's Counsel confirming that Harvey Chaiton 

had not signed NDA; email exchange with Brooke Boocock 

regarding outstanding issues relative to CRA;forwarding WEPP 

worksheet to Brooke Boocock for completion by CFO;

09/16/2020Wed  0.50 $262.50$525.00 Email exchange with Brooke Boocock regarding T4 Summary;email 

exchange with Receiver's Counsel regarding his discussion with 

Brendan Bissell and timing for APS markup;

09/17/2020Thur  0.50 $262.50$525.00 Email exchanges with a number of bidders requesting confirmation 

of ststus of sales process and their respective bids;

09/18/2020Fri  1.50 $787.50$525.00 Receipt and review of blackline APS from Counsel for CEFL;

09/19/2020Sat  0.50 $262.50$525.00 Receipt and review of WEPP worksheet.

09/22/2020Tues  0.50 $262.50$525.00 Email exchanges regarding outstanding documents required by 

CRA to complete audits.email and telephone exchanges with 

bidders in the sales process.

09/23/2020Wed  0.00 $0.00$525.00 General

09/29/2020Tues  0.50 $262.50$525.00 Receipt and review of emails from KPMG with respect to 

documents required by CRA.

 11.50 $6,037.50Philip H. Gennis (PGE)

Rashid Peeroo (RPR)

08/27/2020Thur  3.00 $600.00$200.00 Travel to site granting access to former Eveley personnel. Lock up 

and travel back. 

08/28/2020Fri  0.20 $40.00$200.00 Phone call with Brent Keenan and Phil Gennis regarding evely site 

visit on 8/27. 

 3.20 $640.00Rashid Peeroo (RPR)

Susan Downey (SDW)

09/21/2020Mon  2.00 $240.00$120.00 Preparing WEPPA letter to employees, review WEPPA Excel 

calculation sheet.
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Susan Downey (SDW)

09/22/2020Tues  2.50 $300.00$120.00 Preparing WEPPA docs./letters

 4.50 $540.00Susan Downey (SDW)

 48.80 $15,274.00Total for File ID AAEVEL-R:

Grand Total:  48.80 $15,274.00
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Court File No. CV-20-00639897-00CL 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

COMMERCIAL LIST 

BETWEEN: 

CANADIAN EQUIPMENT FINANCE & LEASING INC. 
 

Applicant 
 

- and -  
 

EVELEY INTERNATIONAL CORPORATION 
 

Respondent 
 

APPLICATION UNDER subsection 47(1) of the Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act 

 
 

AFFIDAVIT OF DAMIAN LU 
(sworn November 2, 2020) 

 
 I, DAMIAN LU, of the City of Toronto, in the Province of Ontario, MAKE OATH 

AND SAY AS FOLLOWS: 

1. I am a lawyer at Aird & Berlis LLP and, as such, I have knowledge of the matters to 

which I hereinafter depose.  Aird & Berlis LLP is acting as counsel for msi Spergel inc., 

in its capacities as interim receiver     Interim Receiver and 

receiver     Receiver    all the assets, 

undertakings and properties of Eveley International Corporation Eveley

or used in relation to a business carried on by Eveley. 

2. Aird & Berlis LLP has prepared statements of account in connection with its mandate as 

counsel to the Interim Receiver and the Receiver, respectively, detailing its services 

rendered and disbursements incurred, namely:  

(a) an account dated May 29, 2020 in the amount of $33,951.31 in respect of the 

period from April 22, 2020 to May 25, 2020;  
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(b) an account dated June 25, 2020 in the amount of $35,791.62 in respect of the 

period from May 26, 2020 to June 23, 2020; 

(c) an account dated July 31, 2020 in the amount of $8,580.09 in respect of the period 

from June 20, 2020, 2020 to July 28, 2020; 

(d) an account dated August 28, 2020 in the amount of $18,569.95 in respect of the 

period from July 29, 2020 to August 25, 2020; 

(e) an account dated September 30, 2020 in the amount of $12,428.87 in respect of 

the period from August 26, 2020 to September 30, 2020; and 

(f) an account dated October 30, 2020 in the amount of $16,891.24 in respect of the 

period from October 1, 2020 to October 27, 2020, 

 Statements of Account  Attached hereto and marked as   to this 

Affidavit are copies of the Statements of Account.  The average hourly rate of Aird & 

Berlis LLP is $558.19. 

3. Attached hereto and marked as   to this Affidavit is a chart detailing the 

lawyers, law clerks and articling students who have worked on this matter. 

4. This Affidavit is made in support of a motion to, inter alia, approve the attached accounts 

of Aird & Berlis LLP and the fees and disbursements detailed therein, and for no 

improper purpose whatsoever. 

SWORN before me at the City of  ) 
Toronto, in the Province of Ontario ) 
this 2nd day of November, 2020 ) 
     ) _________________________________ 
     )                       DAMIAN LU 
________________________ ) 
A commissioner, etc. 
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A 
 

Referred to in the 
 

AFFIDAVIT OF DAMIAN LU 
 

Sworn before me 
 

this 2nd day of November, 2020 
 

_____________________________ 
 
 

Commissioner for taking Affidavits, etc 
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IN ACCOUNT WITH:   

Brookfield Place, 181 Bay Street, Suite 1800 
Toronto, Ontario, Canada  M5J 2T9 
T 416.863.1500   F 416.863.1515 

airdberlis.com 

msi Spergel inc. 
200-505 Consumers Road 
North York, ON 
M2J 4V8

Attention: Mr. Philip H. Gennis  Account No.: 672025 

PLEASE WRITE ACCOUNT NUMBERS 
ON THE BACK OF ALL CHEQUES 

File No.: 13225/156859

May 29, 2020 

Re: Interim Receivership of Eveley International Corporation  

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED on your behalf throughout the period ended May 25, 2020

LAWYER DATE RATE/ 
HOUR

TIME VALUE DESCRIPTION

IEA 
_

22/04/20
_

$625.00)
_

    4.50
_

$2,812.50)
_

Several telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with B. Bissell and 
clients; Engaged with reviewing the 
draft order and providing comments; 
Emails and discussions re same  
_

JEM 
_

22/04/20
_

$240.00)
_

    0.30
_

$72.00)
_

Order, review and report on profiles 
and PPSA searches  
_

IEA 
_

23/04/20
_

$625.00)
_

    6.30
_

$3,937.50)
_

Engaged with reviewing the draft 
form of order and providing 
comments and emails and 
discussions with counsel and client 
regarding same; Attend the hearing; 
Several telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with client, counsel and 
J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

23/04/20
_

$435.00)
_

    2.90
_

$1,261.50)
_

Receipt and review of interim 
receiver application materials; 
Engaged with drafting of and 
revisions to occupation agreement; 
Discussions with I. Aversa re same; 
Email exchanges with working 
group; Attend to related matters as 
needed  

_
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AIRD & BERLIS LLP 
PAGE 2 OF ACCOUNT NO. 672025

LAWYER DATE RATE/ 
HOUR

TIME VALUE DESCRIPTION

IEA 
_

24/04/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.10
_

$687.50)
_

Telephone call, emails and 
discussions with clients, counsel and 
J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

24/04/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.70
_

$304.50)
_

Attend on conference call with client 
re draft occupation agreement; 
Engaged with revisions to same; 
Email to H. Chaiton re same; Email 
exchanges with stakeholders; Attend 
to matters re service list  
_

IEA 
_

25/04/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.00
_

$625.00)
_

Telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with clients, counsel and 
J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

25/04/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Email exchanges with working group  
_

IEA 
_

26/04/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.50
_

$312.50)
_

Telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with clients, counsel and 
J. Nemers  
_

IEA 
_

27/04/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.00
_

$625.00)
_

Engaged with reviewing revised 
draft of occupation agreement and 
emails and discussions with 
counsel, clients and J. Nemers re 
same; Telephone call, emails and 
discussions with counsel, client and 
J. Nemers re update and next steps  
_

JTN 
_

27/04/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.20
_

$87.00)
_

Email exchanges with working 
group; Receipt and review of 
comments from H. Chaiton re draft 
occupation agreement; Consider 
same  
_

IEA 
_

28/04/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.80
_

$500.00)
_

Telephone call, emails and 
discussions with client, counsel and 
J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

28/04/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.20
_

$87.00)
_

Email exchanges with client and 
working group re insurance, access 
and related matters  
_

IEA 
_

29/04/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.70
_

$437.50)
_

Telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

29/04/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.60
_

$261.00)
_

Email exchanges with working 
group; Engaged with drafting of 
acknowledgment form re COVID-
related matters  
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AIRD & BERLIS LLP 
PAGE 3 OF ACCOUNT NO. 672025

LAWYER DATE RATE/ 
HOUR

TIME VALUE DESCRIPTION

_
IEA 
_

30/04/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.20
_

$125.00)
_

Emails and discussions with 
counsel, clients and J. Nemers  
_

IEA 
_

01/05/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.40
_

$250.00)
_

Telephone call, emails and 
discussions with clients and J. 
Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

01/05/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Email exchange with P. Gennis re 
status and next steps  
_

IEA 
_

02/05/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.30
_

$187.50)
_

Emails and discussions with client, 
counsel and J. Nemers  
_

IEA 
_

05/05/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.20
_

$125.00)
_

Emails and discussions with clients 
and J. Nemers  
_

IEA 
_

06/05/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.20
_

$125.00)
_

Emails and discussions with client  
_

IEA 
_

07/05/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.30
_

$187.50)
_

Telephone call, emails and 
discussions with client and J. 
Nemers  
_

IEA 
_

11/05/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.20
_

$125.00)
_

Emails and discussions with clients 
and J. Nemers  
_

IEA 
_

12/05/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.30
_

$187.50)
_

Emails and discussions with 
counsel, clients and J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

12/05/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.30
_

$130.50)
_

Discussion with I. Aversa and email 
exchanges with client and working 
group re status and next steps re 
report and related matters  
_

JTN 
_

13/05/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Follow-up discussion with I. Aversa 
re status and next steps  
_

IEA 
_

14/05/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.50
_

$937.50)
_

Telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with clients, counsel and 
J. Nemers and reviewing and 
revising draft correspondence  
_

JTN 
_

14/05/20
_

$435.00)
_

    1.90
_

$826.50)
_

Email exchanges with client re 
outstanding information; Attend on 
conference call with client re same; 
Engaged with drafting of letter to 
debtor's counsel re same; Receipt 
and review of client comments re 
same; Engaged with revisions; 
Engaged with issuance of letter; 
Attend to related matters as needed 
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AIRD & BERLIS LLP 
PAGE 4 OF ACCOUNT NO. 672025

LAWYER DATE RATE/ 
HOUR

TIME VALUE DESCRIPTION

_
IEA 
_

15/05/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.00
_

$625.00)
_

Telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with counsel, client and 
J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

15/05/20
_

$435.00)
_

    1.30
_

$565.50)
_

Receipt and review of emails from 
G. Camelino and his client; Consider 
same; Email exchanges and attend 
on conference call with client re 
same and next steps; Prepare draft 
responding email; Revise same 
based on client comments; Issue 
same 
_

IEA 
_

16/05/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.00
_

$625.00)
_

Telephone call, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients, 
Sandra and J. Nemers and 
reviewing materials and documents 
from Sandra  
_

JTN 
_

16/05/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.70
_

$304.50)
_

Receipt and review of email and 
attachments from S. McDonald; 
Consider same; Receipt and review 
of draft email from M. Manchanda; 
Email to client re same; Email 
exchanges with client, S. McDonald 
and B. Bissell  
_

IEA 
_

17/05/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.40
_

$250.00)
_

Emails and discussions with 
counsel, clients, Sandra and J. 
Nemers and reviewing materials and 
documents from Sandra  
_

JTN 
_

17/05/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Email exchanges with working group 
re status  
_

IEA 
_

18/05/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.30
_

$187.50)
_

Emails and discussions with clients, 
counsel and J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

18/05/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Further email exchanges with 
working group re status  
_

IEA 
_

19/05/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.80
_

$500.00)
_

Telephone call, emails and 
discussions with clients and J. 
Nemers and reviewing documents 
and correspondence from the 
company  
_

JTN 
_

19/05/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.30
_

$130.50)
_

Email exchanges with working 
group; Telephone call with client  
_
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PAGE 5 OF ACCOUNT NO. 672025

LAWYER DATE RATE/ 
HOUR

TIME VALUE DESCRIPTION

IEA 
_

20/05/20
_

$625.00)
_

    2.50
_

$1,562.50)
_

Several telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

20/05/20
_

$435.00)
_

    2.60
_

$1,131.00)
_

Email exchanges with working 
group; Attend on conference calls 
with client; Prepare and issue 
lengthy email to debtor's counsel re 
product shipments and related 
matters; Engaged with review of, 
revisions to and further drafting of 
template disclaimer re same; 
Telephone call with debtor's 
counsel; Discussions with I. Aversa; 
Attend to related matters as needed  
_

IEA 
_

21/05/20
_

$625.00)
_

    3.40
_

$2,125.00)
_

Several telephone conversations, 
emails and discussions with clients, 
counsel and J. Nemers; Engaged 
with reviewing and revising the draft 
report and coordinating service and 
filing of same  
_

DL 
_

21/05/20
_

$295.00)
_

    0.80
_

$236.00)
_

Prepare first report of interim 
receiver; serve same  
_

JTN 
_

21/05/20
_

$435.00)
_

    5.00
_

$2,175.00)
_

Engaged with review of, revisions to 
and further drafting of First Report; 
Email exchanges and telephone 
calls with client re same; Instruct D. 
Lu re compilation of appendices; 
Engaged with review of email 
appendices and redactions thereto; 
Attend on conference call with client 
and B. Bissell; Email exchanges with 
G. Camelino; Arrange for service of 
First Report; Email to His Honour 
and Court office re First Report; 
Attend to related matters as needed  
_

IEA 
_

22/05/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.30
_

$187.50)
_

Emails and discussions with 
counsel, clients and J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

22/05/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.20
_

$87.00)
_

Receipt and review of emails from B. 
Bissell and H. Chaiton re status; 
Discussion with I. Aversa re same 
and next steps  
_

IEA 
_

23/05/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.30
_

$187.50)
_

Emails and discussions with 
counsel, clients and J. Nemers  
_
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PAGE 6 OF ACCOUNT NO. 672025

LAWYER DATE RATE/ 
HOUR

TIME VALUE DESCRIPTION

JTN 
_

23/05/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Email exchanges with client  
_

IEA 
_

24/05/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.40
_

$250.00)
_

Emails and discussions with clients, 
counsel and J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

24/05/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Email exchanges with client  
_

IEA 
_

25/05/20
_

$625.00)
_

    3.50
_

$2,187.50)
_

Several telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with clients, counsel and 
J. Nemers; Engaged with reviewing 
draft version of the court materials 
and related documents and emails 
and discussions regarding same  
_

JTN 
_

25/05/20
_

$435.00)
_

    2.50
_

$1,087.50)
_

Email exchanges and telephone call 
with client; Email exchanges and 
telephone call with B. Bissell; 
Engaged with review of, revisions to 
and further drafting of proposed 
receivership order; Engaged with 
drafting of second occupancy 
agreement; Attend to related matters 
as needed  
_

TOTAL: 54.60 $29,926.50)

Name Hours Rate Value

Ian E. Aversa (IEA)    33.40 $625.00) $20,875.00)
Jenaya E. McLean (JEM)     0.30 $240.00) $72.00)
Jeremy T. Nemers (JTN)    20.10 $435.00) $8,743.50)
Damian Lu (DL)     0.80 $295.00) $236.00)

OUR FEE $29,926.50)
HST at 13% $3,890.45)

DISBURSEMENTS

COST INCURRED ON YOUR BEHALF AS AN AGENT 

Search Under P.P.S.A. $40.00)

Subject to HST 

Service Provider Fee $47.50)
Corporate Search $36.00)

Total Disbursements $83.50)
HST at 13% $10.86)
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AMOUNT NOW DUE  $33,951.31)

THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT HEREIN   
Aird & Berlis LLP  

Ian E Aversa  

E.&O.E. 

PAYMENT OF THIS ACCOUNT IS DUE ON RECEIPT 

IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE SOLICITORS ACT, ONTARIO, INTEREST WILL BE CHARGED AT THE RATE OF 2.0% PER ANNUM ON 
UNPAID AMOUNTS CALCULATED FROM A DATE THAT IS ONE MONTH AFTER THIS ACCOUNT IS DELIVERED. 

GST / HST Registration # 12184 6539 RT0001 

NOTE:  This account may be paid by wire transfer in Canadian funds to our account at The Toronto-Dominion Bank, TD Centre, 55 King Street West, Toronto, 
Ontario, M5K 1A2. Account number 5221521, Transit number 10202, Swift Code TDOMCATTTOR. Please include the account number as reference. 

40142916.1 
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IN ACCOUNT WITH:   

Brookfield Place, 181 Bay Street, Suite 1800 
Toronto, Ontario, Canada  M5J 2T9 
T 416.863.1500   F 416.863.1515 

airdberlis.com 

msi Spergel inc. 
200-505 Consumers Road 
North York, ON 
M2J 4V8

Attention: Mr. Philip H. Gennis  Invoice No.: 674841 

PLEASE WRITE INVOICE NUMBERS 
ON THE BACK OF ALL CHEQUES 
File No.: 13225/156859 
Client No.: 13225 
Matter No.: 156859

June 25, 2020 

Re: Receivership of Eveley International Corporation  

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED on your behalf throughout the period ended June 23, 2020

LAWYER DATE RATE/ 
HOUR

TIME VALUE DESCRIPTION

IEA 
_

26/05/20
_

$625.00)
_

    3.50
_

$2,187.50)
_

Telephone call, emails and 
discussions re the hearing; Attend 
the hearing; Telephone calls, emails 
and discussions with counsel, clients 
and J. Nemers re the draft form of 
order  
_

JTN 
_

26/05/20
_

$435.00)
_

    1.00
_

$435.00)
_

Attend at hearing; Engaged with 
revisions to and negotiations 
regarding draft Order; Email 
exchanges and discussions with 
working group  
_

IEA 
_

27/05/20
_

$625.00)
_

    4.60
_

$2,875.00)
_

Several telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with counsel, client and 
J. Nemers; Engaged with reviewing 
the draft order and draft occupation 
agreement and providing comments; 
Emails and discussions re same  
_

JTN 
_

27/05/20
_

$435.00)
_

    2.30
_

$1,000.50)
_

Email exchanges and telephone 
calls with client and other members 
of working group re draft occupation 
agreement and draft Order; 
Engaged with several sets of 
revisions to draft occupation 
agreement; Discussions with I. 
Aversa re same; Attend to related 
matters as needed  
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LAWYER DATE RATE/ 
HOUR

TIME VALUE DESCRIPTION

_
IEA 
_

28/05/20
_

$625.00)
_

    4.00
_

$2,500.00)
_

Several telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers; Attend the hearing; 
Telephone calls, emails and 
discussions re the hearing and next 
steps  
_

JTN 
_

28/05/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.90
_

$391.50)
_

Attend on conference calls and to 
emails re today's hearing and next 
steps  
_

IEA 
_

29/05/20
_

$625.00)
_

    2.00
_

$1,250.00)
_

Telephone call, and discussions with 
counsel, clients and J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

29/05/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.20
_

$87.00)
_

Telephone call with B. Bissell re 
status update  
_

IEA 
_

01/06/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.50
_

$312.50)
_

Emails and discussions with 
counsel, clients and J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

01/06/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Discussion with I. Aversa re next 
steps  
_

IEA 
_

02/06/20
_

$625.00)
_

    4.00
_

$2,500.00)
_

Several telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers; Engaged with reviewing 
and revising the draft occupation 
agreement and draft order and 
emails and discussions re same  
_

JTN 
_

02/06/20
_

$435.00)
_

    1.10
_

$478.50)
_

Attend on conference call with client; 
Engaged with review of further draft 
revisions to occupation agreement 
and order; Telephone call with I. 
Aversa re same  
_

IEA 
_

03/06/20
_

$625.00)
_

    4.00
_

$2,500.00)
_

Several telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers; Engaged with reviewing 
draft court documents and related 
materials and providing comments  
_

JTN 
_

03/06/20
_

$435.00)
_

    2.00
_

$870.00)
_

Email exchanges with working group 
re tomorrow's court attendance; 
Engaged with drafting of discharge 
order; Attend on conference call with 
client; Attend on conference call with 
B. Bissell; Attend to related matters 
as needed 
_

234



AIRD & BERLIS LLP 
PAGE 3 OF INVOICE NO. 674841

LAWYER DATE RATE/ 
HOUR

TIME VALUE DESCRIPTION

IEA 
_

04/06/20
_

$625.00)
_

    3.60
_

$2,250.00)
_

Telephone call, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers; Attend the hearing; 
Several telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers re same; Engaged with 
reviewing and revising draft 
discharge order  
_

JTN 
_

04/06/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.30
_

$130.50)
_

Email exchanges with working group 
re draft endorsement and related 
matters; Receipt and review of draft 
endorsement and proposed changes 
to same  
_

IEA 
_

05/06/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.00
_

$625.00)
_

Telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with counsel, client and 
J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

05/06/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Receipt and review of emails from 
working group re status  
_

JTN 
_

06/06/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Receipt and review of email to 
service list from B. Bissell re His 
Honour's endorsement  
_

IEA 
_

07/06/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.20
_

$125.00)
_

Engaged with reviewing the 
endorsement of Justice McEwen 
and emails and discussions 
regarding same  
_

IEA 
_

09/06/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.20
_

$125.00)
_

Emails and discussions with client, 
counsel and J. Nemers  
_

IEA 
_

10/06/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.30
_

$187.50)
_

Emails and discussions with clients, 
counsel and J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

10/06/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Email exchange with client re 
continued failure to respond by 
debtor  
_

IEA 
_

11/06/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.20
_

$125.00)
_

Emails and discussions with 
counsel, clients and J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

11/06/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Email to debtor re outstanding 
matters  
_

IEA 
_

12/06/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.00
_

$625.00)
_

Telephone call, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers  
_
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LAWYER DATE RATE/ 
HOUR

TIME VALUE DESCRIPTION

JTN 
_

12/06/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.20
_

$87.00)
_

Receipt and review of email from B. 
Keenan; Email exchange with client; 
Voicemail from G. Camelino  
_

IEA 
_

15/06/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.00
_

$625.00)
_

Emails and discussions with 
counsel, clients and J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

15/06/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Receipt and review of email from B. 
Keenan  
_

IEA 
_

16/06/20
_

$625.00)
_

    2.00
_

$1,250.00)
_

Telephone call, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

16/06/20
_

$435.00)
_

    1.30
_

$565.50)
_

Receipt and review of email from 
client re status update; Attend on 
conference call with client; Attend on 
telephone call with B. Bissell  
_

IEA 
_

17/06/20
_

$625.00)
_

    2.00
_

$1,250.00)
_

Telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

17/06/20
_

$435.00)
_

    1.30
_

$565.50)
_

Receipt and review of further follow-
up email from M. Manchanda to 
borrower's principal; Receipt and 
review of draft marketing and sale 
process; Consider same; Email 
exchanges with H. Chaiton; 
Telephone call with I. Aversa; Email 
to parties re marketing and sale 
process; Engaged with drafting of 
confidentiality agreement 
_

IEA 
_

18/06/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.50
_

$937.50)
_

Telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

18/06/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.30
_

$130.50)
_

Email exchanges with working 
group; Telephone call with I. Aversa; 
Finalize and issue confidentiality 
agreement for proposed lender  
_

IEA 
_

19/06/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.00
_

$625.00)
_

Telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

19/06/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Receipt and review of executed 
NDA from potential lender  
_

JTN 20/06/20 $435.00)     0.10 $43.50) Email exchanges with client  
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LAWYER DATE RATE/ 
HOUR

TIME VALUE DESCRIPTION

_ _ _ _ _ _
IEA 
_

21/06/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.40
_

$250.00)
_

Telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

21/06/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.30
_

$130.50)
_

Telephone call with I. Aversa re 
status, Wednesday's hearing and 
next steps  
_

IEA 
_

22/06/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.70
_

$1,062.50)
_

Telephone calls emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

22/06/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.20
_

$87.00)
_

Email exchanges with client and B. 
Bissell 
_

IEA 
_

23/06/20
_

$625.00)
_

    3.00
_

$1,875.00)
_

Several telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers; Engaged with reviewing 
the draft court materials and 
providing comments; several emails 
and discussions re same  
_

JTN 
_

23/06/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.70
_

$304.50)
_

Email exchanges with working 
group; Telephone call with I. Aversa; 
Engaged with revisions to draft 
Order and draft occupation 
agreement 
_

TOTAL: 54.60 $31,674.00)

Name Hours Rate Value

Ian E. Aversa (IEA)    41.70 $625.00) $26,062.50)
Jeremy T. Nemers (JTN)    12.90 $435.00) $5,611.50)

OUR FEE $31,674.00)
HST at 13% $4,117.62)

AMOUNT NOW DUE  $35,791.62)
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THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT HEREIN   
Aird & Berlis LLP  

Ian E Aversa  

E.&O.E. 

PAYMENT OF THIS ACCOUNT IS DUE ON RECEIPT 

IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE SOLICITORS ACT, ONTARIO, INTEREST WILL BE CHARGED AT THE RATE OF 2.0% PER ANNUM ON 
UNPAID AMOUNTS CALCULATED FROM A DATE THAT IS ONE MONTH AFTER THIS ACCOUNT IS DELIVERED. 

GST / HST Registration # 12184 6539 RT0001 

NOTE:  This account may be paid by wire transfer in Canadian funds to our account at The Toronto-Dominion Bank, TD Centre, 55 King Street West, Toronto, 
Ontario, M5K 1A2. Account number 5221521, Transit number 10202, Swift Code TDOMCATTTOR. Please include the account number as reference. 

40525623.1 
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IN ACCOUNT WITH:   

Brookfield Place, 181 Bay Street, Suite 1800 
Toronto, Ontario, Canada  M5J 2T9 
T 416.863.1500   F 416.863.1515 

airdberlis.com 

msi Spergel inc. 
200-505 Consumers Road 
North York, ON 
M2J 4V8

Attention: Mr. Philip H. Gennis  Invoice No.: 678077 

PLEASE WRITE INVOICE NUMBERS 
ON THE BACK OF ALL CHEQUES 
File No.: 13225/156859 
Client No.: 13225 
Matter No.: 156859

July 31, 2020 

Re: Receivership of Eveley International Corporation  

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED on your behalf throughout the period ended July 28, 2020

LAWYER DATE RATE/ 
HOUR

TIME VALUE DESCRIPTION

IEA 
_

20/06/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.20
_

$125.00)
_

Emails and discussions with clients, 
counsel and J. Nemers  
_

IEA 
_

24/06/20
_

$625.00)
_

    2.50
_

$1,562.50)
_

Several telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with clients, counsel and 
J. Nemers; Engaged with reviewing 
the draft court materials and 
providing comments; Emails and 
discussions re same  
_

JTN 
_

24/06/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.20
_

$87.00)
_

Email exchanges with working group 
re today's hearing and order and 
occupation agreement 
_

IEA 
_

25/06/20
_

$625.00)
_

    2.00
_

$1,250.00)
_

Telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

25/06/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.20
_

$87.00)
_

Email exchanges with working group 
and client re Order, related matters 
and sale process 
_

IEA 
_

26/06/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.50
_

$937.50)
_

Emails and discussions with 
counsel, clients and J. Nemers  
_ 
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LAWYER DATE RATE/ 
HOUR

TIME VALUE DESCRIPTION

JTN 
_

26/06/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.40
_

$174.00)
_

Engaged with review of, revisions to 
and further drafting of request for 
expressions of interest; Email 
exchanges with I. Aversa and client 
re same  
_

IEA 
_

27/06/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.50
_

$312.50)
_

Emails and discussions with clients, 
counsel and J. Nemers and 
reviewing draft agreement of 
purchase and sale  
_

JTN 
_

27/06/20
_

$435.00)
_

    1.00
_

$435.00)
_

Engaged with drafting of agreement 
of purchase and sale and schedule 
thereto; Email to I. Aversa re same  
_

IEA 
_

29/06/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.00
_

$625.00)
_

Emails and discussions with clients, 
counsel and J. Nemers and 
reviewing draft APA and providing 
comments  
_

JTN 
_

29/06/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.20
_

$87.00)
_

Email exchange with client re and 
engaged with review of Insolvency 
Insider posting; Email exchange with 
I. Aversa re draft APS; Email to 
client re same 
_

IEA 
_

30/06/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.00
_

$625.00)
_

Telephone call, emails and 
discussions with clients, counsel and 
J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

30/06/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Email exchanges with client and I. 
Aversa  
_

IEA 
_

06/07/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.20
_

$125.00)
_

Emails and discussions with client 
and J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

06/07/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Email exchange with client re status 
update  
_

IEA 
_

10/07/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.20
_

$125.00)
_

Emails and discussions with 
counsel, clients and J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

10/07/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Receipt and review of email from B. 
Keenan  
_

IEA 
_

13/07/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.50
_

$312.50)
_

Telephone call, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers   

_
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LAWYER DATE RATE/ 
HOUR

TIME VALUE DESCRIPTION

JTN 
_

13/07/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.20
_

$87.00)
_

Email exchange and telephone call 
with client re email received from B. 
Keenan  
_

IEA 
_

23/07/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.20
_

$125.00)
_

Emails and discussions with client re 
update and next steps  
_

JTN 
_

23/07/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Email exchange with H. Chaiton  
_

IEA 
_

24/07/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.20
_

$125.00)
_

Emails and discussions with 
counsel, client and J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

24/07/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Email to P. Gennis re occupation 
agreement  
_

IEA 
_

28/07/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.20
_

$125.00)
_

Emails and discussions with clients, 
counsel and J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

28/07/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Receipt and review of email from B. 
Bissell  
_

TOTAL: 13.00 $7,593.00)

Name Hours Rate Value

Ian E. Aversa (IEA)    10.20 $625.00) $6,375.00)
Jeremy T. Nemers (JTN)     2.80 $435.00) $1,218.00)

OUR FEE $7,593.00)
HST at 13% $987.09)

AMOUNT NOW DUE  $8,580.09)

THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT HEREIN   
Aird & Berlis LLP  

Ian E Aversa  
E.&O.E. 

PAYMENT OF THIS ACCOUNT IS DUE ON RECEIPT 

IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE SOLICITORS ACT, ONTARIO, INTEREST WILL BE CHARGED AT THE RATE OF 2.0% PER ANNUM ON 
UNPAID AMOUNTS CALCULATED FROM A DATE THAT IS ONE MONTH AFTER THIS ACCOUNT IS DELIVERED. 

GST / HST Registration # 12184 6539 RT0001 
NOTE:  This account may be paid by wire transfer in Canadian funds to our account at The Toronto-Dominion Bank, TD Centre, 55 King Street West, Toronto, 
Ontario, M5K 1A2. Account number 5221521, Transit number 10202, Swift Code TDOMCATTTOR. Please include the account number as reference. 

40985325.1 
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IN ACCOUNT WITH:   

Brookfield Place, 181 Bay Street, Suite 1800 
Toronto, Ontario, Canada  M5J 2T9 
T 416.863.1500   F 416.863.1515 

airdberlis.com 

msi Spergel inc. 
200-505 Consumers Road 
North York, ON 
M2J 4V8

Attention: Mr. Philip H. Gennis  Invoice No.: 680700 

PLEASE WRITE INVOICE NUMBERS 
ON THE BACK OF ALL CHEQUES 
File No.: 13225/156859 
Client No.: 13225 
Matter No.: 156859

August 28, 2020 

Re: Receivership of Eveley International Corporation  

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED on your behalf throughout the period ended August 25, 
2020

LAWYER DATE RATE/ 
HOUR

TIME VALUE DESCRIPTION

IEA 
_

29/07/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.20
_

$125.00)
_

Emails and discussions with 
counsel, clients and J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

29/07/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Receipt and review of email from P. 
Gennis  
_

IEA 
_

30/07/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.30
_

$187.50)
_

Telephone call, emails and 
discussions with counsel, client and 
J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

30/07/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Receipt and review of email from B. 
Bissell  
_

IEA 
_

31/07/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.20
_

$125.00)
_

Emails and discussions with 
counsel, clients and J. Nemers  
_

IEA 
_

03/08/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.20
_

$125.00)
_

Emails and discussions with counsel 
re next steps  
_

IEA 
_

04/08/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.50
_

$937.50)
_

Emails and discussions with 
counsel, clients and J. Nemers; 
Engaged with reviewing documents 
and materials related to the sale 
process and emails and discussions 
re same   

_
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LAWYER DATE RATE/ 
HOUR

TIME VALUE DESCRIPTION

JTN 
_

04/08/20
_

$435.00)
_

    1.40
_

$609.00)
_

Receipt and review of emails from 
client and I. Aversa re results of sale 
process and next steps; Consider 
same; Email exchanges with I. 
Aversa re same; Engaged with 
review of and revisions to 
spreadsheet; Engaged with high-
level security review and related 
tasks 
_

IEA 
_

05/08/20
_

$625.00)
_

    2.00
_

$1,250.00)
_

Telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

05/08/20
_

$435.00)
_

    1.90
_

$826.50)
_

Engaged with consideration of sale 
process results; Email to client re 
suggested next steps and related 
matters; Attend on conference call 
with client; Attend on conference call 
with B. Bissell  
_

IEA 
_

06/08/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.20
_

$750.00)
_

Emails and discussions with 
counsel, clients, J. Nemers and S. 
Morris  
_

SRM 
_

06/08/20
_

$385.00)
_

    0.20
_

$77.00)
_

Order, review and report on 
corporate profiles  
_

JTN 
_

06/08/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.90
_

$391.50)
_

Telephone call with I. Aversa; 
Follow-up email exchanges with B. 
Bissell; Engaged with drafting of 
security opinion re CEFL; Email 
exchanges with client 
_

IEA 
_

07/08/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.40
_

$250.00)
_

Emails and discussions with J. 
Nemers and S. Morris re search 
results and draft motion materials  
_

SRM 
_

07/08/20
_

$385.00)
_

    0.20
_

$77.00)
_

Review and report on updated 
certified PPSA search  
_

JTN 
_

07/08/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Receipt and review of updated 
PPSA search for security opinion  
_

IEA 
_

10/08/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.00
_

$625.00)
_

Telephone call, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers  
_ 
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LAWYER DATE RATE/ 
HOUR

TIME VALUE DESCRIPTION

JTN 
_

10/08/20
_

$435.00)
_

    1.10
_

$478.50)
_

Receipt and review of email from H. 
Chaiton; Email exchanges with B. 
Bissell; Engaged with drafting of 
notice of motion; Email to client re 
same 
_

IEA 
_

11/08/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.50
_

$937.50)
_

Telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

11/08/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.50
_

$217.50)
_

Telephone call with I. Aversa and 
email exchanges with H. Chaiton 
and B. Bissell; Receipt and review of 
lengthy email from B. Bissell re LOIs 
_

IEA 
_

12/08/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.50
_

$312.50)
_

Telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with counsel, client and 
J. Nemers  
_

IEA 
_

13/08/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.20
_

$750.00)
_

Telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

13/08/20
_

$435.00)
_

    2.00
_

$870.00)
_

Telephone call with I. Aversa; Attend 
on conference call with B. Bissell; 
Engaged with drafting of 
confidentiality agreement re sale 
process results; Email to I. Aversa re 
same; Engaged with drafting of APA 
_

IEA 
_

14/08/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.40
_

$250.00)
_

Emails and discussions with 
counsel, clients and J. Nemers  
_

IEA 
_

16/08/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.00
_

$625.00)
_

Emails and discussions with 
counsel, clients and J. Nemers and 
reviewing draft APAs (x2) and 
providing comments  
_

JTN 
_

16/08/20
_

$435.00)
_

    1.50
_

$652.50)
_

Engaged with drafting of two APAs 
and schedules thereto; Email to I. 
Aversa re same  
_

IEA 
_

17/08/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.00
_

$625.00)
_

Telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers  
_ 

244



AIRD & BERLIS LLP 
PAGE 4 OF INVOICE NO. 680700

LAWYER DATE RATE/ 
HOUR

TIME VALUE DESCRIPTION

JTN 
_

17/08/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.70
_

$304.50)
_

Telephone call with I. Aversa; 
Receipt and review of email from H. 
Chaiton; Email to client re draft 
NDA, sale process results, two 
APAs and related matters; 
Telephone call with client; Email to 
H. Chaiton 
_

IEA 
_

18/08/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.00
_

$625.00)
_

Telephone call, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers; Emails and discussions 
with J. Nemers and S. Morris re 
motion materials and search results  
_

SRM 
_

18/08/20
_

$385.00)
_

    0.20
_

$77.00)
_

Conduct prelim and obtain profile for 
Canadian Western Bank; Review 
and report on same  
_

JTN 
_

18/08/20
_

$435.00)
_

    1.70
_

$739.50)
_

Engaged with review of security 
documents provided in respect of 
CWB and corresponding PPSA 
registrations; Engaged with drafting 
of security opinion re CWB; 
Engaged with completion of security 
opinion in respect of CEFL; Email to 
client re same; Email exchange with 
H. Chaiton; Telephone call with I. 
Aversa 
_

IEA 
_

19/08/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.50
_

$312.50)
_

Emails and discussions with 
counsel, clients and J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

19/08/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.30
_

$130.50)
_

Receipt and review of email from B. 
Bissell; Engaged with revisions to 
APS'; Email to B. Bissell re same 
_

IEA 
_

20/08/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.50
_

$312.50)
_

Emails and discussions with 
counsel, clients and J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

20/08/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Email exchanges with client and B. 
Bissell  
_

IEA 
_

21/08/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.60
_

$1,000.00)
_

Telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with counsel (x2), 
clients and J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

21/08/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.40
_

$174.00)
_

Email to and telephone call with H. 
Chaiton  
_ 
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LAWYER DATE RATE/ 
HOUR

TIME VALUE DESCRIPTION

IEA 
_

22/08/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.20
_

$125.00)
_

Emails and discussions with clients 
and J. Nemers regarding the APAs 
and next steps regarding same  
_

IEA 
_

24/08/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.40
_

$250.00)
_

Telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

24/08/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Email exchange with client  
_

JTN 
_

25/08/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Telephone call with I. Aversa  
_

TOTAL: 30.40 $16,386.00)

Name Hours Rate Value

Ian E. Aversa (IEA)    16.80 $625.00) $10,500.00)
Jeremy T. Nemers (JTN)    13.00 $435.00) $5,655.00)
Shannon R. Morris (SRM)     0.60 $385.00) $231.00)

OUR FEE $16,386.00)
HST at 13% $2,130.18)

DISBURSEMENTS

COST INCURRED ON YOUR BEHALF AS AN AGENT 

Search Under P.P.S.A. $8.00)

Subject to HST 

Service Provider Fee $4.50)
Corporate Search $36.00)

Total Disbursements $40.50)
HST at 13% $5.27)

AMOUNT NOW DUE  $18,569.95)
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THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT HEREIN   
Aird & Berlis LLP  

Ian E Aversa  

E.&O.E. 

PAYMENT OF THIS ACCOUNT IS DUE ON RECEIPT 

IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE SOLICITORS ACT, ONTARIO, INTEREST WILL BE CHARGED AT THE RATE OF 2.0% PER ANNUM ON 
UNPAID AMOUNTS CALCULATED FROM A DATE THAT IS ONE MONTH AFTER THIS ACCOUNT IS DELIVERED. 

GST / HST Registration # 12184 6539 RT0001 

NOTE:  This account may be paid by wire transfer in Canadian funds to our account at The Toronto-Dominion Bank, TD Centre, 55 King Street West, Toronto, 
Ontario, M5K 1A2. Account number 5221521, Transit number 10202, Swift Code TDOMCATTTOR. Please include the account number as reference. 

41341072.1 
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IN ACCOUNT WITH:   

Brookfield Place, 181 Bay Street, Suite 1800 
Toronto, Ontario, Canada  M5J 2T9 
T 416.863.1500   F 416.863.1515 

airdberlis.com 

msi Spergel inc. 
200-505 Consumers Road 
North York, ON 
M2J 4V8

Attention: Mr. Philip H. Gennis  Invoice No.: 683888 

PLEASE WRITE INVOICE NUMBERS 
ON THE BACK OF ALL CHEQUES 
File No.: 13225/156859 
Client No.: 13225 
Matter No.: 156859

September 30, 2020 

Re: Receivership of Eveley International Corporation  

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED on your behalf throughout the period ended September 30, 
2020

LAWYER DATE RATE/ 
HOUR

TIME VALUE DESCRIPTION

IEA 
_

26/08/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.80
_

$500.00)
_

Telephone call, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

26/08/20
_

$435.00)
_

    1.00
_

$435.00)
_

Email exchanges with working 
group; Attend on conference call 
with client re status and next steps 
_

IEA 
_

27/08/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.80
_

$500.00)
_

Telephone call, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

27/08/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.50
_

$217.50)
_

Email exchanges with working 
group; Engaged with high-level 
review of mark-up to cumulative 
APS from B. Bissell 
_

IEA 
_

28/08/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.30
_

$187.50)
_

Telephone call, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

28/08/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Email exchanges with client  
_

IEA 
_

29/08/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.70
_

$437.50)
_

Telephone call, emails and 
discussions with clients and J. 
Nemers  
_
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LAWYER DATE RATE/ 
HOUR

TIME VALUE DESCRIPTION

JTN 
_

29/08/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.70
_

$304.50)
_

Attend on conference call with client 
to discuss APA mark-up received by 
B. Bissell; Engaged with revisions to 
same  
_

IEA 
_

30/08/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.50
_

$312.50)
_

Telephone call, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers regarding the draft APA 
and next steps regarding same  
_

JTN 
_

30/08/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.70
_

$304.50)
_

Email exchanges with client; 
Telephone calls with I. Aversa; 
Engaged with further revisions to 
APA; Email to B. Bissell 
_

IEA 
_

31/08/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.80
_

$500.00)
_

Telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

31/08/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.20
_

$87.00)
_

Receipt and review of email from B. 
Bissell; Email exchanges with 
working group; Telephone call with I. 
Aversa 
_

IEA 
_

01/09/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.80
_

$500.00)
_

Telephone call, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

01/09/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.80
_

$348.00)
_

Attend on conference call with B. 
Bissell and client  
_

IEA 
_

02/09/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.20
_

$125.00)
_

Emails and discussions with clients 
and J. Nemers  
_

IEA 
_

06/09/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.20
_

$125.00)
_

Emails and discussions with clients 
and J. Nemers  
_

IEA 
_

08/09/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.10
_

$687.50)
_

Telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with counsel, clients and 
J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

08/09/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Email exchange with I. Aversa re 
status  
_

IEA 
_

09/09/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.20
_

$125.00)
_

Emails and discussions with client, 
counsel and J. Nemers  
_

IEA 
_

15/09/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.20
_

$125.00)
_

Emails and discussions with client 
and J. Nemers  
_ 
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LAWYER DATE RATE/ 
HOUR

TIME VALUE DESCRIPTION

JTN 
_

15/09/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Receipt and review of email from P. 
Gennis  
_

IEA 
_

16/09/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.50
_

$312.50)
_

Telephone call, emails and 
discussions with counsel, client and 
J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

16/09/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Email exchanges with client and I. 
Aversa  
_

IEA 
_

17/09/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.20
_

$125.00)
_

Emails and discussions with client, 
counsel and J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

17/09/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Email exchange with B. Bissell  
_

IEA 
_

18/09/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.50
_

$312.50)
_

Emails and discussions with 
counsel, client and J. Nemers; 
Engaged with reviewing the revised 
version of the draft APA  
_

JTN 
_

18/09/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.30
_

$130.50)
_

Follow-up email exchange with B. 
Bissell; Receipt and high-level 
review of proposed changes to draft 
APS from B. Bissell 
_

IEA 
_

20/09/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.40
_

$250.00)
_

Emails and discussions with J. 
Nemers regarding the revised draft 
APA from counsel  
_

JTN 
_

20/09/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.30
_

$130.50)
_

Email with further review of 
proposed draft APS changes; Email 
to I. Aversa re same  
_

IEA 
_

21/09/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.50
_

$312.50)
_

Emails and discussions with 
counsel, client and J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

21/09/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Email to client re status and APA 
comments  
_

IEA 
_

22/09/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.20
_

$125.00)
_

Emails and discussions with client 
and J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

22/09/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Receipt and review of email from 
client  
_

IEA 
_

23/09/20
_

$625.00)
_

    2.00
_

$1,250.00)
_

Telephone call, emails and 
discussions with client and J. 
Nemers; Emails and discussions 
with G. Camelino and J. Nemers  
_ 
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LAWYER DATE RATE/ 
HOUR

TIME VALUE DESCRIPTION

JTN 
_

23/09/20
_

$435.00)
_

    2.40
_

$1,044.00)
_

Attend on conference call with client 
re latest draft APS; Engaged with 
revisions re same; Email to and 
discussions with I. Aversa re same; 
Engaged with further revisions; 
Email to B. Bissell re same 
_

IEA 
_

24/09/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.20
_

$125.00)
_

Emails and discussions with 
counsel, client and J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

24/09/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Email to client  
_

IEA 
_

25/09/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.40
_

$250.00)
_

Telephone call, emails and 
discussions with counsel, client and 
J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

25/09/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Email exchange with client  
_

IEA 
_

28/09/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.20
_

$125.00)
_

Emails and discussions with 
counsel, client and J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

28/09/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Follow-up email to B. Bissell  
_

IEA 
_

29/09/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.40
_

$250.00)
_

Emails and discussions with 
counsel, client and J. Nemers re 
update and next steps  
_

TOTAL: 20.00 $10,999.00)

Name Hours Rate Value

Ian E. Aversa (IEA)    12.10 $625.00) $7,562.50)
Jeremy T. Nemers (JTN)     7.90 $435.00) $3,436.50)

OUR FEE $10,999.00)
HST at 13% $1,429.87)

AMOUNT NOW DUE  $12,428.87)
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THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT HEREIN   
Aird & Berlis LLP  

Ian E Aversa  

E.&O.E. 

PAYMENT OF THIS ACCOUNT IS DUE ON RECEIPT 

IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE SOLICITORS ACT, ONTARIO, INTEREST WILL BE CHARGED AT THE RATE OF 2.0% PER ANNUM ON 
UNPAID AMOUNTS CALCULATED FROM A DATE THAT IS ONE MONTH AFTER THIS ACCOUNT IS DELIVERED. 

GST / HST Registration # 12184 6539 RT0001 

NOTE:  This account may be paid by wire transfer in Canadian funds to our account at The Toronto-Dominion Bank, TD Centre, 55 King Street West, Toronto, 
Ontario, M5K 1A2. Account number 5221521, Transit number 10202, Swift Code TDOMCATTTOR. Please include the account number as reference. 

41803443.1 

39324691.1 
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IN ACCOUNT WITH:   

Brookfield Place, 181 Bay Street, Suite 1800 
Toronto, Ontario, Canada  M5J 2T9 
T 416.863.1500   F 416.863.1515 

airdberlis.com 

msi Spergel inc. 
200-505 Consumers Road 
North York, ON 
M2J 4V8

Attention: Mr. Philip H. Gennis  Invoice No.: 686707 

PLEASE WRITE INVOICE NUMBERS 
ON THE BACK OF ALL CHEQUES 
File No.: 13225/156859 
Client No.: 13225 
Matter No.: 156859

October 30, 2020 

Re: Receivership of Eveley International Corporation  

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED on your behalf throughout the period ended October 27, 
2020 

LAWYER DATE RATE/ 
HOUR

TIME VALUE DESCRIPTION

IEA 
_

01/10/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.10
_

$62.50)
_

Emails and discussions with 
counsel, client and J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

01/10/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Further follow-up email to B. Bissell  
_

IEA 
_

02/10/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.00
_

$625.00)
_

Engaged with reviewing revised 
draft APS and emails with counsel, 
client and J. Nemers regarding 
same  
_

JTN 
_

02/10/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.20
_

$87.00)
_

Receipt and review of email from B. 
Bissell and corresponding further 
revised draft APS; Consider same  
_

IEA 
_

03/10/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.40
_

$250.00)
_

[A107] Communicate/Other Outside 
Counsel - Emails and discussions 
with counsel, client and J. Nemers 
regarding the draft APS and next 
steps regarding same  
_

JTN 
_

03/10/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Email exchange with client re 
request from B. Bissell

IEA 
_

05/10/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.50
_

$937.50)
_

Telephone call, emails and 
discussions with counsel, client and 
J. Nemers re draft APS and next 
steps re same; Engaged with 
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LAWYER DATE RATE/ 
HOUR

TIME VALUE DESCRIPTION

reviewing the revised APS and 
emails re same  
_

JTN 
_

05/10/20
_

$435.00)
_

    1.90
_

$826.50)
_

Email exchanges with client; Attend 
on conference call with client, B. 
Bissell and proposed purchaser; 
Discussion with I. Aversa; Engaged 
with further revisions to draft 
agreement; Email to client re same 
_

IEA 
_

06/10/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.30
_

$812.50)
_

Telephone call and emails with client 
and J. Nemers re draft APA and 
reviewing and revising draft APA  
_

JTN 
_

06/10/20
_

$435.00)
_

    1.20
_

$522.00)
_

Email exchange with client re draft 
APS; Attend on conference call with 
client re same; Engaged with 
revisions re same; Email to B. 
Bissell re same 
_

IEA 
_

07/10/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.60
_

$375.00)
_

Engaged with reviewing draft letter 
to counsel and providing comments 
and emails and discussions re 
same; Telephone call with client  
_

JTN 
_

07/10/20
_

$435.00)
_

    1.40
_

$609.00)
_

Receipt and review of email from 
client; Engaged with drafting of and 
revisions to letter to G. Camelino re 
return of monies; Email exchanges 
with client re same; Finalize letter 
and email to G. Camelino 
_

IEA 
_

08/10/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.90
_

$1,187.50)
_

Telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with counsel, client and 
J. Nemers; Engaged with reviewing 
and revising the draft APS; Engaged 
with reviewing documents and 
correspondence from CRA  
_

JTN 
_

08/10/20
_

$435.00)
_

    1.40
_

$609.00)
_

Receipt and review of emails from 
client re request from applicant and 
CRA-related matters; Prepare 
analysis re same; Email to and 
discussions with I. Aversa and M. 
Manchanda re same; Email to client; 
Receipt and review of updated APS; 
Engaged with further revisions to 
same; Email to B. Bissell re same; 
Attend to related tasks as needed 
_ 
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LAWYER DATE RATE/ 
HOUR

TIME VALUE DESCRIPTION

IEA 
_

09/10/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.40
_

$875.00)
_

Telephone call, emails and 
discussions with client; Engaged 
with reviewing and revising the draft 
APS; Engaged with reviewing the 
revised draft from counsel and 
emails from counsel; Discussions 
with J. Nemers re same  
_

JTN 
_

09/10/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.60
_

$261.00)
_

Email exchanges with working 
group; Receipt and review of further 
comments from B. Bissell re draft 
APS; Receipt and review of 
blackline; Consider same; 
Telephone call with I. Aversa re 
same 
_

IEA 
_

13/10/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.40
_

$250.00)
_

Engaged with reviewing the revised 
draft APS and emails with client and 
J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

13/10/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.20
_

$87.00)
_

Email exchange with I. Aversa re 
blackline received from B. Bissell; 
Email to client; Attend to tasks re 
same  
_

IEA 
_

14/10/20
_

$625.00)
_

    3.20
_

$2,000.00)
_

Engaged with reviewing and revising 
the draft APS and corresponding 
motion materials; Telephone call 
with client re same; Engaged with 
further revisions to the draft APS; 
Emails with client, counsel and J. 
Nemers re same  
_

JTN 
_

14/10/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.20
_

$87.00)
_

Email exchanges with client and I. 
Aversa; Engaged with review of 
further revised draft APS  
_

IEA 
_

15/10/20
_

$625.00)
_

    1.20
_

$750.00)
_

Telephone calls, emails and 
discussions with opposing counsel, 
client and J. Nemers re the draft 
APS; Engaged with reviewing the 
revised draft APS and discussions 
re same  
_

JTN 
_

15/10/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.30
_

$130.50)
_

Receipt and review of emails from B. 
Bissell re further comments re draft 
APS; Consider same; Email 
exchanges with working group re 
same 
_ 
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LAWYER DATE RATE/ 
HOUR

TIME VALUE DESCRIPTION

IEA 
_

16/10/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.50
_

$312.50)
_

Telephone call with client regarding 
draft APS; Emails and discussions 
with client, counsel and J. Nemers 
regarding same  
_

JTN 
_

16/10/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.40
_

$174.00)
_

Engaged with further revisions to 
draft APS; Telephone call with I. 
Aversa re same; Email to client re 
same  
_

IEA 
_

19/10/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.20
_

$125.00)
_

Emails with counsel, client and J. 
Nemers regarding draft APS  
_

JTN 
_

19/10/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Follow-up email to B. Bissell  
_

IEA 
_

20/10/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.50
_

$312.50)
_

Emails and discussions with 
counsel, client and J. Nemers re 
APS and next steps; Engaged with 
reviewing revised version of APS  
_

JTN 
_

20/10/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Email exchange with client re 
request from B. Bissell's client  
_

IEA 
_

21/10/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.50
_

$312.50)
_

Emails and discussions with 
counsel, client and J. Nemers; 
Instructions to J. Nemers re fee 
affidavit and motion materials  
_

JTN 
_

21/10/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.20
_

$87.00)
_

Email exchanges with working 
group; Engaged with review of and 
revisions to draft fee affidavit  
_

IEA 
_

22/10/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.30
_

$187.50)
_

Emails and discussions with 
counsel, client and J. Nemers  
_

JTN 
_

22/10/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.60
_

$261.00)
_

Receipt and review of fully-executed 
APS; Engaged with revisions to draft 
court materials  
_

IEA 
_

23/10/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.50
_

$312.50)
_

Emails with counsel, client and J. 
Nemers regarding next steps re 
motion materials and upcoming 
hearing; Telephone call with P. 
Gennis  
_ 
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LAWYER DATE RATE/ 
HOUR

TIME VALUE DESCRIPTION

JTN 
_

23/10/20
_

$435.00)
_

    1.30
_

$565.50)
_

Follow-up email to court re hearing 
date; Email exchange with working 
group; Telephone call with client; 
Engaged with further drafting of and 
revisions to court materials; Email to 
client re same; Telephone call with I. 
Aversa  
_

IEA 
_

24/10/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.20
_

$125.00)
_

Emails and discussions regarding 
scheduling court hearing  
_

JTN 
_

24/10/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.20
_

$87.00)
_

Email exchanges with Court office re 
scheduling  
_

IEA 
_

25/10/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.20
_

$125.00)
_

Emails and discussions regarding 
scheduling hearing  
_

JTN 
_

25/10/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.20
_

$87.00)
_

Email exchange with D. Lu re Zoom 
and Sync.com addresses; Calendar 
invite to court and Justice Cavanagh 
re same  
_

IEA 
_

26/10/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.30
_

$187.50)
_

Emails and discussions regarding 
scheduling court hearing; Emails 
and discussions regarding draft 
Receiver's report  
_

JTN 
_

26/10/20
_

$435.00)
_

    0.10
_

$43.50)
_

Email to client and B. Bissell re 
hearing date  
_

IEA 
_

27/10/20
_

$625.00)
_

    0.20
_

$125.00)
_

Emails with client and J. Nemers  
_

TOTAL: 27.20 $14,948.00)

Name Hours Rate Value

Ian E. Aversa (IEA)    16.40 $625.00) $10,250.00)
Jeremy T. Nemers (JTN)    10.80 $435.00) $4,698.00)

OUR FEE $14,948.00)
HST at 13% $1,943.24)

AMOUNT NOW DUE  $16,891.24)
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THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT HEREIN   
Aird & Berlis LLP  

Ian E Aversa  

E.&O.E. 

PAYMENT OF THIS ACCOUNT IS DUE ON RECEIPT 

IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE SOLICITORS ACT, ONTARIO, INTEREST WILL BE CHARGED AT THE RATE OF 2.0% PER ANNUM ON 
UNPAID AMOUNTS CALCULATED FROM A DATE THAT IS ONE MONTH AFTER THIS ACCOUNT IS DELIVERED. 

GST / HST Registration # 12184 6539 RT0001 

NOTE:  This account may be paid by wire transfer in Canadian funds to our account at The Toronto-Dominion Bank, TD Centre, 55 King Street West, Toronto, 
Ontario, M5K 1A2. Account number 5221521, Transit number 10202, Swift Code TDOMCATTTOR. Please include the account number as reference. 

42181964.1 

39324691.1 
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B 
 

Referred to in the 
 

AFFIDAVIT OF DAMIAN LU 
 

Sworn before me 
 

this 2nd day of November, 2020 
 
 

_____________________________ 
 
 

Commissioner for taking Affidavits, etc 
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STATEMENT OF RESPONSIBLE INDIVIDUALS 
 
Aird & Berlis LLPs professional fees herein are made with respect to the following individuals 
 
 

Lawyer Call to Bar Hrly Rate Total Time Value 

Ian Aversa 2008 $625.00 130.60 $81,625.00 

Jeremy T. Nemers 2014 $435.00 67.50 $29,362.50 

     

     

Clerk/Student Call to Bar Avg Hrly Rate Total Time Value 

Jenaya McLean N/A $240.00 0.30 $72.00 

Shannon Morris NA $385.00 0.60 $231.00 

Damian Lu N/A $295.00 0.80 $236.00 

 
*Standard hourly rates listed.  However, in certain circumstances adjustments to the account were 
made. 
 

260



  C
A

N
A

D
IA

N
 E

Q
U

IP
M

E
N

T
 F

IN
A

N
C

E
 &

 L
E

A
SI

N
G

 I
N

C
. 

   
  -

an
d-

 
E

V
E

L
E

Y
 I

N
T

E
R

N
A

T
IO

N
A

L
 C

O
R

P
O

R
A

T
IO

N
 

A
pp

li
ca

nt
 

 
R

es
po

nd
en

t 
 

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

C
ou

rt
 F

il
e 

N
o.

 C
V

-2
0-

00
63

98
97

-0
0C

L
 

 

O
N

T
A

R
IO

 
SU

P
E

R
IO

R
 C

O
U

R
T

 O
F

 J
U

ST
IC

E
 

C
O

M
M

E
R

C
IA

L
 L

IS
T

 
 

P
ro

ce
ed

in
gs

 c
om

m
en

ce
d

 a
t 

T
or

on
to

 

 
A

F
F

ID
A

V
IT

 O
F

 D
A

M
IA

N
 L

U
 

  
A

IR
D

 &
 B

E
R

L
IS

 L
L

P
 

B
ar

ri
st

er
s 

an
d 

S
ol

ic
it

or
s 

B
ro

ok
fi

el
d 

Pl
ac

e 
18

1 
B

ay
 S

tr
ee

t, 
S

ui
te

 1
80

0 
T

or
on

to
, O

N
  M

5J
 2

T
9 

 Ia
n

 A
ve

rs
a 

(L
S

O
 #

 5
54

49
N

) 
T

el
: (

41
6)

 8
65

-3
08

2 
F

ax
: (

41
6)

 8
63

-1
51

5 
E

m
ai

l:
 ia

ve
rs

a@
ai

rd
be

rl
is

.c
om

  
 Je

re
m

y 
N

em
er

s 
(L

S
O

 #
 6

64
10

Q
) 

T
el

: (
41

6)
 8

65
-7

72
4 

F
ax

: (
41

6)
 8

63
-1

51
5 

E
m

ai
l:

 jn
em

er
s@

ai
rd

be
rl

is
.c

om
  

 L
aw

ye
rs

 fo
r 

m
si

 S
pe

rg
el

 in
c.

, i
n 

it
s 

ca
pa

ci
ty

 a
s 

In
te

ri
m

 R
ec

ei
ve

r 
an

d 
R

ec
ei

ve
r 

of
 E

ve
le

y 
In

te
rn

at
io

na
l C

or
po

ra
ti

on
 

  39
96

1
14

7
.5

 

261



APPENDIX 9 

262



1.

2.

3.

4.
5.

6.

7.

8.

9.

E&OE
Net Receipts over Disbursements 7,188.29

HST on Ascend License Fee 35.75 154,609.61

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 280,894.99

Repairs & maintenance 1,120.00
Legal fees/disbursements 30,050.00
Ascend License Fee 275.00

Utilities 9,612.88
Occupation rent 97,111.17
Redirection of mail 167.50

Other misc disbursements 1,650.00
Change of locks 690.00
Computer services 1,240.00

Miscellaneous
Appraisal fees 10,000.00
Travel 2,657.31

16,929.74
Fees

Receiver's fees 47,776.25 47,776.25

Federal and Provincial taxes
HST paid on disbursements exclusive of fees 10,718.83
HST on Receiver/Agent's Fees 6,210.91

Insurance 56,853.08 56,853.08
Legal fees and legal services costs 

HST on legal fees 3,901.31 3,901.31

Other advertising 755.00 755.00
Premium

DISBURSEMENTS
Fees Paid

To official receiver 70.00 70.00

Interest allocation 121.91
Receiver Borrowing from Secured Creditor 277,190.24 277,865.15

TOTAL RECEIPTS 288,083.28

Sale of inventory 7,220.00 10,218.13
Miscellaneous

HST collected 553.00

In the matter of the receivership of
EVELEY INTERNATIONAL CORPORATION

Receiver's Statement of Receipts and Disbursements
as at October 31, 2020

RECEIPTS
Asset Realization

Accounts receivable 2,998.13

District of
Division No.      -
Court No.        32-159181
Estate No.     32-159181
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CONFIDENTIAL 
APPENDIX 1 

(SUBJECT TO SEALING ORDER) 
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CONFIDENTIAL 
APPENDIX 2 

(SUBJECT TO SEALING ORDER) 
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CONFIDENTIAL 
APPENDIX 3 

(SUBJECT TO SEALING ORDER) 
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CONFIDENTIAL 
APPENDIX 4 

(SUBJECT TO SEALING ORDER) 
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CANADIAN EQUIPMENT FINANCE & LEASING INC.      - and - EVELEY INTERNATIONAL CORPORATION 

Applicant Respondent
CV-20-00639897-00CL

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

Proceedings commenced at Toronto 

FIRST REPORT OF THE RECEIVER 

AIRD & BERLIS LLP 
Barristers and Solicitors 

Brookfield Place 
181 Bay Street, Suite 1800 

P.O. Box 754 
Toronto, ON  M5J 2T9

Ian Aversa (LSO # 55449N) 
Tel: (416) 865-3082 
Fax: (416) 863-1515 
Email:  iaversa@airdberlis.com

Jeremy Nemers (LSO # 66410Q) 
Tel: (416) 865-7724 
Fax: (416) 863-1515 
Email:  jnemers@airdberlis.com

Lawyers for the Court-appointed Receiver

42232827.1 
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