
Court File No. CV-24-00088321-00CL 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

BETWEEN: 

BANK OF MONTREAL 

Applicant 

- and – 

11977636 CANADA INC. 

Respondent 

APPLICATION UNDER SUBSECTION 243(1) OF THE BANKRUPTCY AND INSOLVENCY 
ACT, R.S.C. 1985, c. B-3, AS AMENDED, AND SECTION 101 OF THE COURTS OF 
JUSTICE ACT, R.S.O. 1990, c. C.43, AS AMENDED 

AFFIDAVIT OF ANTOINETTE DEPINTO 
(sworn June 3, 2025) 

I, ANTOINETTE DEPINTO, of the City of Vaughan, in the Province of Ontario, MAKE 

OATH AND SAY AS FOLLOWS: 

1. I am a legal assistant with the law firm of Chaitons LLP (“Chaitons”), lawyers for the

court-appointed receiver, msi Spergel Inc. (the “Receiver”), and as such have knowledge of the 

matters to which I hereinafter depose. 

2. Attached hereto as Exhibit “A” is a copy of email correspondence from the Receiver to

11977636 Canada Inc. dated February 13, 2025 and February 21, 2025. 





THIS IS EXHIBIT “A” TO

THE AFFIDAVIT OF ANTOINETTE DEPINTO 

SWORN BEFORE ME THIS  3RD

DAY OF JUNE, 2025

____________ 

A Commissioner etc. 
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On Wed, Feb 19, 2025 at 1:27 PM Evan McCullagh <EMcCullagh@spergel.ca> wrote: 

Fahd, 

  

We are following up on the below information request. In addition, please provide the following 
additional details concerning the Hamilton property: 

  

 How long has the Hamilton Property been listed for? 
 How many offers were received? 
 If additional offers were received, what was the purchase price and deposit amount for those 

offers? 
 If additional offers were received, why was the purchaser selected? 
 What is your relationship with the purchaser if any? 
 What negotiations took place for the Hamilton property? 
 Was an independent broker used? 

  

Thank you, 

  

Evan McCullagh  | Senior Estate Manager
 

msi Spergel inc. | Licensed Insolvency Trustees 
21 King Street West, Suite 1602, Hamilton, ON., L8P 4W7
T: (905) 527-2227 | F: 905-527-6670 
 

EMcCullagh@spergel.ca | www.spergel.ca 
  

               

You owe it to yourself. 
  

  

 

This email may contain privileged information and is intended only for the named recipient. Distribution, disclosure or copying of this email by anyone other than 
the named recipient is prohibited. If you are not the named recipient, please notify us immediately by return email and permanently destroy this email and all 
copies. 
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From: Evan McCullagh  
Sent: Thursday, February 13, 2025 11:34 AM 
To: fahd chaudhary <fahdalichaudhary@gmail.com> 
Cc: Trevor Pringle <TPringle@spergel.ca>; Dharam Tiwana <dtiwana@spergel.ca> 
Subject: In the matter of the Receivership of 11977636 Canada Inc. - 652 Parkdale Avenue North, Hamilton & 
5641 Nauvoo Road, Watford, ON 

  

Fahd, 

  

As you are aware, msi Spergel inc. (“Spergel”) was appointed as Receiver (in such capacity, the 
“Receiver”) of all the assets, undertakings and properties (collectively, the “Properties”) of the Debtor. 
Spergel was appointed as the Receiver pursuant to the Order of the Honourable Justice Valente of the 
Ontario Superior Court of Justice (the “Court”) made on February 11, 2025 (the “Appointment Order”). 
A copy of the Appointment Order was provided to you and is also enclosed. 

  

The attached Appointment Order puts an obligation on you to cooperate with the Receiver’s mandate, 
we request that you provide the following documentation for the above properties as soon as possible: 

  

 Current Insurance policies. 
 Accounts Payable listing with contact information. 
 Accounts Receivable listing with contact information. 
 Most recent rent rolls with tenant contact information. 
 Copies of signed leases. 
 Copies of utilities and maintenance contracts (i.e. garbage, snow removal et al); 
 11977636 Canada Inc. bank statements and most recent financials. 
 Property tax statements. 
 Property Survey, floor plans, et al. 
 Most recent Environmental on the properties. 
 The prospective purchaser for 652 Parkdale’s info and Lawyer’s information. 

  

This list isn’t exhaustive, and we may require additional information. 

  

Thank you for your anticipated cooperation, 
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Evan McCullagh  | Senior Estate Manager
 

msi Spergel inc. | Licensed Insolvency Trustees 
21 King Street West, Suite 1602, Hamilton, ON., L8P 4W7
T: (905) 527-2227 | F: 905-527-6670 
 

EMcCullagh@spergel.ca | www.spergel.ca 
  

               

You owe it to yourself. 
  

  

 

This email may contain privileged information and is intended only for the named recipient. Distribution, disclosure or copying of this email by anyone other than 
the named recipient is prohibited. If you are not the named recipient, please notify us immediately by return email and permanently destroy this email and all 
copies. 
  

  

 
 
 
--  
LET'S BE FRANK - TEAM ROD FRANK 
  
FAHD CHAUDHARY - SALES REPRESENTATIVE 
O.905-575-9262 
C. 289-925-4137 
  
1595 UPPER JAMES STREET, STE 101, HAMILTON,  ON L9B 0H7 
REMAX/ESCARPMENT FRANK REALTY, BROKERAGE. 
INDEPENDENTLY OWNED AND OPERATED. 
 
 
teamrodfrank.com 



THIS IS EXHIBIT “B” TO

THE AFFIDAVIT OF ANTOINETTE DEPINTO 

SWORN BEFORE ME THIS  3RD

DAY OF JUNE, 2025

____________ 

A Commissioner etc. 
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Laura Culleton

From: Amarnath Misir <avmlawoffice@yahoo.ca>
Sent: Thursday, April 10, 2025 12:26 PM
To: Laura Culleton
Subject: Re: Bank of Montreal v. 11977636 Canada Inc.; Court File No. CV-24-00088321-0000

CAUTION: [External] 

Good afternoon Laura, 

I acknowledge receipt of your response to my request to complete a transaction that was already in 
progress prior to the making of the receiving order by the motion's judge. 

Your reply is clear that your client has no desire or intention to provide such consent. I wish to advise you 
that no steps have been or are being taken by my client to market the property. 

I have requested that my client provide the documents required by you and I am awaiting their 
production. You will have them as soon as I am in possession of them. 

You have a copy of the Agreement of the Purchase and Sale of the 652 Parkdale Ave. N. Property even 
proir to the hearing of the motion. I have provided you with the buyer's lawyer's information in addition 
thereto. It is not clear to me what further information you require on this subject.   

Reference to our Application for Leave to the Court of Appeal, I will advise as soon as we are in receipt of 
the file number.  

Kind regards 

Amarnath V. Misir

Barrister and Solicitor, Notary Public 
AVM LAW OFFICE 
33 Elm Drive West 
Suite 2510, Mississauga 
ON  L5B 4M2 

On Thursday, April 10, 2025 at 11:35:18 a.m. EDT, Laura Culleton <laurac@chaitons.com> wrote: 

Hi Amarnath, 

I have had an opportunity to review your letter. 
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It is important that we obtain the documents requested as soon as possible. As it currently stands, your client is 
offside the Appointment Order requiring the documents and information to be produced to the Receiver. If we 
do not receive the documents shortly, we will consider obtaining additional remedies from the Court.  

  

We have requested that the bank provide an updated payout statement. 

  

Your client has no authority to continue to market and attempt to sell the property. I request that this activity 
cease immediately as it risks jeopardizing the Receiver’s sale process and may confuse the market. We have 
never received a complete response to our inquiries about this interested party. Further, if this interested party 
remains interested in the property, the proper route is for them to participate in the Receiver’s sale process. I 
will be reaching out to the lawyer for this interested party and advising them that your client has no authority to 
sell this property. If your client continues to hold itself out as being able to do so, we may be required to seek 
additional remedies against your client.  

  

Best, 

  

  

  

 

Laura Culleton  | Lawyer 
Chaitons LLP | T: 416.218.1128  

  

  

From: Laura Culleton <LauraC@chaitons.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, April 8, 2025 10:35 AM 
To: Amarnath Misir <avmlawoffice@yahoo.ca> 
Subject: RE: Bank of Montreal v. 11977636 Canada Inc.; Court File No. CV-24-00088321-0000 

  

Hi Amarnath,  

  

As you are aware, I have been away on bereavement.  

  

I am currently working through my work backlog and will respond to your letters as soon as I am able.  
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Best, 

  

  

 

Laura Culleton  | Lawyer 
Chaitons LLP | T: 416.218.1128  

  

  

From: Amarnath Misir <avmlawoffice@yahoo.ca>  
Sent: Tuesday, April 8, 2025 10:33 AM 
To: Laura Culleton <LauraC@chaitons.com> 
Subject: Re: Bank of Montreal v. 11977636 Canada Inc.; Court File No. CV-24-00088321-0000 

  

CAUTION: [External] 

  

Dear Laura, 

  

Further to our email below, we appreciate it if you could provide us with a reply with respect to the request for the 
completion of the transaction. 

  

Kind regards 

  

Ruba A. for: 

Amarnath V. Misir 
Barrister and Solicitor, Notary Public 
AVM LAW OFFICE 
33 Elm Drive West 
Suite 2510, Mississauga 
ON  L5B 4M2 
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On Friday, April 4, 2025 at 04:24:40 p.m. EDT, Amarnath Misir <avmlawoffice@yahoo.ca> wrote:  

  

  

Dear Laura, 

  

Further to my letter of April 1, 2025, attached hereto the environmental report for the Watford property which my client has 
provided. I trust that you have had the opportunity to give consideration to my request to our client completeing the 652 
Parkdale North transaction with the view to paying off the amount owing to BMO. 

  

Your prompt reply is appreciated. 

  

Kind regards  

  

Amarnath V. Misir 
Barrister and Solicitor, Notary Public 
AVM LAW OFFICE 
33 Elm Drive West 
Suite 2510, Mississauga 
ON  L5B 4M2 

   

  

  

On Tuesday, April 1, 2025 at 02:01:53 p.m. EDT, Amarnath Misir <avmlawoffice@yahoo.ca> wrote:  

  

  

Good afternoon, 

  

Please see attached the Request Letter with respect to the above noted matter. 

  

Kind regards 

  

Ruba A. for: 
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Amarnath V. Misir 
Barrister and Solicitor, Notary Public 
AVM LAW OFFICE 
33 Elm Drive West 
Suite 2510, Mississauga 
ON  L5B 4M2 

   

  

  

On Friday, March 21, 2025 at 05:19:31 p.m. EDT, Laura Culleton <laurac@chaitons.com> wrote:  

  

  

Thank you, Amarnath, have a nice weekend.  

  

Sent from iPhone 

  

  

 

Laura Culleton  | Lawyer 
Chaitons LLP | T: 416.218.1128  

  

  

From: Amarnath Misir <avmlawoffice@yahoo.ca> 
Sent: Friday, March 21, 2025 5:15 PM 
To: Saad Suleman <ssuleman@sulemanlaw.com>; Laura Culleton <LauraC@chaitons.com> 
Cc: fahd chaudhary <fahdalichaudhary@gmail.com> 
Subject: Re: Bank of Montreal v. 11977636 Canada Inc.; Court File No. CV-24-00088321-0000  

  

CAUTION: [External] 

  

Hello Laura, 
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Yes, I am retained to represent the client on the Appeal of the motion Judge's Order appointing the receiver. I will forward 
your request for the documents listed to my client and respond to you early next week. 

  

Kind regards 

  

Amarnath V. Misir 
Barrister and Solicitor, Notary Public 
AVM LAW OFFICE 
33 Elm Drive West 
Suite 2510, Mississauga 
ON  L5B 4M2 

   

  

  

On Thursday, March 20, 2025 at 04:09:48 p.m. EDT, Laura Culleton <laurac@chaitons.com> wrote: 

  

  

Hi Saad, 

  

Thank you for letting me know. 

  

Amarnath – could you please advise whether you are still retained and act for 11977636 Canada Inc.? 

  

Best, 

  

  

 

Laura Culleton  | Lawyer 
Chaitons LLP | T: 416.218.1128 

  

  

From: Saad Suleman <ssuleman@sulemanlaw.com> 
Sent: Thursday, March 20, 2025 4:07 PM 
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To: Laura Culleton <LauraC@chaitons.com>; Amarnath Misir <avmlawoffice@yahoo.ca> 
Cc: fahd chaudhary <fahdalichaudhary@gmail.com> 
Subject: RE: Bank of Montreal v. 11977636 Canada Inc.; Court File No. CV-24-00088321-0000 

  

CAUTION: [External] 

  

We are not retained any further on this matter, we are copying the client directly 

  

Regards, 

  

 

  

Saad Suleman 

Barrister, Solicitor & Notary Public 

Suleman Law Professional Corporation 

100 Matheson Blvd E, #101 

Mississauga, ON L4Z 2G7 

Tel:  905-604-8828 

Fax: 905-901-1751 

Cell: 416-522-3196 

Email: ssuleman@sulemanlaw.com 

https://sulemanlaw.com/ 

  

Notice of Confidentiality: 
Disclaimer This e-mail and any attachments hereto are strictly confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual(s) to whom it is addressed. If 
you have received this e-mail in error please notify the sender immediately by e-mail and delete this e-mail from your system. If you are not the named 
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addressee you should not disseminate, disclose its contents, distribute or copy this e-mail. Additionally, if you are not the intended recipient you are fully 
warned that disclosing, copying, distributing or taking any action in reliance on the contents of this information is strictly prohibited. 

  

From: Laura Culleton <LauraC@chaitons.com> 
Sent: March 20, 2025 4:05 PM 
To: Saad Suleman <ssuleman@sulemanlaw.com>; Amarnath Misir <avmlawoffice@yahoo.ca> 
Subject: Bank of Montreal v. 11977636 Canada Inc.; Court File No. CV-24-00088321-0000 

  

Good afternoon counsel, 

  

I understand the Receiver has reached out to Mr. Chaudhary to request certain information, including the books and 
records of 11977636 Canada Inc. (the “Debtor”), but has not received a response. 

  

The Order of Justice Valente dated February 11, 2025 requires all persons to give the Receiver access to information, 
books and records of any kind related to the business or assets of the Debtor. 

  

On that basis, I kindly request that you deliver your client’s responses to the Receiver’s information and document 
requests as follows: 

  

 Please provide all current insurance policies. 
 Please provide all accounts payable listings with contact information. 
 Please provide all accounts receivable listings with contact information. 
 Please provide the most recent rent rolls with tenant contact information. 
 Please provide copies of any/all signed leases. 
 Please provide copies of all utilities and maintenance contracts (i.e. garbage, snow removal etc.). 
 Please provide bank statements for the years 2023 and 2024. 
 Please provide copies of the 2023 and 2024 financial statements for 11977636 Canada Inc. 
 Please provide all property tax statements. 
 Please provide all property surveys, floor plans, etc. 
 Please provide the most recent environmental assessment or study on the properties. 
 Please provide the contact information for the prospective purchaser for 652 Parkdale and their lawyer’s contact 

information. 

  

  

Best, 
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Laura Culleton  | Lawyer 
T: 416.218.1128 E: LauraC@chaitons.com 
5000 Yonge St, 10th Floor, Toronto, ON, M2N 7E9 
chaitons.com 

 
 
Note: This e-mail may be privileged and/or confidential, and the sender does not waive any related rights and obligations. Any 
distribution, use or copying of this e-mail or the information it contains by other than an intended recipient is unauthorized. If you 
received this e-mail in error, please advise me (by return e-mail or otherwise) immediately. 

Ce courrier électronique est confidentiel et protégé. L'expéditeur ne renonce pas aux droits et obligations qui s'y rapportent. Toute 
diffusion, utilisation ou copie de ce message ou des renseignements qu'il contient par une personne autre que le (les) destinataire(s) 
désigné(s) est interdite. Si vous recevez ce courrier électronique par erreur, veuillez m'en aviser immédiatement, par retour de courrier 
électronique ou par un autre moyen. 

 

Please consider the environment before printing this email 



THIS IS EXHIBIT “C” TO

THE AFFIDAVIT OF ANTOINETTE DEPINTO 

SWORN BEFORE ME THIS  3RD

DAY OF JUNE, 2025

____________ 

A Commissioner etc. 



AVM LAW OFFICE 
AMARNATH V. MISIR 

BARRISTER & SOLICITOR, NOTARY PUBLIC 

33 Elm Drive West, Suite 2510, Mississauga, Ontario L5B 4M2 

Tel: (416) 837-3770    Fax: (905) 291-7237    Email:  avmlawoffice@yahoo.ca 

April 1st, 2025 

VIA EMILE: laurac@chaitons.com 

Chaitons LLP 

500 Younge Street 

10th Floor 

Toronto, ON M2N 7E9 

Attention: Ms. Laura Culleton. 

Dear Ms. Culleton, 

Re: 11977636 Canada Inc. ats Bank of Montreal 

 CV-24-00088321-000 

 Response to Receiver’s Documents Demand List 

Further to your email request of March 21, 2025, please be advised that our client will provide 

same at the earliest. They are working to obtain the majority of documents requested. 

Please find attached hereto the following as it relates to 652 Parkdale Ave. Hamilton: 

1- APS Exhibit “A” to Respondent’s Affidavit; 

2- Waiver of condition on financing (Exhibit “B”); 

3- Amendments to APS re extension of closing date; 

4- Amendments to APS re extension of closing date; 

5- Copy of tax statement. The arrears and interim instalments shown on the statement remain 

unpaid; and 

6- Purchaser’s lawyer information. 

I will do my best to provide the remaining documents requested by April 11, 2025. 

On another note, would you be able to provide me with an updated statement of what is owing to 

the Bank of Montreal including additional legal and other expenses. 

My client is interested in discharging the debt owing to the Bank of Montreal. They have an 

agreement for the purchase of 652 Parkdale Ave property. which is and has always been a bona 

fide transaction. My client is willing to complete the sale of this property and use the funds to pay 

off the debt in full. my client has commitment to fund the Watford property and will be in a position 

to discharge the loan.  



my client is aware of the structures in the order appointing the receiver and intend to abide and 

respect them. However, the goal in the present situation is to pay the bank its due debt and clear 

the additional expenses. This can be done with the cooperation yourselves and your client within 

this month.  

Please advise if we can count on your cooperation in the circumstances.  

look forward to your prompt reply hereto. 

  

Yours very truly 

 

AVM Law Office 

 

Amarnath V. Misir 
 

Amarnath V. Misir 

Barrister & Solicitor 

AVM: a.m 













































BANK OF MONTREAL and                11977636 CANADA INC. 
Applicant  Respondent 
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ONTARIO 
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PROCEEDING COMMENCED AT 
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AFFIDAVIT OF ANTOINETTE DEPINTO 
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